STATE OF OKLAHOMA
l1st Session of the 48th Legislature (2001)
COMMITTEE SUBSTITUTE

FOR
HOUSE BILL NO. 1050 By: Fields

COMMITTEE SUBSTITUTE

An Act relating to professions and occupations;
providing short title; creating the Construction
Industries Commission; stating regulatory authority
over certain trades; providing for membership,
appointments, qualifications, terms of office,
vacancies and removal from office; providing for
meetings, quorum, officers and duties; requiring
compliance with certain acts; requiring members and
certain employees be bonded; clarifying liability of
members and providing for certain expenses; stating
powers and duties; providing for promulgation of
rules and making certain former rules, orders and
actions valid until certain action by Commission;
stating additional powers and authority; providing
for transfer of certain powers, duties,
responsibilities, employees, records, fund balances,
encumbrances and obligations; providing for Interim
Executive Director; amending 59 0.S. 1991, Sections
1001, 1002, as amended by Section 1, Chapter 236,
0.S.L. 1993, Section 1, Chapter 293, 0.S.L. 1994,
1003, as last amended by Section 1, Chapter 405,
0.S.L. 1999, 1004, as amended by Section 1, Chapter
63, 0.S.L. 1996, 1006, Section 2, Chapter 405, 0.S.L.
1999, 1007, 1008, as amended by Section 3, Chapter
405, O0.S.L. 1999, 1010, as last amended by Section 1,
Chapter 353, 0.S.L. 1997, Section 3, Chapter 236,
0.S.L. 1993, 1011, 1013, as amended by Section 4,
Chapter 405, 0.S.L. 1999, 1014, 1018, as amended by
Section 2, Chapter 236, 0.S.L. 1993, 1020, Section 3,
Chapter 293, 0.S.L. 1994, 1031, 1032, 1033, 1034,
1035, 1036, as amended by Section 2, Chapter 9,
O0.S.L. 1995, 1037, 1039, 1041, 1042, 1044, 1680,
1681, as last amended by Section 1, Chapter 155,
O0.S.L. 1994, Section 4, Chapter 293, 0.S5.L. 1994,
1682, as last amended by Section 5, Chapter 405,
0.S.L. 1999, 1683, as last amended by Section 3,
Chapter 318, 0.S.L. 1996, 1685, Section 6, Chapter
405, O0.S.L. 1999, 1686, 1688, as last amended by
Section 8, Chapter 405, O0.S.L. 1999, 1689, as last
amended by Section 4, Chapter 353, 0.S.L. 1997, 1691,
1694, as last amended by Section 7, Chapter 155,
0.S.L. 1994, 1696, as amended by Section 9, Chapter
155, 0.S.L. 1994, Section 7, Chapter 293, 0.S.L.
1994, 1850.1, 1850.2, as last amended by Section 10,
Chapter 405, 0.S.L. 1999, 1850.3, Section 9, Chapter
293, O0.S.L. 1994, 1850.4 and 1850.5, as last amended
by Sections 10 and 11, Chapter 293, 0.S.L. 1994,
1850.7, 1850.8, as last amended by Section 11,



Chapter 405, 0.S.L. 1999, Section 12, Chapter 405,
0.S.L. 1999, 1850.9, as amended by Section 13,
Chapter 405, 0.S.L. 1999, 1850.13, as amended by
Section 9, Chapter 236, 0.S.L. 1993, 1850.14, as
amended by Section 3, Chapter 251, 0.S.L. 1993,
Section 13, Chapter 293, 0.S.L. 1994 and Section 14,
Chapter 405, 0.S.L. 1999 (59 0.S5. Supp. 2000,
Sections 1002, 1002.1, 1003, 1004, 1006.1, 1008,
1010, 1010.1, 1013, 1018, 1021.1, 1036, 1681, 1681.1,
1682, 1683, 1685.1, 1688, 1689, 1694, 1696, 1697,
1850.2, 1850.3a, 1850.4, 1850.5, 1850.8, 1850.8A,
1850.9, 1850.13, 1850.14, 1850.16 and 1860), which
relate to licensure and regulation of plumbing,
electrical, and mechanical trades and building and
construction inspectors; modifying language to
conform with transfer of regulatory authority over
such trades from the State Board of Health to
Construction Industries Commission; deleting obsolete
language; clarifying language and certain references;
modifying appointing authority and providing for
continuation of service of certain committee members;
modifying gender references; making certain
provisions consistent with Administrative Procedures
Act; providing for codification; providing for
noncodification; providing effective dates; and
declaring an emergency.

BE IT ENACTED BY THE PEOPLE OF THE STATE OF OKLAHOMA:

SECTION 1. NEW LAW A new section of law to be codified
in the Oklahoma Statutes as Section 1000.1 of Title 59, unless there
is created a duplication in numbering, reads as follows:

Sections 1 through 4 of this act shall be known and may be cited
as the "Construction Industries Commission Act".

SECTION 2. NEW LAW A new section of law to be codified
in the Oklahoma Statutes as Section 1000.2 of Title 59, unless there
is created a duplication in numbering, reads as follows:

A. The Construction Industries Commission is hereby created to
continue until July 1, 2007, in accordance with the provisions of
the Oklahoma Sunset Law. Beginning January 1, 2002, the Commission
shall regulate the plumbing, electrical, mechanical, and fire
sprinkler industries and building and construction inspectors
through the powers and duties set forth in the Construction
Industries Commission Act and in the respective licensing acts for

such trades.

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 2



B. 1. The Commission shall be composed of twelve (12) members
appointed by the Governor with the advice and consent of the Senate,
as follows:

a. two members shall have at least ten (10) years'
experience in the plumbing trade, of which one shall
be a plumbing contractor and one shall be a journeyman
plumber,

b. two members shall have at least ten (10) years'
experience in the electrical trade, of which one shall
be an electrical contractor and one shall be a
journeyman electrician,

c. two members shall have at least ten (10) years'
experience in the mechanical trade, of which one shall
be a mechanical contractor and one shall be a
mechanical journeyman,

d. one member shall have at least ten (10) years'
experience as a building and construction inspector,

e. two members shall have at least ten (10) years'
experience in the fire sprinkler trade, of which one
shall be a fire sprinkler contractor and one shall be
a journeyman sprinkler fitter,

f. one member shall represent the public and shall not
practice, have practiced, or be licensed to practice
any of the trades regulated by the Commission nor be
employed by or be related by blood or marriage within
the third degree to any person who practices, has
practiced, or is licensed to practice any such trades,

g. one member shall be designated by the Board of
Governors of the Licensed Architects and Landscape

Architects of Oklahoma, and

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 3



h. one member shall be designated by the State Board of
Registration for Professional Engineers and Land
Surveyors.

2. Except for members appointed pursuant to subparagraphs g and
h of paragraph 1 of this subsection, members shall be appointed for
terms of four (4) years; provided, of those members initially
appointed to the Commission, five members shall be appointed for
two-year terms, beginning September 1, 2001, and five members shall
be appointed for four-year terms, beginning September 1, 2001, as
designated by the Governor. Members shall continue in office until
a successor is appointed by the Governor. The Governor shall fill
all vacancies and unexpired terms in the same manner as the original
appointment of the member whose position is to be filled. Members
may be removed by the Governor for cause.

SECTION 3. NEW LAW A new section of law to be codified
in the Oklahoma Statutes as Section 1000.3 of Title 59, unless there
is created a duplication in numbering, reads as follows:

A. 1. The Construction Industries Commission shall organize
immediately after September 1, 2001, and annually thereafter, by
electing from among its members a president, a vice president, and a
secretary-treasurer. The Commission shall hold regularly scheduled
meetings at least once each quarter at a time and place determined
by the Commission and may hold such special meetings, emergency
meetings, or continued or reconvened meetings as found by the
Commission to be necessary. A majority of the members of the
Commission shall constitute a quorum for the transaction of
business.

2. The president shall preside at meetings of the Commission,
set the agenda, sign orders and other required documents, coordinate
Commission activities, and perform such other duties as may be

prescribed by the Commission.

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 4



3. The vice president shall perform the duties of the president
during the absence or disability of the president and shall perform
such other duties as may be prescribed by the Commission.

4. The secretary-treasurer or the executive director at the
discretion of the Commission shall:

a. keep a record of all proceedings of the Commission and
certify to actions of the Commission,

b. receive and deposit all monies received by the
Commission in the appropriate revolving funds,

c. submit, at the first regular meeting of the Commission
after the end of each fiscal year, a full itemized
report of the receipts and disbursements for the prior
fiscal year, showing the amount of funds on hand, and

d. perform such other duties as are prescribed in the
Construction Industries Commission Act or as may be
prescribed by the Commission.

B. The Commission shall act in accordance with the provisions
of the Oklahoma Open Meeting Act, the Oklahoma Open Records Act, and
the Administrative Procedures Act.

C. All members of the Commission and such employees as
determined by the Commission shall be bonded as required by Sections
85.26 through 85.31 of Title 74 of the Oklahoma Statutes.

D. The liability of any member or employee of the Commission
acting within the scope of Commission duties or employment shall be
governed by the Governmental Tort Claims Act.

E. Members of the Commission shall serve without compensation
but shall be reimbursed for all actual and necessary expenses
incurred in the performance of their duties in accordance with the
State Travel Reimbursement Act.

SECTION 4. NEW LAW A new section of law to be codified
in the Oklahoma Statutes as Section 1000.4 of Title 59, unless there

is created a duplication in numbering, reads as follows:

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 5



A. 1. Beginning September 1, 2001, pursuant to and in
compliance with Article I of the Administrative Procedures Act, the
Construction Industries Commission shall have the power to adopt,
amend, repeal, and promulgate rules as may be necessary to regulate
the plumbing, electrical, mechanical, and fire sprinkler industries
and building and construction inspectors. Such rules shall not
become effective prior to January 1, 2002.

2. Beginning January 1, 2002, the Commission shall have the
power to enforce the provisions of the Construction Industries
Commission Act, The Plumbing License Law of 1955, the Oklahoma
Inspectors Act, the Electrical License Act, and the Mechanical
Licensing Act.

3. In addition to rules promulgated by the Construction
Industries Commission, rules promulgated by the State Board of
Health prior to January 1, 2002, shall be the rules of the
Commission and shall continue in effect until such rules are amended
or repealed by rules promulgated by the Commission.

4. Any order made or action taken prior to January 1, 2002, by
the State Board of Health, the State Department of Health, or the
State Commissioner of Health pursuant to the provisions of, or rules
promulgated pursuant to, The Plumbing License Law of 1955, the
Oklahoma Inspectors Act, the Electrical License Act, or the
Mechanical Licensing Act shall be valid and in effect unless
rescinded by the Commission.

B. The Commission may:

1. Exercise all incidental powers and duties which are
necessary to effectuate the provisions of The Plumbing License Law
of 1955, the Oklahoma Inspectors Act, the Electrical License Act,
and the Mechanical Licensing Act;

2. Serve as a code variance and appeals board for the trades it
regulates which do not have statutory code variance and appeals

boards;

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 6



3. Order or subpoena the attendance of witnesses, the
inspection of records and premises, and the production of relevant
books and papers for the investigation of matters that may come
before the Commission;

4. Lease office space from the State Department of Health for
the purpose of operating and maintaining a state office and lease or
purchase office furniture, equipment, and supplies;

5. Employ an executive director and such other personnel as may
be necessary, subject to statutory full-time-equivalent (FTE)
limits, and set and pay their salaries or wages;

6. Employ legal counsel, as needed, to represent the Commission
in all legal matters;

7. Employ one or more investigators, as needed and subject to
statutory FTE limits, for the purpose of investigating written
complaints which may come before the Commission; and

8. Make such other expenditures as may be necessary in the
performance of its duties.

C. Effective January 1, 2002, all powers, duties,
responsibilities, employees, records, fund balances, encumbrances,
and obligations of the State Board of Health, the State Department
of Health, and the State Commissioner of Health relating to the
regulation of the plumbing, electrical, mechanical, and fire
sprinkler industries and building and construction inspectors are
transferred to the Construction Industries Commission.

SECTION 5. NEW LAW A new section of law not to be
codified in the Oklahoma Statutes reads as follows:

Not later than July 1, 2001, the Governor shall appoint an
interim executive director to serve the Construction Industries
Commission until the Commission employs an executive director. For
the months of July and August 2001, the interim executive director
shall be paid from funds available to the State Department of

Health. Effective September 1, 2001, the interim executive

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 7



director, and thereafter the executive director, shall be paid from
funds available to the Commission.

SECTION 6. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1001, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1001. Fhis—aet Sections 1001 through 1023.1 of this

title shall be known and may be cited as "The Plumbing License Law
of 1955”.&

SECTION 7. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1002, as
amended by Section 1, Chapter 236, 0.S.L. 1993 (59 0.S. Supp. 2000,

Section 1002), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1002. A. The StateBeoardefHealth;3in pursuance—of

qr

B

ral etz ISEEE
T POWCTT O oo T

He-

[0)]
«Q

A=

H

B
[OF
|__‘

Hh

£ + =
E

2
T

d
H

o

)

Adat+r1 e 1A oo
ot Hs—aae*

hey—+Hiwve+~ Construction Industries Commission

H

T

is hereby authorized, empowered, and directed+—through—th

Comm- oo o nor £
TS50 HcE +

Healths to make, prescribe, enforce, amend, and
repeal rules amd—regutations governing the following:

1. The examination and licensing of persons desiring or
intending to engage in the business, trade or calling of master
prumber—plumbing contractor} or journeyman plumber+—the;

2. The registering of and issuing of certificates to persons
desiring or intending to work or act as a plumber's apprentice—the;

3. The establishment and levying of administrative fines+—%the;

4. The initiation of disciplinary proceedings+—he;

5. The requesting of prosecution of and initiation of
injunctive proceedings against any person who violates any of the

provisions of £his—aet The Plumbing License Law of 1955 or any rule

promulgated pursuant to £his—aet—anrd—teo—estabtish The Plumbing

License Law of 1955; and

6. The establishment of bonding requirements for the issuance

of a license as a plumbing contractors; provided, such rules and

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 8



as shall not be inconsistent with the terms and conditions

hereinafter provided.

B. Such bonding requirements shall allow the filing of cash or
a certificate of deposit in lieu of a bond. A state bond or cash or
certificate of deposit filed in lieu of a bond and which is posted
pursuant to the provisions of this section shall be deemed
sufficient to meet the requirements of any municipality, provided
that a copy of said bond or documentation of cash or certificate of
deposit filed in lieu of a bond shall be filed with any municipality
in which the licensee does work as a plumbing contractor. A copy of
the bond or documentation of cash or certificate of deposit filed in

lieu of a bond shall be filed with the municipality prior to the

un

o+ i) +d £
SoaS = ¥er +

commencement of any such work by the licensee. Tk

=
o™

+ Coranrnd Moot~y Dliaminto o~ T oaon
T oottt oo L T oittio it g— 1T T

¢
|__l
|__I
¢
ol
|__I.
i
th
H

1
Hea—

SECTION 8. AMENDATORY Section 1, Chapter 293, 0.S.L.
1994 (59 0.S. Supp. 2000, Section 1002.1), is amended to read as
follows:

Section 1002.1 The State—Commissioner—of—Health Construction

Industries Commission shall establish by rule a process for the

formal review of the plans and specifications for a project prior to
bid dates for the project to ensure that the project plans and
specifications are in conformance with applicable plumbing,
electrical, mechanical, and fire sprinkler installation codes. The
rule shall provide that the review shall be completed in a timely
manner, not to exceed fourteen (14) calendar days from the date of
the submission of a completed application for review which is
accompanied by the review fee not to exceed Two Hundred Dollars
($200.00) to be established by the rule. Upon completion of the
review, the plans and specifications shall be returned to the

applicant with documentation indicating either approval of plans and

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 9



specifications which are in compliance with the applicable codes, or
modifications which must be made to bring the plans and

specifications into conformance. Submission of such plans and

specifications for review by the Pepartment Commission shall be

voluntary.

SECTION 9. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1003, as
last amended by Section 1, Chapter 405, 0.S.L. 1999 (59 0.S. Supp.
2000, Section 1003), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1003. As used in The Plumbing License Law of 1955:

1. n I "Commission" means the StatePRoard—eofHeatth

Construction Industries Commission;

2 WO~ 2 oo o ner maanr o+ + Comma oo g Nnor £ Ia1+1h .
. Ot o TOoOTTrTT [13ae e » iy yw) 1= T Ot oo T oI — O I T

Tt

T

3— "Committee" means the State Committee of Plumbing Examiners

appointed by the State Beardef Healtth Construction Industries

Commission;

4= 3. "Plumbing Hearing Board" means the State Plumbing Hearing

Board which shall consist of +he—State—Commissiorner—ofHealth a

designee of the Construction Industries Commission, as chair, and

the members of the State Committee of Plumbing Examiners;

5= 4. "Apprentice" or "plumber's apprentice" means any person

sixteen (16) years of age or older who, as kis—er—her the principal

occupation of the person, is engaged in learning and assisting in

the installation of plumbing under the direct supervision of a
licensed journeyman plumber or plumbing contractor;

6= 5. "Journeyman plumber" means any person other than a master
plumber or plumbing contractor who engages in or works at the actual
installation, alteration, repair and/or renovation of plumbing;

+= 6. "Temporary journeyman plumber" means any person other
than a person permanently licensed as a journeyman plumber, master
plumber, or plumbing contractor in this state who meets the
temporary licensure requirements of Section 2 1006.1 of this =et

title;

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 10



8+ 7. "Master plumber" is a term used and defined under laws
which have been repealed. A person formerly known as a master
plumber is henceforth to be known as a "plumbing contractor" as

hexredn defined in this section;

S+ 8. "Plumbing contractor" means—anad—is—herebydefined—to—be;
any person who is skilled in the planning, superintending, and

practical installation of plumbing and who is familiar with the

laws+ and rules+—and—regutatiens governing the same. This
definition may be construed to mean any person who has qualified and

is licensed under #£his—aet The Plumbing License Law of 1955 as a

plumbing contractor, who may operate as an individual, a firm,

partnership, limited liability company, or corporation, or other

legal entity to engage in the business of plumbing, or the business
of contracting to do plumbing, or furnish labor or materials or both
for the installation, repair, maintenance, or renovation of plumbing

according to the requirements of #£his—aet The Plumbing License Law

of 1955;
1+0= 9. "Plumbing" means, and includes:

a. all piping, fixtures, appurtenances and appliances
for, and in connection with, a supply of water within
or adjacent to any building, structure, or conveyance,
on the premises and to the connection with a water
main or other source of supply,

b. all piping, fixtures, appurtenances and appliances for
sanitary drainage or storm drainage facilities,
including venting systems for such facilities, within
or adjacent to any building, structure, or conveyance,
on the premises and to the connection with a public
disposal system or other acceptable terminal, and

C. the installation, repair, maintenance and renovation
of all piping, fixtures, appurtenances and appliances

for a supply of water, or for the disposal of waste

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 11



water, liquid waste, or sewage within or adjacent to
any building, structure, or conveyance, on the
premises and to the source of supply of water or point
of disposal of wastes; and

+1-= 10. "Variance and Appeals Board" means the Oklahoma State
Plumbing Installation Code Variance and Appeals Board.

SECTION 10. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1004, as
amended by Section 1, Chapter 63, 0.S.L. 1996 (59 0.S. Supp. 2000,
Section 1004), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1004. A. The Oklahoma State Committee of Plumbing
Examiners is hereby re-created to continue until July 1, 2002, in
accordance with the provisions of the Oklahoma Sunset Law, as
provided by Sections 3901 et seqg. of Title 74 of the Oklahoma
Statutes, and shall consist of six (6) members, each of whom shall
be a citizen of the United States, a resident of this state, and
reside in a different Congressional District of this state. Members

Beginning January 1, 2002, as the terms of members serving on the

Committee on such date expire, members of the Committee shall be

appointed by the StateBeard—efHeatth Construction Industries

Commission which may also remove them for cause. They will hold

office for terms of two (2) years, or until their successors are
appointed. Two members of the Committee shall have had at least
five (5) years' practical experience as a licensed master plumber
ardfer or plumbing contractor, and two members shall have had at
least five (5) years' practical experience as a licensed journeyman
plumber. One member shall be a plumbing inspector selected from
lists of names submitted from plumbing inspection industries and one
member shall be a lay person. Whenever appointments of initial,

new, or replacement plumbing members of the Committee are to be

ar

made, the State BeardefHeatth Commission shall choose them only

from lists of at least three names to be furnished whenever needed

as follows:

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 12



1. Master plumber anrndter or plumbing contractor member - lists
to be furnished by associated plumbing and heating contractors of
this state;

2. Journeyman plumber member - lists to be furnished by state
pipe trades associations;

3. One licensed master plumber andfexr or plumbing contractor
who is not a member of an association of plumbing, heating, and
cooling contractors of this state; and

4. One licensed journeyman plumber who is not a member of a
state pipe trades association.

B. Duties of the Committee shall be to serve the Commissioner

Commission in an advisory capacity, to formulate rules pursuant to

£he The Plumbing tieemsing License Law of 1955, and to assist and

advise the bepartment Commission on the examination of applicants

for licenses as journeyman plumber amrdtexr or plumbing contractor, in
accordance with such rules and the terms and conditions hereof. A
majority of the Committee shall constitute a quorum for the

transaction of business.

C. Each examiner shall be reimbursed his—exr—her for travel
expenses in accordance with the provisions of the State Travel
Reimbursement Act, Section 500.1 et seqg. of Title 74 of the Oklahoma
Statutes.

SECTION 11. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1006, is

amended to read as follows:

Section 1006. Ae)—Fhe—Ceommissioner A. The Construction

Industries Commission shall issue licenses to swek persons who have

been certified by the Coemmittee Commission as having successfully

passed said the examination for journeyman plumber or plumbing
contractor, as the case may be, and who have paid the fees and have
otherwise complied with the applicable requirements of #£his—aet The

Plumbing License Law of 1955.

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 13



nit
T

BNV BN 22

e lioat ton

.
-

N e A
I5d

115
“

ah o1 1

Comma oo g

Th
T

(1)

o oo C TOTT oIt [Tt yItt

T

TT

(o e g mpm ny

-

TT

13" 39 3= myrw e g =y

TT

ot dsr Ao+
AT

£
-

A froy ]

Adosza fram oA

(OO0

\

+ 5z

n

N

T IrocTy

ERCIE I SN IR SR

o
=}

£

A

A= 20 AR =i = S f 11 S o A v e g e e S (o w3 - g

T

WL CIt It

ama o+ o
(333 =y 3 g & g e m

1t
=3

no w1+
Wttt

131

el akk]
T oo o

o f +
Sr=

r
T

+ + 1

et

Qo

+h1ao

T

TT

[

TTho

= = oy

T

C—IT T CIT

E A

CITT—o

Stk hold on
Tt

Tr

Ao+ £ +pa o
£

e

PR

£

+h

wh

n

ro

TTT

OTT

EEAw s e = g

CIT o

\%

T

-

I,

WTIT

roaoratrod + A1
TPoT

o

a s

1 oo

I
©

r ek~ oo
WEHECTT

Pt i S W
oo

T

TTTE

o o T Cy

T Toooco oY

TIThS

T

nt o

rooylla o

-

watEh 1

a

comel 3
CompPT—=

A A o hasz +hoarizd o
Ottt

I

ot o+
[y e o e

+ho o

o

TITCT e S = S 3 ¥ ey

WL CTTIT

A=

WO

TICE

WITTO

4

TITITO

ot oo+
SoTS T T

nraoar
(= 2

Wl

a

Ny A~

mizat
TS

13 0o

T

Q- A

Sot
L3

+h1ao

o T tTTTT o

I

TTho

1= [CAC = - ==

CITT—o

o g

~

a1 A+
o OCTT

ER P, [ P -

ot o+
Stat

-
T

bitalint e

T—Cy

-

T T

= o ===

O

p s

T Ity

Afror ] ol PP
I

Adosza Fraom oA

sz (Oﬁ\

n

N

ITrIrocTy

n

it 1

T ottt/ O

|\ e

L ¥ A W S o s ey w) o iy

Ty o L LTt

T

WL CIrr It

Sma o+ o
THIttCricr o ¢

11t
=3

no w1+
Wttt

13~

e Nkl
oo o

roaaf+
EpS RS o

+ 4+ 4

Qo i+

T

+h1ao

TT

TTho

T =

’

T

C—IT T CIT

A

CITT—o

o and (’7 IATANARY

o T T

+h
TIT

+hoarn +2

o
=}

—~
=}

LR Wl

oo +

IAA A

a4

T

|y e s

o+ £ +h 1o et anA

ffant+ <7

+

— O

T

1=

CITT—o

e

oo

IEXEWSIE AN

n +arad

oo o o

n +h
TIT—CTIT

noacad
Az TAC RS AT AT

v

v 1

¥y

_y\.,a.r

SZ

T oo Ircoo OT

|y a W

o T C T Oty

cO7

TITICT

P TOoOT

1t At o
ESASAC A = mE e S 1A F e ere e e =

o

T C .

CTITTOo

It shall

All licenses shall be nontransferable and—+.

4 B.

be unlawful for any holder of a license under +his—aet The Plumbing

License Law of 1955 to loan or allow the use of such license by any

except as specifically provided

firm or corporation,

other person,

in #his—aet The Plumbing License Law of 1955.

Chapter 405, 0.S.L.

Section 2,

AMENDATORY

SECTION 12.

is amended to read as

Section 1006.1),

2000,

Supp .

(59 0.5.

1999

follows

year of the date the Governor

(1)

Within one

A.

Section 1006.1

of this state declares a state of emergency in response to a

the State

disaster involving the destruction of dwelling units,

Construction Industries Commission shall

~1+h
o

TT

£ 11
E=

Comma oo o
T oo

Page 14

No. 6344

Req.



issue a distinctively colored, nonrenewable, temporary Jjourneyman
plumber license which shall expire one (1) year after the date of
the declaration to any person who is currently licensed as a
journeyman plumber by another state and who:

1. Submits, within ten (10) days of beginning journeyman
plumber's work in this state, an application and fee for a

journeyman plumber's examination;

2. Takes and passes the examination at the first opportunity
thereafter offered by the ECemmissiener Commission; and
3. Pays a temporary journeyman plumber's license fee of Twenty-

five Dollars ($25.00).

B. ©Nothing in this section shall be construed as prohibiting
any person from qualifying at any time for any other license by
meeting the requirements for the other license.

SECTION 13. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1007, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1007. Application for examination, license amdfer or

renewal of license shall be made to the GSemmissiener Construction

Industries Commission in writing and, if required, on forms

furnished by the cemmissienrer Commission and shall be accompanied by

the proper fee.

SECTION 14. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1008, as
amended by Section 3, Chapter 405, 0.S.L. 1999 (59 0.S. Supp. 2000,
Section 1008), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1008. The following shall be the fees charged under The

Plumbing License Law of 1955 by the State Commissioner of Health

Construction Industries Commission:

Initial fees
Plumbing Contractor's
Examination .......cueiiiiinnenneenn. $50.00
Journeyman Plumber's

EXamMinatdion v v v v oo eeeeeeeeeeeenenenns 25.00

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 15



Plumbing Contractor's
I Y o =1 50.00
Journeyman Plumber's
S I @ o =1 15.00
Apprentice Registration
Fee i e e e e 15.00
Renewal of Licenses (if made within
thirty (30) days after expiration)
Plumbing Contractor's
I o =1 50.00
Journeyman Plumber's

I I 7= o T 15.00

Fee i e e 15.00
Penalty for Delayed Renewal
Plumbing Contractor's
S I L o =1 10.00
Journeyman Plumber's
I L o 5.00
SECTION 15. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1010, as
last amended by Section 1, Chapter 353, 0.S.L. 1997 (59 0.S. Supp.
2000, Section 1010), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1010. A. The State Commissioner—of Heatth designee of

the Construction Industries Commission, as chair, and the members of

the Oklahoma State Committee of Plumbing Examiners shall constitute
a Plumbing Hearing Board, which may on its own motion make

investigations and conduct hearings awd. The Board may, on its own

motion or upon complaint in writing duly signed and verified by the

complainant, and upon not less than ten (10) days' notice to the

th

licensee, suspend any license issued under Seetion—3061——etseo-

£+e The Plumbing License Law of 1955, and may revoke such

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 16



license in the manner hereinafter provided, if by clear and
convincing evidence it finds that the holder of the license has:
1. Made a material misstatement in the application for license

or renewal thereof;

2. Loaned or illegally used kis—er—he¥r the license;
3. Demonstrated incompetency to act as a journeyman plumber or

plumbing contractor, as the case may be;

4. Violated any provision of Seetion 3001l et seg—of this+titt

The Plumbing License Law of 1955, or any rule or order prescribed by

the Beaxrd Construction Industries Commission, or any ordinance or

regulation for the installation of plumbing made or enacted by a

city, town, or sewer commission by authority of Seetieon 306+ —et——seo

£+e The Plumbing License Law of 1955; or

5. Willfully and unreasonably failed to perform his—er—her the

normal business obligations of the holder of the license without

justifiable cause.
B. A copy of the complaint with notice of the suspension of

license, if ordered by the Plumbing Hearing Board, shall be served

on the person complained against, and kis—exr—her the answer thereto
shall be filed in the time allowed for the filing of answers in
legal proceedings by the statutes of this state.

C. No order revoking a license shall be made until after a

public hearing set, held in accordance with the provisions of

Article II of the Administrative Procedures Act, by the Plumbing

Hearing Board which shall not be less than thirty (30) days and not
more than sixty (60) days after the date of notice of suspension.
The hearing shall be held at the place designated by the Plumbing
Hearing Board. The person complained against shall have the right
to be represented by counsel and to introduce any evidence in
defense. The conduct of the hearing shall be in accordance with

recognized rules of legal procedure and any member of the Plumbing

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 17



Hearing Board or a representative designated by the Plumbing Hearing
Board shall have authority to administer ocaths and take testimony.

D. Any person whose license has been revoked may, after the
expiration of one (1) year from the date of such revocation, but not
before, apply for a new license.

E. Notwithstanding any other provision of law, a political
subdivision of this state that has adopted a nationally recognized
plumbing code and appointed an inspector pursuant to Section 1016 e

Cact 1~ 11027
o (= TooT

T

qr

seg+— of this title or pursuant to the Oklahoma

Inspectors Act for such work shall have jurisdiction over the

interpretation of the code and the installation of all plumbing work
done in that political subdivision, subject to the provisions of the

Oklahoma Inspectors Act+—Seetion 1031 et seg—of this+i+l

[

Provided, a state inspector may work directly with a plumbing
contractor or journeyman plumber in such a locality if a violation
of the code creates an immediate threat to life or health.

F. 1In the case of a complaint about, investigation of, or
inspection of any license, registration, permit or plumbing in any
political subdivision of this state which has not adopted a

nationally recognized plumbing code and appointed an inspector

ar

pursuant to Section 1016 er—Seetion—303+ seg- of this title or

pursuant to the Oklahoma Inspectors Act for such work, the State

commisstoner—ofHealth Construction Industries Commission shall have

jurisdiction over such matters.
G. 1. No individual, business, company, corporation, limited

liability company, association or other entity subject to the

provisions of Section 1001 et seqg. of this title shall install,
modify or alter plumbing in any incorporated area of this state

which has not adopted a nationally recognized plumbing code and

qr

appointed an inspector pursuant to Section 1016 er—Seetion—3+063%

H

seg+ of this title or pursuant to the Oklahoma Inspectors Act for

such work without providing notice of such plumbing to the State

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 18



Comm- oo o nar £
it oo TOTICT E=

Heal+h Construction Industries Commission. A notice

form for reproduction by an individual or entity required to make

such notice shall be provided by the State Commissionerof Health

Commission upon request.

2. Notice to the State—Commissioner—ofHeatth Commission

pursuant to this subsection shall not be required for plumbing
maintenance or replacement of an existing plumbing device or
fixture, unless such device is gas fired, or of any petroleum
refinery or its research facilities.

3. Enforcement of this subsection is authorized pursuant to

Qo o ~n 10017 +
(AR o o T U U T (=

TT

of +h-
ST—=CTt

£+e The Plumbing License Law of 1955,

o OF
AT I

or under authority granted to the State Commissioner—eof Health

Commission.

SECTION 16. AMENDATORY Section 3, Chapter 236, 0.S.L.
1993 (59 0.S. Supp. 2000, Section 1010.1), is amended to read as
follows:

Section 1010.1 A. 1In addition to other penalties provided by
law, if after a hearing in accordance with the provisions of Section
1010 of this title, the Plumbing Hearing Board shall find any person

to be in violation of any of the provisions of £khis—aet The Plumbing

License Law of 1955, such person may be subject to an administrative

fine of not more than Five Hundred Dollars ($500.00) for each
violation. Each day a person is in violation of +his—aet The

Plumbing License Law of 1955 may constitute a separate violation.

The maximum fine will not exceed One Thousand Dollars ($1,000.00).
All administrative fines collected pursuant to the provisions of
this subsection shall be deposited in the fund established in
Section 1018 of this title. Administrative fines imposed pursuant
to this subsection shall be enforceable in the district courts of
this state.

B. The Plumbing Hearing Board may make application to the

appropriate court for an order enjoining the acts or practices

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 19



prohibited by #his—aet The Plumbing License Law of 1955, and upon a

showing by the Plumbing Hearing Board that the person has engaged in
any of the prohibited acts or practices, an injunction, restraining
order, or other order as may be appropriate shall be granted by the
court.

SECTION 17. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1011, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1011. An appeal from the decision of the Plumbing
Hearing Board upon the suspension or revocation of a license, or
upon any decision not specifically provided for in #£his—aet The

Plumbing License Law of 1955, may be taken to the district court ef

+ KR I B NP IS + D
= [ = T A A4 J__L_L_LLJ.\j W LT ey L

.
-

[6)]

T A= T TT

|_J
B
o}

vy

@®
s

m
|__|
B
b

vs}

,_
H
@D

accordance with the provisions of Article II of the Administrative

Procedures Act.

SECTION 18. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1013, as
amended by Section 4, Chapter 405, 0.S.L. 1999 (59 0.S. Supp. 2000,
Section 1013), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1013. The StateCommissioner—of Health Construction

Industries Commission shall, upon proper application and payment of

fee, register as a plumber's apprentice, and shall issue a

certificate of registration to, a—persemn—eor persons who furnish

proof satisfactory to the Cemmissieonrer Commission that ke—sher—o¥

they are sixteen (16) years of age or older and are enrolled in a
recognized school or training course for plumber apprentices, or
have arranged for employment as a plumber's apprentice with a
licensed plumbing contractor. The certificate of an apprentice
shall expire at the end of one (1) year from date of issuance, at

which time the Ceommissiener Commission may issue a renewal

certificate upon payment of the renewal fee.

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 20



SECTION 19. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1014, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1014. Every holder of a license as a journeyman plumber
or plumbing contractor, or of a certificate of registration as a
plumber's apprentice, shall promptly notify the Cemmissieoner

Construction Industries Commission of any change in k4s business

address.

SECTION 20. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1018, as
amended by Section 2, Chapter 236, 0.S.L. 1993 (59 0.S. Supp. 2000,
Section 1018), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1018. All fees, administrative fines, or payments of

any type eetdteeted received by the Cemmissiener Construction

Industries Commission under £his—aet The Plumbing License Law of

@
|__J
He

1955 shall be perd—directdy inteo—the State Treasury where they sh

[6)]

be—kept deposited in a separate revolving fund in—trust—and—Ffor—=u

enaty to be designated the "Plumbing Licensing Revolving Fund" and

are hereby appropriated and may be expended by the Cemmissieoner—to

m i
baas =

S0 n

R o o
TTIToTo

=
A>3

B

21 1 ad nea~~c oz + ERAWALE AN I AT 2 28 £ 1. I 2] L .
[ g g I C T TS STy cO— ot =TTt o Ly T it T C

N

133 TT

rtenrt—oandpurpeoses—oef—+this—aet Commission for the purpose of

implementing The Plumbing License Law of 1955 The fupds—are—+tob
P g g . RG-S E co—
sernanda A nlsz +hy~aac + Comm- o o o r o a4+ r I =zt o n arnA o o + =N
Pehaeo g g o g—t+t CHR TSSO CTF—S—a Bt oA ot—aRc—F co—o
mand Fa o~z nor ot 2oy nanano An A 2 N etz oy EEE NS Y NP L P T B A |
oS Co—To Py S Pttt HS e ses—ato—=+t oYy +HS I S S E S ACE==ziisaanc s Eas
doszr cna A~ aa A 4+ 1104 r EoE o I + R E22Y SN AW R I WA EE ok S 2L )
A=~ S—oC STttt et ——Ttt ST catc O+—tTt P TS o STt
PNV RS N B IR T WA PN PR SR IR e £ -+ Thaiao moasz 3 m-~71:04 S A~ + r
o= bho St eEisg 3t T S—Thc: THCT B GC—aohS (S
neandl i o+ b dat ma d +h v i+ Comma o oo noar!' o A1~ n
eX oottt esS—Tto—= (S AR = 13 = F AAC S S SRS A€ 2 F N 1 OSSO —S— oS ettty
Drana ot o e N A - I W] £ o]l o 0 Ao hitl 1l ot 0~ r + r
Prepotrat oot E IRt haS T—Fe gttt oSO et TSy F—OtcE
documenta and + Frarn g ol g f cornioca + + o noaaagaed 1 +h
€ e teS—ao—t 1t TR TSRS T—CoPFSS—F oS hoagco——=~+t

prombirg—industry—er—teo—the—pubtie fund shall be a continuing fund,

not subject to fiscal year limitations. Expenditures from the fund

shall be made upon warrants issued by the State Treasurer against

claims filed as prescribed by law with the Director of State Finance

for approval and payment.

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 21



SECTION 21. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1020, is

amended to read as follows:

Section 1020. Nothing in #£his—aet The Plumbing License Law of

1955 shall prohibit cities and towns from having full authority to
provide full supervision and inspection of plumbing by the enactment

of codesy and rules ard—regutatiens in such form as they may

determine and prescribe; provided, that no such ordinances, bylaw,

or rule exr—rxegulation shall be inconsistent with £his—aet The

Plumbing License Law of 1955, or any rule er—regutatien adopted or

prescribed by the State Beard—oefHeatth Construction Industries

Commission through authority of £his—aet The Plumbing License Law of

1955 and the provisions of the Construction Industries Commission

Act. FEach state-licensed master plumber, plumbing contractor and
journeyman plumber shall be required to register with the plumbing
inspector of every city and town in whose jurisdiction ke the
plumber operates, and each such city or town is hereby authorized to
register such master plumber, plumbing contractor and journeyman
plumber, to revoke the same, to charge fees for such registration,
for permits and for inspections of plumbing and fixtures. Provided,
further, that no master plumber, plumbing contractor or journeyman
plumber shall be permitted to do business or work in any city or

town wherein kis the local registration of the plumber has been

revoked.

SECTION 22. AMENDATORY Section 3, Chapter 293, 0.S.L.
1994 (59 0.S. Supp. 2000, Section 1021.1), is amended to read as
follows:

Section 1021.1 A. 1. There is hereby created the Oklahoma
State Plumbing Installation Code Variance and Appeals Board. The
Variance and Appeals Board shall hear testimony and shall review
sufficient technical data submitted by an applicant to substantiate
the proposed installation of any material, assembly or manufacturer-

engineered components, equipment or system that is not specifically

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 22



prescribed by an appropriate installation code, an industry
consensus standard or fabricated or installed according to
recognized and generally accepted good engineering practices, where
no ordinance or regulation of a governmental subdivision applies.

If it is determined that the evidence submitted is satisfactory
proof of performance for the proposed installation, the Variance and
Appeals Board shall approve such alternative, subject to the
requirements of the appropriate installation code. Applications for
the use of an alternative material or method of construction shall

be submitted in writing to the State Commissionerof Health

Construction Industries Commission for approval prior to use.

Applications shall be accompanied by a filing fee, not to exceed

Fifty Dollars ($50.00), as set by rule of the State Board of Health

Commission.
2. The Variance and Appeals Board shall also hear appeals from
contractors, licensed by the Secupatienal TicensingServie £—+h

Statebepartment—of Health Construction Industries Commission, and

any party who has an ownership interest in or is in responsible
charge of the design of or work on the installation, who contest the

Bepartment's Commission's interpretation of the state's model

plumbing installation code as applied to a particular installation.
Such appeals shall be based on a claim that:
a. the true intent of the installation code has been
incorrectly interpreted,
b. the provisions of the code do not fully apply, or
c. an equal or better form of installation is proposed.
Such appeals to the Variance and Appeals Board shall be made in

writing to the StateCommissieoner—eof Healtth Commission within

fourteen (14) days after a code interpretation or receipt of written
notice of the alleged code violation by the licensed contractor.

B. The Variance and Appeals Board shall consist of the State

Comm- oo o nAayr £ 1 +
oo TOTTICT SR A S & g g

h—or hiserher designated representative of

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 23



the Commission and the following members who, except for the State

Fire Marshal or designee, shall be appointed by the Cemmissieoner

Commission from a list of names submitted by the professional

organizations of the professions represented on the Board and who

shall serve at the pleasure of the Commissiener Commission:

1. Two members shall be appointed from the State Committee of
Plumbing Examiners; one shall be a contractor with five (5) years of
experience and one shall be a journeyman with five (5) years of
experience;

2. One member shall be a registered design professional who is
a registered architect with at least ten (10) years of experience,
five (5) of which shall have been in responsible charge of work;

3. One member shall be a registered design professional with at
least ten (10) years of structural engineering or architectural
experience, five (5) of which shall have been in responsible charge
of work;

4. One member shall be a registered design professional with
mechanical or plumbing engineering experience; provided, such member
shall have at least ten (10) years of experience, five (5) of which
shall have been in responsible charge of work;

5. One member shall be a registered design professional with
electrical engineering experience; provided, such member shall have
at least ten (10) years of experience, five (5) of which shall have
been in responsible charge of work; and

6. One member shall be the State Fire Marshal or a designee of
the State Fire Marshal.

Any member serving on the Board on January 1, 2002, may continue

to serve on the Board until a replacement is appointed by the

Commission.

C. Members, except the Commissieoner—and designated

representatives of the State Fire Marshal and the Commissiener'ls—and

Q4+ ~+ AN M. +od »
otoT ¥ T teG—%¥

at+ves Commission, and

.
-

PN
5

e B = W
oLtk

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 24



employees of the Bepartment Commission, shall be reimbursed for

travel expenses pursuant to the State Travel Reimbursement Act+

Coacot 1 ~n NN 7 + 3+ 1 74 £ + N Ol
[/ SR oy S my S 3 S L A S 1= T C T +—+t1t T

ISWava £ T
SCo— =

twtes+~ from the

revolving fund created pursuant to Section 1018 of Fitte 59 of £h

Soktahema—Statutes this title.

D. The Variance and Appeals Board shall meet after the

Commissiorner Commission receives proper application for a variance,

accompanied by the filing fee, or proper notice of an appeal, as
provided in subsection A of this section.
E. The State Commissionerof Healtt r— Coa Arert

3 oo o
OITtotT TT T Ottt o o L OTT =}

designated representatives of the Commission shall serve as chair of

the Variance and Appeals Board. A majority of the members of the
Variance and Appeals Board shall constitute a quorum for the
transaction of the business of the Board.

SECTION 23. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1031, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1031. HFhis—aet Sections 1031 through 1044 of this title

shall be known and may be cited as the "Oklahoma Inspectors Act".
SECTION 24. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1032, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1032. The State—Board—eofHeatth Construction Industries

Commission shall promulgate rules and—regutatiens governing the

examination and licensing of building, electrical, mechanical,
plumbing, and other construction inspectors and the establishment of

classifications for such inspectors. The StateBeoardeof Heatth

Commission may adopt as part of such rules ard—regulatiens any or

all nationally recognized inspector certification programs or codes
for purposes of building and construction inspector licensing. The
rules and—regulations adopted by the State Beoardeof Health

Commission shall provide requirements for continuing education for

building and construction inspectors.

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 25



SECTION 25. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1033, is
amended to read as follows:
Section 1033. As used in the Oklahoma Inspectors Act:

1. ! Commissienert "Commission" means the State—Commissioper—of

Heatth Construction Industries Commission;

2. "Committee" means the Oklahoma Inspector Examiners
Committee;

3. "Building and construction inspection" means the inspection
of plumbing, electrical, mechanical or structural aspects of
building and construction, for the purpose of enforcing compliance
with the applicable building codes or standards;

4. "Building and construction inspector" means any person
actively engaged in the inspection of any phase of building and
construction for the purpose of enforcing compliance with the
applicable building codes or standards and includes, but is not
limited to, plumbing inspectors, electrical inspectors, mechanical
inspectors and structural inspectors; and

5. "Circuit rider inspector" means a person who acts as a
building and construction inspector for two or more municipalities
or other political subdivisions and is certified and licensed
pursuant to the Oklahoma Inspectors Act.

SECTION 26. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1034, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1034. There is hereby created the Oklahoma Inspector
Examiners Committee which shall consist of seven (7) members. One

member shall be the State Commissieoner of Health o designee of the

Construction Industries Commission. &4 Beginning January 1, 2002,

as the terms of the six other members serving on the Committee on

such date expire, these members shall be appointed prier—+teo Dbecember

3++—3989+ by the State Board—ef Health—whe Commission which may also
remove any appointed member for cause. TFhree—-ofthe appointed

mam ro ok o117 Sz EN SN RN I S N | o £ + (D PN N B 2N ah =11
frembers—shott—Sserve e dri ot —Termor—twe—2—years—and—thy SHa—t

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 26



P SN S R S I SANsoy £ foni (AN oo m oanfE o+ PN
Sery Sh— A Erar—fterm—oft—Four—{4)r—vea¥rS— Trereatter;—Ene—appornteda

Appointed members shall hold office for terms of four (4) years or
until their successors are appointed.

Four appointed members shall be residents of this state and each
shall have had at least five (5) years of practical experience as a
building and construction inspector in hkis the respective field of

the inspector. Of these appointees, one member each shall be

appointed from the plumbing, electrical, mechanical and structural
professions. One appointed member shall be a municipal officer as
defined in Section 1-102 of Title 11 of the Oklahoma Statutes, and
one appointed member shall be a lay person.

Each member shall serve without pay but shall be reimbursed for
his actual expenses in accordance with the State Travel
Reimbursement Act.

SECTION 27. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1035, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1035. The Oklahoma Inspector Examiners Committee shall

have the power and duty:

1. To assist the State—Commissioner—ofHealth Construction

Industries Commission in certifying, licensing and otherwise

regulating persons employed as building and construction inspectors;

2. To assist the Cemmissierner Commission in establishing and

administering examinations to applicants for an Oklahoma inspector's
license;

3. To assist the Cemmissiener Commission in prescribing and

adopting forms for certification and licensure applications;

£h Commission by making

@
H-

4., To assist the StateBoard—eof

recommendations concerning rules anrd—regutatiens which establish
standards of performance for building and construction inspectors;

+h Commission in

@D
He

5. To assist the StateBoard—eoft

determining whether certification by a national certification

program or licensing by another governmental entity should be

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 27



approved as a substitute for a successful completion of the Oklahoma
Inspector's Examination;

6. To investigate alleged violations of the provisions of the

Oklahoma Inspectors Act and of any rules and—regulatioens promulgated
pursuant thereto; and

7. To have such other powers and duties as are necessary to
implement the Oklahoma Inspectors Act.

SECTION 28. AMENDATORY 59 0.35. 1991, Section 1036, as
amended by Section 2, Chapter 9, 0.S.L. 1995 (59 0.S. Supp. 2000,

Section 1036), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1036. A. Except—oasprovided—insubsecetion B of+this

rv—3—31900, appticants Applicants for

oot 3 P = SN L SR
b.)b\.zLa_LULJ., % N S W . = 1T

certification and license shall:
1. Show proof of certification or licensing by a program or
governmental entity approved by the State Beoard—eof Heatth

Construction Industries Commission; or

2. Have been certified by the Committee as having passed the
examination.

The Commissiener Commission shall issue a license to any person

who has met the requirements of paragraph 1 or 2 of this subsection
and who has paid the fees required by the Oklahoma Inspectors Act
and has otherwise complied with the applicable requirements of the

Oklahoma Inspectors Act. Provided, the Cemmissiener Commission may

issue a provisional license limited to two (2) years to enable an

applicant to meet the certification requirements of this subsection.

B T Comm o o o 1 1 oo o no T
. T ST =S50 = TS v

H-
|__|
He-
0]

H-

ar
[OR
03

H
4
H
4}
He-
N
@
4}

@D
|__l
He
4]
©
Hoj
|__l
H

5 Y S5o-13
Yot o=

g
)
qr
h
™

Iy
HOJ
i
)]
HOJ

§ol

T
"
4

q
@
[0)]

gl
[0)]
N
o)

th
Hh

H-

D
a
m

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 28



€~ Examinations shall be uniform and shall be practical in
nature but shall be sufficiently strict to test the qualifications
and fitness of the applicant as a building and construction
inspector. The examination shall be in whole or in part in writing.
Examination dates shall be set by the Committee. Any applicant
failing to pass the examination shall not be permitted to take
another examination for a period of thirty (30) days, and thereafter
any such applicants subsequently failing to pass the examination
shall not be permitted to take a subsequent examination for a period
of ninety (90) days.

b=~ C. All licenses shall be nontransferable and it shall be
unlawful for any holder of a license issued pursuant to the Oklahoma
Inspectors Act to loan or allow the use of such license by any other
person, firm or corporation.

SECTION 29. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1037, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1037. Application for examination, certification, or
license or renewal of license shall be made to the Ceommissioner

Construction Industries Commission in writing on forms furnished by

the Cemmissiener Commission and each application shall be

accompanied by a fee of Twenty-five Dollars ($25.00). Applicants
for renewal may also be required to submit proof of compliance with
continuing education requirements established by the Beard

Commission.

SECTION 30. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1039, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1039. A. The Committee may, upon its own motion, and
shall upon written complaint filed by any person, investigate
inspection practices of any building and construction inspector.

B. The Committee may request that an individual proceeding be

conducted to determine whether the licensee has:

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 29



1. Made a material misstatement in the application for license
or renewal thereof;

2. Loaned or illegally used kis the license of the licensee;

3. Demonstrated incompetency to act as a building and
construction inspector; or

4. Violated any provision of the Oklahoma Inspectors Act, or

any rule—regutation—eo¥r—order promulgated or order issued pursuant
to the Oklahoma Inspectors Act.

C. After a finding by an impartial hearing examiner that the
licensee is guilty of any violation as provided for in subsection B

of this section, the Cemmissiener Construction Industries Commission

may:
1. Suspend or revoke the license;
2. Defer such suspension or revocation pending mitigating or
remedial action by the licensee; or

3. Assess administrative penalties pursuant to the provisions

of Section +—3F+H+HH—AA-ofTitle63——oft+the Oklaheoma—Statutes 1044 of

this title.

D. Any person whose license has been revoked by the

Commisstorner Commission may not apply for a new license for at least

one (1) year from the date of such revocation.

SECTION 31. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1041, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1041. Any municipality or other governmental entity
which employs any person as a building and construction inspector
for functions normally performed by a building and construction

inspector shall notify the Cemmissiener Construction Industries

Commission of the employment.

Any municipality or other political subdivision of the state
with a population of ten thousand (10,000) or less according to the
most current census published by the Oklahoma Employment Security

Commission shall be exempt from the provisions of +his—aet the

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 30



Oklahoma Inspectors Act, unless such municipality or other political

subdivision of the state employs the services of a circuit rider
inspector.

SECTION 32. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1042, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1042. There is hereby created in the State Treasury a

revolving fund for the State beportment—eof Health Construction

Industries Commission, to be designated the "Oklahoma Inspectors

Revolving Fund". The fund shall be a continuing fund, not subject
to fiscal year limitations, and shall consist of all monies received

by the Cemmissiener Commission from fees and fines collected

pursuant to the Oklahoma Inspectors Act. All monies accruing to the
credit of said fund are hereby appropriated and may be budgeted and

expended by the State Commissieonereof Heatth Commission for the

purpose of implementing the provisions of the Oklahoma Inspectors
Act for the continuing education of building and construction
inspectors, and for implementing programs designed to further the
efficiency of the building and construction inspector profession and
public understanding of the profession. Expenditures from said fund
shall be made upon warrants issued by the State Treasurer against
claims filed as prescribed by law with the Director of State Finance
for approval and payment.

SECTION 33. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1044, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1044. Any person convicted of acting or performing as a
building and construction inspector without the proper license shall
be guilty of a misdemeanor and shall be punished by a fine of not
less than Two Hundred Fifty Dollars ($250.00) nor more than Two
Thousand Five Hundred Dollars ($2,500.00), together with the costs
of prosecution. Each day of violation shall constitute a separate

offense.

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 31



Any entity who employs an unlicensed person to perform the
duties and responsibilities of a building and construction inspector

or who fails to notify the Eemmissierer Construction Industries

Commission of the employment of an inspector shall be subject to an

Iz

B
4]

PP S S + 1
A=

I3 i
[SAT e ¥ ¥y T |y T

i

At~
oot TT Ot

H-

3o
T

administrative peratties—pt

€
T

&

H

T

i

| 1707 Smn A 1 1701
T = T=T7oT

T

H

Ay £ T+ &2 £ + a)
Fany L £ =3 J o

oT T

H-

IS
Tt

T

o
=4

qar

ahoma atutes fine of

H
H=

not more than Two Hundred Dollars ($200.00) for each violation.

Fach day a person is in violation may constitute a separate

violation. The maximum fine shall not exceed One Thousand Dollars
($1,000.00) .
SECTION 34. AMENDATORY 59 0.35. 1991, Section 1680, 1is

amended to read as follows:

Section 1680. TFhis—aet Sections 1680 through 1697 of this title

shall be known and may be cited as the "Electrical License Act".

SECTION 35. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1681, as
last amended by Section 1, Chapter 155, 0.S.L. 1994 (59 0.S. Supp.
2000, Section 1681), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1681. The State—Beoard—eoefHeatth Construction Industries

Commission is hereby authorized to adopt, amend and repeal rules

governing the examination and licensing of electrical contractors
and journeymen electricians, the defining of categories and
limitations for such licenses, the establishment of continuing
education requirements and procedures as determined by the Committee

of Electrical Examiners, the establishment and levying of

administrative fines, the initiation of disciplinary proceedings,
the requesting of prosecution of and initiation of injunctive
proceedings against any person who violates any of the provisions of

this—aet the Electrical License Act or any rule promulgated pursuant

to £his—aet the Electrical License Act, the establishment of bonding

and insurance requirements precluding municipal requirements, the
requirement of proof of possession of a Federal Tax ID Number and a

State of Oklahoma Employment Security Commission identification

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 32



number, the registration of electrical apprentices and the standard
of electrical installations, and to adopt future editions of the
Code. Provided, broiler houses will not be required to meet the
electrical wiring requirements for environmentally controlled
poultry houses as set out in the National Electric Code.

SECTION 36. AMENDATORY Section 4, Chapter 293, 0.S.L.
1994 (59 0.S. Supp. 2000, Section 1681.1), is amended to read as
follows:

Section 1681.1 The State—Commissioner—ofHealth Construction

Industries Commission shall establish by rule a process for the

formal review of the plans and specifications for a project prior to
bid dates for the project to ensure that the project plans and
specifications are in conformance with applicable plumbing,
electrical and mechanical installation codes. The rule shall
provide that the review shall be completed in a timely manner, not
to exceed fourteen (14) calendar days from the date of the
submission of a completed application for review which is
accompanied by the review fee not to exceed Two Hundred Dollars
($200.00) to be established by the rule. Upon completion of the
review, the plans and specifications shall be returned to the
applicant with documentation indicating either approval of plans and
specifications which are in compliance with the applicable codes, or
modifications which must be made to bring the plans and
specifications into conformance. Submission of such plans and

specifications for review by the Bepartment Commission shall be

voluntary.
SECTION 37. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1682, as
last amended by Section 5, Chapter 405, O0.S.L. 1999 (59 0.S. Supp.

2000, Section 1682), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1682. As used in the Electrical License Act:
1 L AN [ | BN Q44 R o £ a1+
- PP AN G N San W I L7 i i g ) T S CCl O [ AN G R S W A P L/L_LL.J.J.,
2 LA PN B I NE NN | B U NN NP = Q4+ Commi oo ~r £ a1+
mmrissioner' means—+the—Stat mmissioner—of Health:

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 33



32— "Commission" means the Construction Industries Commission;

2. "Committee" means the Committee of Electrical Examiners

appointed by the State Boardof Health Commission;

A "DNarartbmant+ W oo 4+ Q4o+ Doarar+tmant £ ~ 1+
4 Bepartment'—means—the—Statebepartment—of Healths
5+ 3. "Electrical apprentice”" means any person sixteen (16)

years of age or older whose principal occupation is the learning of
and assisting in the installation of electrical work under the
direct supervision of a licensed journeyman electrician or
electrical contractor;

6= 4. "Journeyman electrician" means any person other than an
electrical contractor who engages in the actual installation,
alteration, repair or renovation of electrical facilities or
electrical construction work unless specifically exempted by the
provisions of the Electrical License Act;

+= 5. "Electrical contractor" means any person skilled in the
planning, superintending and practical installation of electrical
facilities who is familiar with the laws, rules and regulations
governing such work. Electrical contractor also means any

individual, firm, partnership, corporation, limited liability

company, or business performing skills of an electrical contractor
or an electrician or the business of contracting, or furnishing
labor or labor and materials for the installation, repair,
maintenance or renovation of electrical facilities or electrical
construction work according to the provisions of the Electrical
License Act;

8+ 6. "Electrical facilities" means all wiring, fixtures,
appurtenances, and appliances for, and in connection with, a supply
of electricity within or adjacent to any building, structure or
conveyance on the premises but not including the connection with a
power supply meter or other power supply source;

9 7. "Category" means the classification by which licenses and

electrical work may be limited. Such categories shall include but

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 34



shall not be limited to installation, maintenance, repair,
alteration, residential, oilfield, and commercial;

+0—= 8. "Temporary journeyman electrician" means any person
other than a person permanently licensed as a journeyman electrician
or electrical contractor in this state who meets the temporary
licensure requirements of Section & 1685.1 of this =aet title;

+1-= 9. "Variance and Appeals Board" means the Oklahoma State
Electrical Installation Code Variance and Appeals Board; and

+2- 10. "Electrical construction work" means installation,
fabrication or assembly of equipment or systems included in
"premises wiring" as defined in the 1996 edition of the National
Electrical Code, which is hereby adopted and incorporated by
reference. Electrical construction work includes, but is not
limited to, installation of raceway systems used for any electrical
purposes, and installation of field-assembled systems such as ice
and snow melting, pipe-tracing, and manufactured wiring systems.
Electrical construction work shall not include in-plant work
performed by employees of the company owning the plant, work
performed by telecommunications employees for telecommunications
companies, or installation of factory-assembled appliances or
machinery which is not part of the premises wiring unless wiring
interconnections external to the equipment are required in the
field.

SECTION 38. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1683, as
last amended by Section 3, Chapter 318, 0.S.L. 1996 (59 0.S. Supp.
2000, Section 1683), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1683. A. There is hereby established the Committee of
Electrical Examiners which shall consist of seven (7) members. All
members of the Committee shall be residents of this state.

B. 3+-+—Six% Beginning January 1, 2002, as the terms of members

serving on the Committee expire, six voting members of the Committee

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 35



shall be appointed by the StateBeard—efHeatth Construction
Industries Commission as follows:
B ene
1. One member shall be an electrical inspector selected from a

list of names submitted by the Oklahoma Chapter, International
Association of Electrical Inspectors+;
b= one
2. One member shall be selected from a list of names submitted
by the Oklahoma Chapters of the National Electrical Contractors
Assoclations;
e efe
3. One member shall be selected from a list of names submitted
by the Associated Builders and Constructors+;
a= ore
4. One member shall be a journeyman wireman selected from a
list of names submitted by the International Brotherhood of
Electrical Workers+;
e ene
5. One member shall be a journeyman wireman selected from lists
of names submitted from the electrical construction industry+; and

£ ore

6. One member shall be selected enerbeforeJanvary—+—3+997
from a list of names submitted by the Oklahoma Chapters of
Independent Electrical Contractors, Incorporated. The term of the
initial appointee shall be for two (2) years.

All members shall each have at least ten (10) years of active
experience as licensed electrical contractors, journeyman
electricians or as an electrical inspector. No member shall be
employed by the same person or firm as any other member of the
Committee. The terms of members so appointed shall be staggered and
shall be for two (2) years, or until their successors are appointed

and qualified.

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 36



2+~ The nonvoting member shall be designated by the Beaxd

Commission from ke its staff ef—the State bepartment—oefHeatth to

serve as Program Administrator and serve as the Chief Electrical
Inspector for the state.
C. Vacancies which may occur in the membership of the Committee

shall be filled by appointment of the Beard Commission. Each person

who has been appointed to fill a wvacancy shall serve for the
remainder of the term for which the member he or she succeeds was
appointed and until his or her successor has been appointed and has
qualified. Members of the Committee may be removed from office by

the Beaxrd Commission for cause in the manner provided by law for the

removal of officers not subject to impeachment.

D. The Committee shall assist and advise the Gommissioner

Commission on all matters relating to the formulation of rules+

regutatieons and standards in accordance with the Electrical License
Act. The Committee shall administer the examinations of applicants
for licenses as electrical contractors or journeyman electricians
provided that such examinations shall be in accordance with the
provisions of the Electrical License Act. The Committee may

authorize the Pepartment Commission to conduct tests on their behalf

as the Committee deems necessary.

E. All members of the Committee shall be reimbursed for
expenses incurred while in the performance of their duties in
accordance with the State Travel Reimbursement Act.

F. A majority of the total membership of the Committee shall
constitute a quorum for the transaction of business.

G. The Committee shall elect from among its membership a
chairperson, vice-chairperson and secretary to serve terms of not
more than one (1) year ending on June 30 of the year designated as
the end of the officer's term. The chairperson or vice-chairperson
shall preside at all meetings. The chairperson, vice-chairperson

and secretary shall perform such duties as may be directed by the

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 37



Committee. The Committee shall meet at such times as the
chairperson or presiding officer deems necessary to implement—this

seetion carry out the responsibilities of the Committee.

SECTION 39. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1685, is

amended to read as follows:

=
-

Section 1685. A. Construction Industries

Commission shall issue a license as journeyman electrician or

electrical contractor to any person who:

1. Has been certified by the Committee of Electrical Examiners

as either having successfully passed the appropriate examination or
having a valid license issued by another governmental entity with
licensing requirements similar to those provided in the Electrical
License Act; and
2. Has paid the license fee and otherwise complied with the
provisions of the Electrical License Act.

B. All licenses shall be nontransferable and it shall be a

misdemeanor for any person licensed under the provisions of the

Electrical License Act to loan or allow the use of such license by

any other person, firm or corporation, except as specifically
provided in the Electrical License Act.

lal I+t 11 JAYEE =N SV | 1099 + CAamma o o g noar oho11 1IN AT N A~ A e

—Untit tober—1 82 —+th -S-sHorer—Sshatt—upon—proper

D PP LU IO £ £ o KPP 1 oo aa i+ e BN O
apptieation—and payment—of fees—issuyeticenses—without SRR ORS
+ noarooan o 17 P E Ti21 <z 1 10Q9 18 somasemna v 19 Ao~ o oo

= -tJ 1O ITThOT WIS LJJ_.LUJ_ A a LA g =y _L, == UL., T = = T l\LJ_LJ_\_/u [ - A"F W ey [=J L& are)

= 1l ATIMmAan 1 ot ~g Ao © 1 ot v~ onnt o~ o T oA Wz o o ~a b7
FJeourreyrar—etectricians—eorelectrical contractors—issued by a——ett

r EIEAWAPANE SN vt A+ TI0 £ + 1o falk i e ERav- B X % + PR ) o ome 1o a
g i Sy \JJ—t/\JJ_ul.,b\J. T O WIT | C I 1T [ ey &> ay wy I j&” iy aw 5 WITT TITCC o C I VY IO O = TIC [ s - Ay
1+ + rocitl ramant o £ + Fleocotra~al T2 ~Aarna ot Thaia 11 ~~Ana
with—the—reguirements—-of the Fleetricatl HicenseAet—This 1iecens
miraot nrodiloaoad So o e~ At a oo + it ma ey o oo+ 11 cano 1 £
muast—be—produced—as—o prereguisite—& btaining—a—state—tiecense—+F

+ PR B BN 2N 1o o oo Adant £ - o sz r + T Sxza oy o 1lacoaArnoan -~

L e ub/b/L_LL/ull\. = = f= - (== =nw 3 TITC A = L= | may wy g =y T WIT Ll(_/LV_LLJ.\j L [ p— — \_/J.J.s_)_l_ll\j
1aw-

SECTION 40. AMENDATORY Section 6, Chapter 405, 0.S.L.
1999 (59 0.S. Supp. 2000, Section 1685.1), is amended to read as
follows:

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 38



Section 1685.1 A. Within one (1) year of the date the Governor
of this state declares a state of emergency in response to a
disaster involving the destruction of dwelling units, the State

Comma oo o naoaxr £
Tt oo TOTICT E=

Heal+h Construction Industries Commission shall

issue a distinctively colored, nonrenewable, temporary Jjourneyman
electrician license which shall expire one (1) year after the date
of declaration to any person who is currently licensed as a
journeyman electrician by another state and who:

1. Submits, within ten (10) days of beginning journeyman
electrician's work in this state, an application and fee for a
journeyman electrician's examination;

2. Takes and passes the examination at the first opportunity

thereafter offered by the Cemmissiener Commission; and

3. Pays a temporary journeyman electrician's license fee of
Twenty-five Dollars ($25.00).

B. ©Nothing in this section shall be construed as prohibiting
any person from qualifying at any time for any other license by
meeting the requirements for the other license.

SECTION 41. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1686, 1is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1686. A. The CSemmissiener Construction Industries

Commission shall, upon proper application and payment of fee,

register as an electrical apprentice and issue a certificate of such
registration to any person who furnishes satisfactory proof to the

Commissiorner Commission that the applicant is:

1. Sixteen (16) years of age or over;
2. Enrolled in a seheedt—or federal training eewrse program for

electrical apprentices recognized by the cemmissiener Commission, or

has—arranged—Ffor—employment employed as an electrical apprentice

with & an active licensed electrical contractor.

B. All applications for examination, license or renewal of

license shall be made in writing to the Cemmissiener Commission on

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 39



forms provided, if necessary, by the Cemmissiener Commission. All

applications shall be accompanied by the appropriate fee.

SECTION 42. AMENDATORY 59 0.35. 1991, Section 1688, as
last amended by Section 8, Chapter 405, 0.S.L. 1999 (59 0.S. Supp.
2000, Section 1688), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1688. A. ©No license shall be issued for longer than
one (1) year and all licenses shall expire on June 30 of each year.
A license may be renewed upon application and payment of fees thirty
(30) days preceding or following June 30 of each year and not be
subject to a late renewal penalty. No penalty for late renewal
shall be charged to any holder of a license which expires while the
holder is in military service if an application for renewal is made

within one (1) year following kis—er—her the service discharge of

the holder.

B. No journeyman or contractor license shall be renewed unless
the licensee has completed the required hours of continuing
education by completing a course on the current national electrical
code revision of not less than six (6) hours of instruction as

determined by the Committee of Electrical Examiners and approved by

the State Roardeoef Heatth Construction Industries Commission, within

one (1) year of adoption of the current national electrical code
revision.

C. An apprentice registration certificate shall be issued for
one (1) year, at which time the apprentice may reregister upon

meeting the requirements of the State Pepartment—of Heatth

Commission and paying the renewal fee.

SECTION 43. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1689, as
last amended by Section 4, Chapter 353, 0.S.L. 1997 (59 0.S. Supp.

2000, Section 1689), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1689. A. The State—Commissieoner—eofHealth Construction

Industries Commission and the Committee of Electrical Examiners

shall act as the Electrical Hearing Board and shall comply with the

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 40



provisions of Article II of the Administrative Procedures Act+

£ M+ i~ £ +1 Oklabeoms Gt oot oo
[ Sy Sy w— T | T NI CTUTITOTTICT [P UV & N Uy W oy sy e

Seetion—309—et——seg—of

B. The Electrical Hearing Board may, upon its own motion, and
shall, upon written complaint filed by any person, investigate the
business transactions of any electrical contractor, Jjourneyman
electrician or electrical apprentice. Upon a finding by clear and
convincing evidence, the Board shall suspend or revoke any license
or registration obtained by false or fraudulent representation.
Upon a finding by clear and convincing evidence, the Board shall
also suspend or revoke any license or registration for any of the
following:

1. Making a material misstatement in the application for a

license or registration, or the renewal of a license or

registration;
2. Loaning or illegally using a license;
3. Demonstrating incompetence to act as a Jjourneyman

electrician or electrical contractor;
4. Violating any provisions of the Electrical License Act, or

any ruleq—regutatien or order prescribed by the Commission or any

ordinance or regulation for the installation of electrical
facilities made or enacted by a city or town by authority of the
Electrical License Act; or

5. Willfully failing to perform normal business obligations
without justifiable cause.

C. Any person whose license or registration has been revoked by
the Electrical Hearing Board may apply for a new license one (1)
year from the date of such revocation.

D. Notwithstanding any other provision of law, a political
subdivision of this state that has adopted a nationally recognized
electrical code and appointed an inspector pursuant to the

provisions of Section 1693 er—Seetion303+—et——seqg- of this title or

pursuant to the provisions of the Oklahoma Inspectors Act for such

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 41



work shall have jurisdiction over the interpretation of the code and
the installation of all electrical work done in that political

subdivision, subject to the provisions of the Oklahoma Inspectors

Act—Seetion—+03+—et——seg—of +this+title. Provided, a state
inspector may work directly with an electrical contractor,
journeyman electrician or electrical apprentice in such a locality
if a violation of the code creates an immediate threat to life or
health.

E. 1In the case of a complaint about, investigation of, or
inspection of any license, registration, permit or electrical work
in any political subdivision of this state which has not adopted a
nationally recognized electrical code and appointed an inspector

pursuant to the provisions of Section 1693 erSeecktion 1031 et seg-

of this title or pursuant to the provisions of the Oklahoma

Inspectors Act for such work, the State Commissionerof Healtth

Commission shall have jurisdiction over such matters.

F. 1. No individual, business, company, corporation,

association or other entity subject to the provisions of Seetion

1690 ~+
T oo 1=

+1e the Electrical License Act shall install,

o oF
=} T

modify or alter electrical facilities in any incorporated area of
this state which has not adopted a nationally recognized electrical

code and appointed an inspector pursuant to the provisions of

ar

Section 1693 er——Seetion—363%+ seg- of this title or pursuant to

the provisions of the Oklahoma Inspectors Act for such work without

providing notice of such electrical work to the State Commissioner

of Health Commission. A notice form for reproduction by an

individual or entity required to make such notice shall be provided

by the Cemmissiener Commission upon request.

2. Notice to the €cemmissiener Commission pursuant to this

subsection shall not be required for electrical maintenance or
replacement of existing electrical appliances or fixtures or of any

petroleum refinery or its research facilities.

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 42



3. Enforcement of this subsection is authorized pursuant to

At 2~ 1 29N +
[CASAS A= s s aa ma v oA v}

o or
T o tTTe o

i++le the Electrical License Act, or

under authority granted to the Ceommissionereof Healtth Commission.

SECTION 44. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1691, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1691. Any holder of a license or registration issued in
accordance with the provisions of the Electrical License Act shall

promptly notify the Cemmissiener Construction Industries Commission

of any change in kis address.

SECTION 45. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1694, as
last amended by Section 7, Chapter 155, 0.S.L. 1994 (59 0.S. Supp.
2000, Section 1694), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1694. All monies received by the Commissiener

Construction Industries Commission under the Electrical License Act,

including the administrative fines authorized by Section 1695 of
this title, shall be deposited with the State Treasurer and credited
to the "Electrical Revolving Fund". The revolving fund shall be a
continuing fund not subject to fiscal year limitations and shall be

under the control and management of the ECemmissiener Commission.

All monies accruing to the credit of the fund are hereby

appropriated and may be budgeted and expended by the Commission.

Expenditures from this fund shall be made pursuant to the purposes
of the Electrical License Act and shall include, but not be limited
to, payment of operating costs and the costs of programs designed to
promote public awareness of the electrical industry, and
expenditures for the preparation and printing of regulations,
bulletins or other documents and the furnishing of copies of such

documents to those persons engaged in the electrical industry or the

public. Werrants fer expenditures shall be drawn by the State

13 3
PR B oy

¥

sz £
C—=—

BoEe
PPTove

.
=

Finaree Expenditures

)]

o
& Tyt TT ps

from the fund shall be made upon warrants issued by the State

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 43



Treasurer against claims filed as prescribed by law with the

Director of State Finance for approval and payment. The revolving

fund shall be audited at least once each year by the State Auditor
and Inspector.

SECTION 46. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1696, as
amended by Section 9, Chapter 155, 0.S.L. 1994 (59 0.S. Supp. 2000,
Section 1696), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1696. Nothing in the Electrical License Act shall
prohibit cities and towns from having full authority to provide
supervision and inspection of electrical facilities by the enactment
of codes, ordinances, bylaws, and rules ampd—regutatiens in such form
as they may determine and prescribe for their jurisdiction;

provided, that no such codes, ordinances, bylaws, and rules o¥

r ooy
-

jions shall be inconsistent with the Electrical License Act,

or any rule er—¥regultatien adopted or prescribed by the StateReoard

ofHealth Construction Industries Commission as authorized by the

Electrical License Act. FEach state licensed electrical contractor
and journeyman electrician shall be required to register with any

city or town in whose jurisdiction ke the licensee operates. Each

such city or town is authorized to register such electrical

contractor or journeyman electrician, to revoke the registration, to
charge fees for the registration and for permits and inspections of
electrical work. ©No electrical contractor or journeyman electrician
shall be permitted to do business or work in any city or town where

k+s the local registration of the electrical contractor or

journeyman electrician has been revoked.

SECTION 47. AMENDATORY Section 7, Chapter 293, 0.S.L.
1994 (59 0.S. Supp. 2000, Section 1697), is amended to read as
follows:

Section 1697. A. 1. There is hereby created the Oklahoma
State Electrical Installation Code Variance and Appeals Board. The

Variance and Appeals Board shall hear testimony and shall review

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 44



sufficient technical data submitted by an applicant to substantiate
the proposed installation of any material, assembly or manufacturer-
engineered components, equipment or system that is not specifically
prescribed by an appropriate installation code, an industry
consensus standard or fabricated or installed according to
recognized and generally accepted good engineering practices, where
no ordinance or regulation of a governmental subdivision applies.

If it is determined that the evidence submitted is satisfactory
proof of performance for the proposed installation, the Variance and
Appeals Board shall approve such alternative, subject to the
requirements of the appropriate installation code. Applications for
the use of an alternative material or method of construction shall

be submitted in writing to the State Commissioner of Health

Construction Industries Commission for approval prior to use.

Applications shall be accompanied by a filing fee, not to exceed

Fifty Dollars ($50.00), as set by rule of the State Board of Health

Commission.

2. The Variance and Appeals Board shall also hear appeals from

Hh
ar

H
H

contractors+ licensed by the Seeupational Ticensing Servie

Statebepartment—oefHeatth Commission, and any party who has an

ownership interest in or is in responsible charge of the design of

or work on the installation, who contest the Bepartment's

Commission's interpretation of the state's model electrical

installation code as applied to a particular installation. Such
appeals shall be based on a claim that:
a. the true intent of the installation code has been
incorrectly interpreted,
b. the provisions of the code do not fully apply, or
c. an equal or better form of installation is proposed.
Such appeals to the Variance and Appeals Board shall be made in

writing to the StateCommissieoner—eof Healtth Commission within

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 45



fourteen (14) days after a code interpretation or receipt of written
notice of the alleged code violation by the licensed contractor.

B. The Variance and Appeals Board shall consist of the State

Comma oo naoaxr £ 11
Tt T—TT

at+th—er—his—er—her designated representative of

the Construction Industries Commission and the following members

who, except for the State Fire Marshal or designee, shall be

appointed by the Cemmissiener Commission from a list of names

submitted by the professional organizations of the professions
represented on the Board and who shall serve at the pleasure of the

commissteoner Commission:

1. Two members shall be appointed from the Committee of
Electrical Examiners; one shall be a contractor with five (5) years
of experience and one shall be a journeyman with five (5) years of
experience;

2. One member shall be a registered design professional who is
a registered architect with at least ten (10) years of experience,
five (5) of which shall have been in responsible charge of work;

3. One member shall be a registered design professional with at
least ten (10) years of structural engineering or architectural
experience, five (5) of which shall have been in responsible charge
of work;

4. One member shall be a registered design professional with
mechanical or plumbing engineering experience; provided, such member
shall have at least ten (10) years of experience, five (5) of which
shall have been in responsible charge of work;

5. One member shall be a registered design professional with
electrical engineering experience; provided, such member shall have
at least ten (10) years of experience, five (5) of which shall have
been in responsible charge of work; and

6. One member shall be the State Fire Marshal or a designee of

the State Fire Marshal.

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 46



Any member serving on the Board on January 1, 2002, may continue

to serve on the Board until a replacement is appointed by the

Commission.

C. Members, except the Ccemmissiener designee of the Commission

(0N

and the State Fire Marshal and—the—Commissionerls—and—State—Fixe

Marshalt'ls or the designated xrepreserntatives representative of the

State Fire Marshal, and employees of the Bepartmernt Commission,

shall be reimbursed for travel expenses pursuant to the State Travel

Reimbursement Act+—Seetion500-F+—et——seg—of Fitle T4 of +the Okdahoma

Statutesy from the revolving fund created pursuant to Section 1694

of FH+te 50 of +the Ok Statutes this title.

1o mo
T oo

D. The Variance and Appeals Board shall meet after the

Commissioner Commission receives proper application for a variance,

accompanied by the filing fee, or proper notice of an appeal, as

provided in subsection A of this section.

E The Q+ o+ Comma o o noar £ o1+ K oxr  + Comma oo Al o
. ot ot S-S0 CE Tttty Tttt TS0 hRceTEF—S

designated representatives of the Commission shall serve as chair of

the Variance and Appeals Board. A majority of the members of the
Variance and Appeals Board shall constitute a quorum for the
transaction of the business of the Board.

SECTION 48. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1850.1, 1is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1850.1 Sections 2 1850.1 through 4 1860 of this aet
title shall be known and may be cited as the "Mechanical Licensing
Act".

SECTION 49. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1850.2, as
last amended by Section 10, Chapter 405, O0.S.L. 1999 (59 0.S. Supp.
2000, Section 1850.2), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1850.2 As used in the Mechanical Licensing Act:

1. "Air conditioning system" means the process of treating air
by controlling its temperature, humidity, and cleanliness, to meet

the requirements of a designated area;

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 47



2 WD AN o o + Q4o+ Roord £ S 1+h .
. Board—meo = State—PBoara +—Headttrs

no
TS T

3= "Committee" means the Committee of Mechanical Examiners;

N

=Y mo
T Ot

1SN

"DNoarnartmean+ W e +h A N1 + Do ogrtman + £ =1 e
e P THCT T HCeatts—ttt p = t CPaE et + T

o 1
oo 7

5+ 3. "Commission” means the Construction Industries

Commission;

4. "Gas piping" means and includes all natural gas piping
within or adjacent to any building, structure, or conveyance, on the
premises and to the connection with a natural gas meter, regulator,
or other source of supply;

6= 5. "Heating systems" means and includes systems consisting
of air heating appliances from which the heated air is distributed
and shall include any accessory apparatus and equipment installed in
connection therewith;

4= 6. "Mechanical contractor" or "contractor" means any person
engaged in the business of planning, contracting, supervising or
furnishing labor or labor and materials for mechanical work;

8= 7. "Mechanical journeyman" or "journeyman" means any person
other than a contractor or apprentice who engages in mechanical
work;

9= 8. "Mechanical apprentice" or "apprentice" means any person
sixteen (16) years of age or older whose principal occupation is
learning mechanical work on the job under the direct supervision of
a journeyman or contractor;

+0—= 9. "Mechanical firm" means any corporation, partnership,

association, proprietorship, limited liability company, or other

business entity which plans or engages, or offers to engage, in
mechanical work for another within this state;

+3-= 10. "Mechanical work" means the installation, maintenance,
repair, or renovation, in whole or in part, of any heating system,
cooling system, mechanical refrigeration system or ventilation

system or any equipment or piping carrying chilled water, air for

ventilation purposes, or natural gas, or the installation,

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 48



maintenance, repair, or renovation of process piping used to carry
any liguid, substance, or material, including steam and hot water
used for space heating purposes not under the jurisdiction of the
Department of Labor other than minor repairs to such systems;

+2- 11. "Refrigeration system" means the erection, installation,
repairing and servicing of a system employing a fluid which normally
is vaporized and liquefied in an air conditioning system, food
preservation measure or manufacturing process;

+3= 12. "Sheet metal" means the erection, installation and
repairing of all ferrous or nonferrous duct work and all other

materials used in all air conditioning;

f

13. "Temporary mechanical journeyman" means any person
other than a person permanently licensed as a mechanical journeyman
or contractor in this state who meets the temporary licensure
requirements of Section +2 1850.8A of this aet title; and

+5= 14. "Variance and Appeals Board" means the Oklahoma State
Mechanical Installation Code Variance and Appeals Board.

SECTION 50. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1850.3, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1850.3 The Beaxd Construction Industries Commission

shall have the power and duty to:

1. Promulgate, prescribe, amend, and repeal rules anrd
regutatieons necessary to implement the provisions of the Mechanical
Licensing Act including, but not limited to, defining categories and
limitations for such licenses+ and for registration of apprentices,
and establishing bonding and insurance requirements precluding
municipal requirements;

2. Adopt standards for mechanical work, by reference, published
by a recognized code body; and

3. Establish minimum standards of mechanical installations in

this state.

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 49



SECTION 51. AMENDATORY Section 9, Chapter 293, 0.S.L.
1994 (59 0.S. Supp. 2000, Section 1850.3a), is amended to read as

follows:

Section 1850.3a The State—Ceommissioner—ofHealth Construction

qr

@D

Industries Commission shall establish by rule a process for the

formal review of the plans and specifications for a project prior to
bid dates for the project to ensure that the project plans and
specifications are in conformance with applicable plumbing,
electrical and mechanical installation codes. The rule shall
provide that the review shall be completed in a timely manner, not
to exceed fourteen (14) calendar days from the date of the
submission of a completed application for review which is
accompanied by the review fee not to exceed Two Hundred Dollars
($200.00) to be established by the rule. Upon completion of the
review, the plans and specifications shall be returned to the
applicant with documentation indicating either approval of plans and
specifications which are in compliance with the applicable codes, or
modifications which must be made to bring the plans and
specifications into conformance. Submission of such plans and

specifications for review by the Bepartment Commission shall be

voluntary.

SECTION 52. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1850.4, as
last amended by Section 10, Chapter 293, 0.S.L. 1994 (59 0.S. Supp.
2000, Section 1850.4), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1850.4 A. There is hereby established the Committee of
Mechanical Examiners, which shall consist of five (5) members. All
members shall be citizens of the United States and shall be

residents of this state. Members shall hold office for terms of two

(2) years or until their successors have been appointed and

qualified.
B IR (AY Mmoo £ + Coamma + 4 a1 1 W EEACN Nt~ sz +
3 [ S N U i \7/ T ITT =) | - 1T IO I T T [N N N &7 e T (_ALJLJU_LLLL_ A\ LJ_Y 1T

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 50



I
=

alho 11

o
ATt

+h
Tt

maml

Py

On

T

T

[ i 4 e e mp iy

T

11y ATz S

=

-

Comma + + ol 11

+h

T Jo o Iroy ot .

[ i @ e g iy

A=/ 135 31 = mpy e oy

A T

T

TTT

SO 1 A
-

(5 sz ra EWaE X R
=

N

£z

o ot
To T

a1 1 W oss o
=

o

Qaroh meamis

T

| A o & oy T

T

e

T oitcL L Itcrv

oo

Ttr

(AT AT u

1
¥

TaL

o
S

ah an

W

T

paay

TTIT

o
T 0%

mamin
THo

F3ay

1<z
TTty

aha1 71 I
(O 3O nu mpm muy )

LNl
T

mamin
T

W

BN P N
Boarad—shat+

R

+h

nt o
CTT

EEEAN 2]
T I CTItr

et

1 NoF

mal
o

TS5y

“rPr

i g s e gy W gy @ g g

TIT

IS

EEE N B o N |

i 10Q0Q0 Th RaagrA okl
TTt E=AT A S -

SZO-1-3 3 mey

rm o

P g s e g e gy @ e g

e TIT

[ i i @ e mpe g

TIT

P9

TItho

Decamh | 1097 Th o £+

sz

a4
Rt

Nt o
T T30

3t
T I CItt

S
“rrE

~Y

3

+ 1

CTIT

pamt ]

+
=

+r
o g

SZ

(2

r oo £ +rg
A = LITHO A =

£
=

ra oho171 WAl A £ ~
O — O T

mamb

by

g e g

| 3 i Sy e e

=7

W

T

£ S A o s 1 % R g S i N

T

o

E
-

mamln
T

£ +heoa
O

o
TITho

1002 N + 1

1

Ti31l sz

PRoccarnnm oo

TITIC S

T

TITCT

ThHO

=7

ooy

DT T ity

1 as7z meoamh
T

Ty

anA +h
o

n

o0+ o
TS

+h

=

T

TIT

[E SR 4 AN 4 ¥ A e

T

CIT orrT T

o

I

nt sz + 1
Tt

T

1t
I CItt

SRS
bl i o

d sz
SOy

211

'y
= e

I
=

alh o 11

4

1 r o

ey £

TItt

wh

WIT

~Y

[ i 3 o e mp iy

T 1T O C

coant ot axrAa o A A+ oo 1+ 2 no +1
SCHcao oI vV o ottt PSS TTToTS

£ DRDoar -~

o
TTOoO T oCT—OT

N

e R

Qo

TITC

o

TIT

INCTo T

T

o

O CTIN T

ol o 1

rm
It LT

+

o

Ik

+
T

maomls

Ttt

1 sz

an A A
o Ty

+~
-

rnoaszmarn e

=

[ 3 3 o e e my

T

WITo S

T

TIT

T

DALL= T T I

oIt

-

n
[ZAE ¥ 1w

+h
CTT

Mmoo

T
T

a1 dAant Do

P

nt sz +1
Ty TTt T

EERAE v

Y
1= = A== ey

a sz

£- 11

b

= T O o

[=2= " w 2wy ¥ ey e

T

[ e mpm = ) S

o

n

n £ +haa ot 2

ot

ISEEN W]
S-S

nlrroirant

CTIT o T O

T

T OTT

T

PO oSTOTItc

M
o+

B o
L4 Tt

oo 1]

mma
Tt C T

+h
TIt

1 F+h +

T T CIt

Th

7

[ 5 § @ e gy

oo

Tt

T

.
T

Comma oo 2 ~r

+h
TTIT

VA R e SN T2
o P PoTHTeo—oY

b
o

alh 11

Wk

NDoernoxrtmant

+h

o

OTIiT OO0 L OTT

O TICH T

WITO

CITC DT PO CIrCTIro

o

olacad s

I
=

ol o~ 11

mamis

Tt

1002 ISR 2

Tl sz 1

nox

N

n
DO T Ity

o0

[F ¥ o gy mpm my

T

T

TT

[=avs

T

(e ==y 4

Members of the Committee

shall be appointed as follows

Two members shall be appointed by the President Pro Tempore

1

ive (5)

ith £

journeymen w

of the Senate and shall be mechanical

.
4

actual experience in mechanical work as journeymen

years'

Two members shall be appointed by the Speaker of the House

2.

(5)

of Representatives and shall be mechanical contractors with five

and

.
14

actual experience in mechanical work as contractors

years'

Page 51

No. 6344

Req.



3. One member shall be a lay member appointed by the

commissteoner—of—Health Construction Industries Commission. The

person serving in this position on January 1, 2002, may elect to

continue to serve until the end of the term of office and until a

successor has been appointed and qualified.

i Maoamlar N+ + cralh e ot
17 T c—C TS 1=

(4}
a
D
F_’
}__J
,.

q

q
He

th
T
)]

C. Any vacancy on the Committee shall be filled for the
unexpired term within thirty (30) days in the manner in which that
position was originally filled. Members may be removed for

misconduct, +reeompeteney incompetence, or neglect of duty.

S~ D. A majority of the Committee shall constitute a quorum for
the transaction of business, and the Committee shall elect a
ehatrman chair from its number. Each member shall receive travel
expenses in accordance with the provisions of the State Travel
Reimbursement Act. The Committee shall meet at least quarterly to
conduct examinations, and special meetings may be called by the

cehairman chalr or the Ceommissionerof Health Commission.

H= E. The Committee shall:

1. Assist and advise the Beaxrd Commission on all matters

pertaining to the formation of rules are—regutatiens pursuant to the
provisions of the Mechanical Licensing Act;

2. Assist and advise the Bepartment Commission on the

examinations for applicants for licenses as a mechanical contractor
or journeyman and on all matters relating to the licensing of
mechanical contractors and mechanical journeymen and the registering

of mechanical apprentices; and

3. Assist and advise the Beard—er Pepartment Commission in such

other matters as 4s requested thereby.

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 52



SECTION 53. AMENDATORY 59 0.8. 1991, Section 1850.5, as
last amended by Section 11, Chapter 293, 0.S.L. 1994 (59 0.S. Supp.

2000, Section 1850.5), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1850.5 The Bepartment Construction Industries

Commission shall have the power and duty to:

1. Issue, renew, suspend, revoke, modify or deny licenses to
engage 1in mechanical work pursuant to the Mechanical Licensing Act;

2. Register apprentices;

3. Enter upon public and private property for the purpose of
inspecting workers' licenses and mechanical work for compliance with
the provisions of the Mechanical Licensing Act and of the rules anrnd

regutations of the Beard Commission promulgated pursuant thereto;

4. Employ personnel to conduct investigations and inspections;

5. Enforce the standards and rules and—regutatiens promulgated

pursuant to the Mechanical Licensing Act;

6. Reprimand or place on probation, or both, any holder of a
license or registration pursuant to the Mechanical Licensing Act;

7. Investigate complaints and hold hearings;

8. Initiate disciplinary proceedings, request prosecution of
and initiate injunctive proceedings against any person who violates

any of the provisions of #his—aet the Mechanical Licensing Act or

any rule promulgated pursuant fe—this—aet thereto;

D

9. Establish and levy administrative fines against any person

who violates any of the provisions of +his—aet the Mechanical

Licensing Act or any rule promulgated pursuant +e—this

et thereto;

D

10. Conduct investigations into the qualifications of
applicants for licensure and registration on the request of the

Bepartmernt Commission;

11. Develop and administer the examinations approved by the
Committee of Mechanical Examiners for applicants for licenses as a

mechanical contractor or journeyman; and

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 53



12. Exercise all incidental powers as necessary and proper to
implement and enforce the provisions of the Mechanical Licensing Act
and the rules anrd—regulations—of+the Beard promulgated pursuant
thereto.

SECTION 54. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1850.7, 1is

amended to read as follows:

Section 1850.7 AfterJonvery+—3988+—mo No persony—en—behaltf

rm- shall engage or offer to engage
in, by advertisement or otherwise, any mechanical work as a
journeyman or contractor who does not possess a valid and

appropriate license from the Bepartmernt Construction Industries

Commission. No business entity shall act as a mechanical firm

unless a contractor is associated with and responsible for all
mechanical work of such entity.

SECTION 55. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1850.8, as
last amended by Section 11, Chapter 405, O0.S.L. 1999 (59 0.S. Supp.

2000, Section 1850.8), 1is amended to read as follows:

Section 1850.8 A. Exeept—asauvthorized by the provisions——of
crrtlhao e~ o n B £ +h-c o~ 2 n T S+ o+ Doenartmant £ Tl +h T e
SRS o= 55 o tt7 et otort Dottt +—rrCa Tttt

Construction Industries Commission shall issue a license as a

mechanical journeyman or mechanical contractor to any person who:

1. Has been certified by the Committee of Mechanical Examiners
as having successfully passed the appropriate examination; and

2. Has paid the license fee and has otherwise complied with the
provisions of the Mechanical Licensing Act. The license fees shall

be annually as follows:

a. mechanical contractor Fifty Dollars ($50.00),

b. mechanical journeyman Twenty-five Dollars ($25.00),

c. apprentice registration Fifteen Dollars ($15.00), and

d. apprentice registration renewal Fifteen Dollars
($15.00) .

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 54



B. All licenses shall be nontransferable. No license shall be
issued for longer than one (1) year and all licenses shall expire on
June 30 of each year. Licenses may be renewed upon application and
payment of the required fees and payment of any penalty for late

renewal, as shall be established by the Beard Commission. Licenses,

issued without state examination, that have not been renewed by June
30 of the year following expiration, shall not be renewed until the
applicant passes the appropriate examination. Persons who are

licensed under #his—aet the Mechanical Licensing Act may have their

license placed on inactive status by paying the annual renewal fee
and eliminating the bonding and insurance requirements. No late fee
shall be charged to renew a license which expired while the
applicant was in military service if application is made within one
(1) year of discharge from the military service.

C. The Bepartment Commission is authorized to establish—upen

approvat—by—the State Reardeof Health+ and issue, subject to the

provisions of the Mechanical Licensing Act, limited licenses in each
area of mechanical work based on the experience, ability,
examination scores and the education of the applicant. The limited
licenses shall authorize the licensee to engage in only those
activities and within the limits specified in the license.

SECTION 56. AMENDATORY Section 12, Chapter 405, 0.S.L.
1999 (59 0.S. Supp. 2000, Section 1850.8A), is amended to read as
follows:

Section 1850.8A A. Within (1) one year of the date the
Governor of this state declares a state of emergency in response to
a disaster involving the destruction of dwelling units, the State

commissteoner—of—Health Construction Industries Commission shall

issue a distinctively colored, nonrenewable, temporary mechanical
journeyman license which shall expire one (1) year after the date of
declaration to any person who is currently licensed as a mechanical

journeyman by another state and who:

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 55



1. Submits, within ten (10) days of beginning mechanical
journeyman's work in this state, an application and fee for a
mechanical journeyman's examination;

2. Takes and passes the examination at the first opportunity

thereafter offered by the Cemmissieoner Commission; and

3. Pays a temporary mechanical journeyman's license fee of
Twenty-five Dollars ($25.00).

B. Nothing in this section shall be construed as prohibiting
any person from qualifying at any time for any other license by
meeting the requirements for the other license.

SECTION 57. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1850.9, as
amended by Section 13, Chapter 405, 0.S.L. 1999 (59 0.S. Supp. 2000,
Section 1850.9), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1850.9 A. The State bepartment—eof Heatth Construction

Industries Commission, upon proper application and payment of an

apprentice registration fee, shall register as a mechanical
apprentice and issue a certificate of such registration to any

person who furnishes satisfactory proof to the Bepartment Commission

that the applicant is:
1. Sixteen (16) years of age or older; and

2. Enrolled in a school or training course for mechanical

apprentices recognized by the Bepartment Commission, or has arranged

for employment as a mechanical apprentice with a licensed mechanical
contractor.

B. Apprentice registration certificates shall expire one (1)
year after date of registration, at which time the apprentice may
reregister and receive, upon payment of the apprentice registration
renewal fee, a renewal certificate.

SECTION 58. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1850.13, as
amended by Section 9, Chapter 236, 0.S.L. 1993 (59 0.S. Supp. 2000,

Section 1850.13), is amended to read as follows:

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 56



Section 1850.13 There is hereby created in the State Treasury a

revolving fund for the Okiaheoma—State bepartment—of Health

Construction Industries Commission, to be designated the "Oklahoma

Mechanical Licensing Revolving Fund". The fund shall be a

continuing fund, not subject to fiscal year limitations, and shall

consist of all monies received by the DBepartment Commission pursuant

to the Mechanical Licensing Act, including administrative fines
authorized by Section & 1850.11 of this =e¥ title. All monies
accruing to the credit of said fund are hereby appropriated and may

be budgeted and expended by the Pepartment Commission for the

purpose of implementing the Mechanical Licensing Act. Expenditures
from said fund shall be made upon warrants issued by the State
Treasurer against claims filed as prescribed by law with the
Director of State Finance for approval and payment.

SECTION 59. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1850.14, as
amended by Section 3, Chapter 251, 0.S.L. 1993 (59 0.S. Supp. 2000,
Section 1850.14), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1850.14 A. The Pepartment Construction Industries

Commission and the Committee of Mechanical Examiners shall act as

the Mechanical Hearing Board and shall comply with the provisions of

Article II of the Administrative Procedures Act+—Seetion309 et seq-

=N

1 aboma
+tahoma

7K £ +h Al
Fo—o+—++ }

T

Q4 ot
[ S & ay ey

B. The Mechanical Hearing Board may, upon its own motion, and
shall, upon written complaint filed by any person, investigate the
business transactions of any mechanical contractor, mechanical

journeyman, mechanical apprentice or mechanical firm. The

D
g

paremenrt Commission shall suspend or revoke or may refuse to issue

or renew any license or registration under the Mechanical Licensing
Act for any of the following:

1. Making a material misstatement in the application for a
license or registration, or the renewal of a license or

registration;

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 57



2. ©btain Obtaining any license or registration by false or
fraudulent representation;

3. Loaning or allowing the use of such license by any other
person or illegally using a license;

4. Demonstrating incompetence to act as a mechanical journeyman
or mechanical contractor;

5. Violating any provisions of the Mechanical Licensing Act, or

any ruleq—regutatien or order prescribed by the Beaxrd Commission

pursuant to the provisions of the Mechanical Licensing Act; or

6. Willfully failing to perform normal business obligations
without justifiable cause.

C. Any person whose license or registration has been revoked by
the Mechanical Hearing Board may apply for a new license one (1)
year from the date of such revocation.

D. DNotwithstanding any other provision of law, a political
subdivision of this state that has adopted a nationally recognized
mechanical code and appointed an inspector pursuant to Section

1850.12 er——Seetion—1031%

aqr

seg- of this title or pursuant to the

Oklahoma Inspectors Act for such work shall have jurisdiction over

the interpretation of said code and the installation of all

mechanical work done in that political subdivision, subject to the

provisions of the Oklahoma Inspectors Act+—Seetion—303+——etseg—of

tHe—50—-ef—+ fwtes. Provided, a state inspector may
work directly with a mechanical contractor, mechanical Jjourneyman,
mechanical apprentice or mechanical firm in such a locality if a
violation of the code creates an immediate threat to life or health.
E. In the case of a complaint about, investigation of, or
inspection of any license, registration, permit or mechanical work

in any political subdivision of this state which has not adopted a

nationally recognized mechanical code and appointed an inspector

ar

pursuant to Section 1850.12 er—Seetion—303%+

seg— of this title or

pursuant to the Oklahoma Inspectors Act for such work, the

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 58



Heatth Commission shall have jurisdiction over such

matters.
F. 1. No indiwvidual, business, company, corporation,

association, limited liability company, or other entity subject to

the provisions of Seetieon+850-1+—+et—seg—ofthis—+title the

Mechanical Licensing Act shall install, modify or alter mechanical

systems in any incorporated area of this state which has not adopted

a nationally recognized mechanical code and appointed an inspector

ar

pursuant to Section 1850.12 er——Seetion—3033+

seg= of this title or

pursuant to the Oklahoma Inspectors Act for such work without

providing notice of such mechanical work to the Ceommissioner—of

Heatth Commission. A notice form for reproduction by an individual

or entity required to make such notice shall be provided by the

Comm- oo o nAar £
it oo TOTICT E=

Heatth Commission upon request.

2. Notice to the cemmissienrer—eofHeatth Commission pursuant to

this subsection shall not be required for minor repair or
maintenance performed according to the mechanical equipment
manufacturer's instructions or of any petroleum refinery or its
research facilities.

3. Enforcement of this subsection is authorized pursuant to

TT

Seetion—1850-1——+et £+e the Mechanical Licensing Act,

VoV
A o

or under authority granted to the Cemmissienereof Heatth Commission.

SECTION 60. AMENDATORY Section 13, Chapter 293, 0.S.L.
1994 (59 0.S. Supp. 2000, Section 1850.16), is amended to read as
follows:

Section 1850.16 A. 1. There is hereby created the Oklahoma
State Mechanical Installation Code Variance and Appeals Board. The
Variance and Appeals Board shall hear testimony and shall review
sufficient technical data submitted by an applicant to substantiate
the proposed installation of any material, assembly or manufacturer-
engineered components, equipment or system that is not specifically

prescribed by an appropriate installation code, an industry

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 59



consensus standard or fabricated or installed according to
recognized and generally accepted good engineering practices, where
no ordinance or regulation of a governmental subdivision applies.

If it is determined that the evidence submitted is satisfactory
proof of performance for the proposed installation, the Variance and
Appeals Board shall approve such alternative, subject to the
requirements of the appropriate installation code. Applications for
the use of an alternative material or method of construction shall

-7
feadt

be submitted in writing to the State Commissioner—of

H

Construction Industries Commission for approval prior to use.

Applications shall be accompanied by a filing fee, not to exceed
Fifty Dollars ($50.00), as set by rule of the State Board eof Heatth

Commission.

2. The Variance and Appeals Board shall also hear appeals from

contractors, licensed by the Seeupatienat Fieensing—Service—of—+th

State bepartment—eof Health Commission, and any person who has

ownership interest in or is in responsible charge of the design of
or work on the installation, who contest the DBepartment's

Commission's interpretation of the state's model mechanical

installation code as applied to a particular installation. Such
appeals shall be based on a claim that:
a. the true intent of the installation code has been
incorrectly interpreted,
b. the provisions of the code do not fully apply, or
c. an equal or better form of installation is proposed.
Such appeals to the Variance and Appeals Board shall be made in

writing to the State Commissioner of Hesalth Commission within

fourteen (14) days after a code interpretation or receipt of written
notice of the alleged code violation by the licensed contractor.
B. The Variance and Appeals Board shall consist of the State

CoammT oo 0~ N £
A>3 33 e e e e s o e T

Health—orhis—er—her designated representative of

the Commission and the following members who, except for the State

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 60



Fire Marshal or designee, shall be appointed by the ECommissiener

Commission from a list of names submitted by the professional

organizations of the professions represented on the Board and who

shall serve at the pleasure of the Cemmissiener Commission:

1. Two members shall be appointed from the Committee of
Mechanical Examiners; one shall be a contractor with five (5) years
of experience and one shall be a journeyman with five (5) years of
experience;

2. One member shall be a registered design professional who is
a registered architect with at least ten (10) years of experience,
five (5) of which shall have been in responsible charge of work;

3. One member shall be a registered design professional with at
least ten (10) years of structural engineering or architectural
experience, five (5) of which shall have been in responsible charge
of work;

4. One member shall be a registered design professional with
mechanical or plumbing engineering experience; provided, such member
shall have at least ten (10) years of experience, five (5) of which
shall have been in responsible charge of work;

5. One member shall be a registered design professional with
electrical engineering experience; provided, such member shall have
at least ten (10) years of experience, five (5) of which shall have
been in responsible charge of work; and

6. One member shall be the State Fire Marshal or a designee of
the State Fire Marshal.

Any member serving on the Board on January 1, 2002, may continue

to serve on the Board until a replacement is appointed by the

Commission.

C. Members, except the Coemmissiener designee of the Commission

and the State Fire Marshal, +heCommissieonerls—and—State—Fir

Marshal'ls or the designated representatives representative of the

State Fire Marshal, and employees of the Bepartment Commission,

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 61



shall be reimbursed for travel expenses pursuant to the State Travel

Reimbursement Act+—Seetieon 5060t —ect——seg—of Fitle—F4of the Oklahoma

Statutes, from the revolving fund created pursuant to Section

1850.13 of F+de50 of +theOklaheoma—Statutes this title.

D. The Variance and Appeals Board shall meet after the

Commissioner Commission receives proper application for a wvariance,

accompanied by the filing fee, or proper notice of an appeal, as
provided in subsection A of this section.

E The Qt 4+ Comma o o g noxr £ 21+ r  + Comma o o g Nnar ! o
. A2 Tt Do o T Ot ic T T o Tttty T CIT Tt oo o T Orc o

designated representative of the Commission, shall serve as chair of

the Variance and Appeals Board. A majority of the members of the
Variance and Appeals Board shall constitute a guorum for the
transaction of the business of the Board.

SECTION 61. AMENDATORY Section 14, Chapter 405, 0.S.L.
1999 (59 0.S. Supp. 2000, Section 1860), is amended to read as

follows:

Section 1860. A. The State bepaortment—eof Health Construction

Industries Commission shall offer examinations for temporary

journeyman plumber, temporary journeyman electrician, and temporary
mechanical journeyman at least once every thirty (30) days following
a declaration by the Governor of this state of a state of emergency
in response to a disaster involving the destruction of dwelling
units and shall continue do so for at least six (6) months following
the declaration.

B. The temporary journeyman examinations shall be neither less
stringent nor more stringent than examinations for regular
journeyman licenses in this state.

C. No applicant for any temporary journeyman license shall be
allowed more than one opportunity to take the temporary Jjourneyman
examination.

D. No temporary journeyman license shall be extended or

renewed. Upon expiration of the temporary Jjourneyman license, the

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 62



license holder shall be ineligible to work as a journeyman in this
state unless qualified under other provisions of law.

SECTION 62. Sections 1 through 5 of this act shall become
effective July 1, 2001.

SECTION 63. Sections 6 through 61 of this act shall become
effective January 1, 2002.

SECTION 64. It being immediately necessary for the preservation
of the public peace, health and safety, an emergency is hereby
declared to exist, by reason whereof this act shall take effect and

be in full force from and after its passage and approval.

48-1-6344 SCE 6/12/15

Reqg. No. 6344 Page 63



	Apprentice Registration
	Fee 15.00

