ENROLLED HOUSE
BILL NO. 1319 By: Fields and Roach of the
House

and

Long and Snyder of the
Senate

An Act relating to professions and occupations;
providing short title; creating the Construction
Industries Commission; stating regulatory authority
over certain trades; providing for membership,
appointments, qualifications, terms of office,
vacancies and removal from office; providing for
meetings, quorum, officers and duties; requiring
compliance with certain acts; requiring members and
certain employees be bonded; clarifying liability of
members and providing for certain expenses; stating
powers and duties; providing for promulgation of
rules and making certain former rules, orders and
actions valid until certain action by Commission;
stating additional powers and authority; providing
for transfer of certain powers, duties,
responsibilities, employees, records, fund balances,
encumbrances and obligations; providing for Interim
Executive Director; amending 59 0.S. 1991, Sections
1001, 1002, as amended by Section 1, Chapter 236,
O0.S.L. 1993, Section 1, Chapter 293, 0.S.L. 1994,
1003, as last amended by Section 1, Chapter 405,
O0.5.L. 1999, 1004, as amended by Section 1, Chapter
63, 0.S.L. 1996, 1006, Section 2, Chapter 405, 0.S.L.
1999, 1007, 1008, as amended by Section 3, Chapter
405, 0.S.L. 1999, 1010, as last amended by Section 1,
Chapter 353, 0.S.L. 1997, Section 3, Chapter 236,
O0.5.L. 1993, 1011, 1013, as amended by Section 4,
Chapter 405, 0.S.L. 1999, 1014, 1018, as amended by
Section 2, Chapter 236, 0.S.L. 1993, 1020, Section 3,
Chapter 293, 0.S.L. 1994, 1031, 1032, 1033, 1034,
1035, 1036, as amended by Section 2, Chapter 9,
0.S.L. 1995, 1037, 1039, 1041, 1042, 1044, 1680,
1681, as last amended by Section 1, Chapter 155,
O0.5.L. 1994, Section 4, Chapter 293, 0.S.L. 1994,
1682, as last amended by Section 5, Chapter 405,
O0.5.L. 1999, 1683, as last amended by Section 3,
Chapter 318, 0.S.L. 1996, 1685, Section 6, Chapter
405, 0.S.L. 1999, 1686, 1688, as last amended by
Section 8, Chapter 405, 0.S.L. 1999, 1689, as last
amended by Section 4, Chapter 353, 0.S.L. 1997, 1691,
1694, as last amended by Section 7, Chapter 155,
O0.5.L. 1994, 1696, as amended by Section 9, Chapter
155, O0.S.L. 1994, Section 7, Chapter 293, 0.S.L.
1994, 1850.1, 1850.2, as last amended by Section 10,
Chapter 405, 0.S.L. 1999, 1850.3, Section 9, Chapter
293, O0.S.L. 1994, 1850.4 and 1850.5, as last amended



by Sections 10 and 11, Chapter 293, 0.S.L. 1994,
1850.7, 1850.8, as last amended by Section 11,
Chapter 405, 0.S.L. 1999, 1850.9, as amended by
Section 13, Chapter 405, 0.S.L. 1999, 1850.13, as
amended by Section 9, Chapter 236, 0.S.L. 1993,
1850.14, as amended by Section 3, Chapter 251, 0.S.L.
1993, Section 13, Chapter 293, 0.S.L. 1994 and
Section 14, Chapter 405, O0.S.L. 1999 (59 0.S. Supp.
1999, Sections 1002, 1002.1, 1003, 1004, 1006.1,
1008, 1010, 1010.1, 1013, 1018, 1021.1, 1036, 1681,
1681.1, 1682, 1683, 1685.1, 1688, 1689, 1694, 1690,
1697, 1850.2, 1850.3a, 1850.4, 1850.5, 1850.8,
1850.9, 1850.13, 1850.14, 1850.16 and 1860), which
relate to licensure and regulation of plumbing,
electrical, and mechanical trades and building and
construction inspectors; modifying language to
conform with transfer of regulatory authority over
such trades from the State Board of Health to
Construction Industries Commission; deleting obsolete
language; clarifying language and certain references;
modifying appointing authority and providing for
continuation of service of certain committee members;
modifying gender references; making certain
provisions consistent with Administrative Procedures
Act; amending 59 0.S. 1991, Section 858-703, as last
amended by Section 1, Chapter 144, 0.S.L. 1994 (59
0.S5. Supp. 1999, Section 858-703), which relates to
the Oklahoma Certified Real Estate Appraiser Act;
modifying definitions; amending 74 0.S. 1991, Section
324.11a, as last amended by Section 1, Chapter 42,
0.S.L. 1997 (74 O0.S. Supp. 1999, Section 324.11a),
which relates to smoke detectors; modifying types of
buildings and structures required to have make
detectors; providing for codification; providing for
noncodification; providing effective dates; and
declaring an emergency.

BE IT ENACTED BY THE PEOPLE OF THE STATE OF OKLAHOMA:

SECTION 1. NEW LAW A new section of law to be codified
in the Oklahoma Statutes as Section 1000.1 of Title 59, unless there
is created a duplication in numbering, reads as follows:

Sections 1 through 4 of this act shall be known and may be cited
as the "Construction Industries Commission Act".

SECTION 2. NEW LAW A new section of law to be codified
in the Oklahoma Statutes as Section 1000.2 of Title 59, unless there
is created a duplication in numbering, reads as follows:

A. The Construction Industries Commission is hereby created to
continue until July 1, 2006, in accordance with the provisions of
the Oklahoma Sunset Law. Beginning January 1, 2001, the Commission
shall regulate the plumbing, electrical, mechanical, and fire
sprinkler industries and building and construction inspectors
through the powers and duties set forth in the Construction

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 2



Industries Commission Act and in the respective licensing acts for
such trades.

B. 1. The Commission shall be composed of twelve (12) members
appointed by the Governor with the advice and consent of the Senate,
as follows:

a. two members shall have at least ten (10) years'
experience in the plumbing trade, of which one shall
be a plumbing contractor and one shall be a journeyman
plumber,

b. two members shall have at least ten (10) years'
experience in the electrical trade, of which one shall
be an electrical contractor and one shall be a
journeyman electrician,

C. two members shall have at least ten (10) years'
experience in the mechanical trade, of which one shall
be a mechanical contractor and one shall be a
mechanical journeyman,

d. one member shall have at least ten (10) years'
experience as a building and construction inspector,

e. two members shall have at least ten (10) years'
experience in the fire sprinkler trade, of which one
shall be a fire sprinkler contractor and one shall be
a journeyman sprinkler fitter,

f. one member shall represent the public and shall not
practice, have practiced, or be licensed to practice
any of the trades regulated by the Commission nor be
employed by or be related by blood or marriage within
the third degree to any person who practices, has
practiced, or is licensed to practice any such trades,

g. one member shall be designated by the Board of
Governors of the Licensed Architects and Landscape
Architects of Oklahoma, and

h. one member shall be designated by the State Board of
Registration for Professional Engineers and Land
sSurveyors.

2. Except for members appointed pursuant to subparagraphs g and

h of paragraph 1 of this subsection, members shall be appointed for
terms of four (4) years; provided, of those members initially
appointed to the Commission, five members shall be appointed for
two-year terms, beginning September 1, 2000, and five members shall
be appointed for four-year terms, beginning September 1, 2000, as
designated by the Governor. Members shall continue in office until
a successor is appointed by the Governor. The Governor shall fill
all vacancies and unexpired terms in the same manner as the original
appointment of the member whose position is to be filled. Such
members may be removed by the Governor for cause.

SECTION 3. NEW LAW A new section of law to be codified

in the Oklahoma Statutes as Section 1000.3 of Title 59, unless there
is created a duplication in numbering, reads as follows:

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 3



A. 1. The Construction Industries Commission shall organize
immediately after September 1, 2000, and annually thereafter, by
electing from among its members a president, a vice-president, and a
secretary-treasurer. The Commission shall hold regularly scheduled
meetings at least once each quarter at a time and place determined
by the Commission and may hold such special meetings, emergency
meetings, or continued or reconvened meetings as found by the
Commission to be necessary. A majority of the members of the
Commission shall constitute a quorum for the transaction of
business.

2. The president shall preside at meetings of the Commission,
set the agenda, sign orders and other required documents, coordinate
Commission activities, and perform such other duties as may be
prescribed by the Commission.

3. The vice-president shall perform the duties of the president
during the absence or disability of the president and shall perform
such other duties as may be prescribed by the Commission.

4. The secretary-treasurer or the executive director at the
discretion of the Commission shall:

a. keep a record of all proceedings of the Commission and
certify to actions of the Commission,

b. receive and deposit all monies received by the
Commission in the appropriate revolving funds,

c. submit, at the first regular meeting of the Commission
after the end of each fiscal year, a full itemized
report of the receipts and disbursements for the prior
fiscal year, showing the amount of funds on hand, and

d. perform such other duties as are prescribed in this
act or as may be prescribed by the Commission.

B. The Commission shall act in accordance with the provisions
of the Oklahoma Open Meeting Act, the Oklahoma Open Records Act, and
the Administrative Procedures Act.

C. All members of the Commission and such employees as
determined by the Commission shall be bonded as required by Sections
85.26 through 85.31 of Title 74 of the Oklahoma Statutes.

D. The liability of any member or employee of the Commission
acting within the scope of Commission duties or employment shall be
governed by the Governmental Tort Claims Act.

E. Members of the Commission shall serve without compensation
but shall be reimbursed for all actual and necessary expenses
incurred in the performance of their duties in accordance with the
State Travel Reimbursement Act.

SECTION 4. NEW LAW A new section of law to be codified

in the Oklahoma Statutes as Section 1000.4 of Title 59, unless there
is created a duplication in numbering, reads as follows:

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 4



A. 1. Beginning September 1, 2000, pursuant to and in
compliance with Article I of the Administrative Procedures Act, the
Construction Industries Commission shall have the power to adopt,
amend, repeal, and promulgate rules as may be necessary to regulate
the plumbing, electrical, mechanical, and fire sprinkler industries
and building and construction inspectors. Such rules shall not
become effective prior to January 1, 2001.

2. Beginning January 1, 2001, the Commission shall have the
power to enforce the provisions of the Construction Industries
Commission Act, The Plumbing License Law of 1955, the Oklahoma
Inspectors Act, the Electrical License Act, and the Mechanical
Licensing Act.

3. In addition to rules promulgated by the Construction
Industries Commission, rules promulgated by the State Board of
Health prior to January 1, 2001, shall be the rules of the
Commission and shall continue in effect until such rules are amended
or repealed by rules promulgated by the Commission.

4. Any order made or action taken prior to January 1, 2001, by
the State Board of Health, the State Department of Health, or the
State Commissioner of Health pursuant to the provisions of, or rules
promulgated pursuant to, The Plumbing License Law of 1955, the
Oklahoma Inspectors Act, the Electrical License Act, or the
Mechanical Licensing Act shall be considered valid and in effect
unless rescinded by the Commission.

B. The Commission may:

1. Exercise all incidental powers and duties which are
necessary to effectuate the provisions of The Plumbing License Law
of 1955, the Oklahoma Inspectors Act, the Electrical License Act,
and the Mechanical Licensing Act;

2. Serve as a code variance and appeals board for the trades it
regulates which do not have statutory code variance and appeals
boards;

3. Order or subpoena the attendance of witnesses, the
inspection of records and premises, and the production of relevant
books and papers for the investigation of matters that may come
before the Commission;

4. Lease office space from the State Department of Health for
the purpose of operating and maintaining a state office and lease or
purchase office furniture, equipment, and supplies;

5. Employ an executive director and such other personnel as may
be necessary, subject to statutory full-time-equivalent (FTE)
limits, and fix and pay their salaries or wages;

6. Employ legal counsel, as needed, to represent the Commission
in all legal matters;

7. Employ one or more investigators, as needed and subject to

statutory FTE limits, for the purpose of investigating written
complaints which may come before the Commission; and

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 5



8. Make such other expenditures as may be necessary in the
performance of its duties.

C. Effective January 1, 2001, all powers, duties,
responsibilities, employees, records, fund balances, encumbrances,
and obligations of the State Board of Health, the State Department
of Health, and the State Commissioner of Health relating to the
regulation of the plumbing, electrical, mechanical, and fire
sprinkler industries and building and construction inspectors are
hereby transferred to the Construction Industries Commission.

SECTION 5. NEW LAW A new section of law not to be
codified in the Oklahoma Statutes reads as follows:

Not later than July 1, 2000, the Governor shall appoint an
Interim Executive Director to serve the Construction Industries
Commission until the Commission employs an Executive Director. For
the months of July and August 2000, the Interim Executive Director
shall be paid from funds available to the State Department of
Health. Effective September 1, 2000, the Interim Executive
Director, and thereafter the Executive Director, shall be paid from
funds available to the Commission.

SECTION 6. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1001, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1001. Hhis—aet Sections 1001 through 1023.1 of this
title shall be known and may be cited as "The Plumbing License Law
of 1955”7 .x

SECTION 7. AMENDATORY 59 0.S5. 1991, Section 1002, as
amended by Section 1, Chapter 236, 0.S.L. 1993 (59 0.S. Supp. 1999,
Section 1002), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1002. A The State Beoard—ef Health;—3rn Ppursuance—of
EiE SR N SNNE NI BT VNN 3 NG £ or1tr~exza oo Y\ o + Tt oaraat o £ + 1 hreaal+h
T \j T [ S @y tJUVV - A\ - Qut./ - o TIUTT A4 - CIT T C - [Saye) A\ - CIT T O CIT
P I B = £+ 1 P £ +hd o oot Al N S N PO [ S
sy swy [ S N S Y g T o LT C 1T TThO g CTITT 1O A_)L.(_A.L.\_,, [Eyyaw s VO T A_)(.A-J-J-—LL-(.A-J—_Y
conditions—under whiceh they+iver Construction Industries Commission
is hereby authorized, empowered, and directed;—through—the

Commissioner—of—Heatthy to make, prescribe, enforce, amend, and
repeal rules amnd—regulatiens governing the following:

1. The examination and licensing of persons desiring or
intending to engage in the business, trade or calling of master
prumber—plumbing contractory or journeyman plumbery—the;

2. The registering of and issuing of certificates to persons
desiring or intending to work or act as a plumber's apprentices—the;

3. The establishment and levying of administrative finesy—the;
4. The initiation of disciplinary proceedingsy—the;

5. The requesting of prosecution of and initiation of
injunctive proceedings against any person who violates any of the
provisions of £his—aet The Plumbing License Law of 1955 or any rule
promulgated pursuant to this—aet;—and—te—estabtish The Plumbing
License Law of 1955; and

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 6



6. The establishment of bonding requirements for the issuance
of a license as a plumbing contractory; provided, such rules ang
regutations shall not be inconsistent with the terms and conditions
hereinafter provided.

B. Such bonding requirements shall allow the filing of cash or
a certificate of deposit in lieu of a bond. A state bond or cash or
certificate of deposit filed in lieu of a bond and which is posted
pursuant to the provisions of this section shall be deemed
sufficient to meet the requirements of any municipality, provided
that a copy of said bond or documentation of cash or certificate of
deposit filed in lieu of a bond shall be filed with any municipality
in which the licensee does work as a plumbing contractor. A copy of
the bond or documentation of cash or certificate of deposit filed in
lieu of a bond shall be filed with the municipality prior to the

commencement of any such work by the licensee. TheState BRBeard—oef
Toaal+rh oh 11 at bl 2ol N Ao A Moaat+roar Dlasminag e~y T 2 N o ESANE
I L CIT [ Y& =y = oo COX T IO IT U OISl J R 4 5 NYWD Iy Ul e .LLLAJ.LI.LJLLLKJ 1T I T TITTIO T [ S
PRk NP NG ] T Nl b~ g~ 2 77 T~ 90 A ~ 11 nliimha e~y T4 N~~~ IR
OTTC 1T C U1 S i S N T TOOTITUTITTE WIT I T /A" S S - i S R AW § | € R t/_L\AlLlJ\J_LJ.J.v i S 1T1TO =3 i S
o 13 cana DT NI NP NS S TN B ~NE NP e
1T [ Sy TS 1T aTT aOTTITOT T TS IO
SECTION 8. AMENDATORY Section 1, Chapter 293, 0.S.L.

1994 (59 0.S. Supp. 1999, Section 1002.1), is amended to read as
follows:

Section 1002.1 The StateCommissiener—ofHealtth Construction
Industries Commission shall establish by rule a process for the
formal review of the plans and specifications for a project prior to
bid dates for the project to ensure that the project plans and
specifications are in conformance with applicable plumbing,
electrical, mechanical, and fire sprinkler installation codes. The
rule shall provide that the review shall be completed in a timely
manner, not to exceed fourteen (14) calendar days from the date of
the submission of a completed application for review which is
accompanied by the review fee not to exceed Two Hundred Dollars
($200.00) to be established by the rule. Upon completion of the
review, the plans and specifications shall be returned to the
applicant with documentation indicating either approval of plans and
specifications which are in compliance with the applicable codes, or
modifications which must be made to bring the plans and
specifications into conformance. Submission of such plans and
specifications for review by the Bepartment Commission shall be
voluntary.

SECTION 9. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1003, as
last amended by Section 1, Chapter 405, 0.S.L. 1999 (59 0.S. Supp.
1999, Section 1003), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1003. As used in The Plumbing License Law of 1955:

1. " " "Commission" means the State Beardeof Health
Construction Industries Commission;

2 WA~ 2 o o nearW mAaarae 1 C+ N+ Comma oo noaxr £ IaT1+h .
. A2 1111 5 S o o i W s ) o oo — Tttt [CAICnw ASZAJ 1111 1 5 M I i W i ) - SN e S 5 ) & i i G s

3— "Committee" means the State Committee of Plumbing Examiners
appointed by the State Beard—eoefHeatth Construction Industries
Commission;

4-— 3. "Plumbing Hearing Board" means the State Plumbing Hearing
Board which shall consist of +he—State Commissioner of Heatth a

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 7



designee of the Construction Industries Commission, as chair, and
the members of the State Committee of Plumbing Examiners;

5+ 4. "Apprentice" or "plumber's apprentice" means any person
sixteen (16) years of age or older who, as his—er—her the principal
occupation of the person, is engaged in learning and assisting in
the installation of plumbing under the direct supervision of a
licensed journeyman plumber or plumbing contractor;

6~ 5. "Journeyman plumber" means any person other than a master
plumber or plumbing contractor who engages in or works at the actual
installation, alteration, repair and/or renovation of plumbing;

= 6. "Temporary journeyman plumber" means any person other
than a person permanently licensed as a journeyman plumber, master
plumber, or plumbing contractor in this state who meets the
temporary licensure requirements of Section 2 1006.1 of this =aet
title;

8+~ 7. "Master plumber" is a term used and defined under laws
which have been repealed. A person formerly known as a master
plumber is henceforth to be known as a "plumbing contractor" as
herein defined in this section;

9 8. "Plumbing contractor" means;—anc—is—hereby defined—to—bey
any person who is skilled in the planning, superintending, and
practical installation of plumbing and who is familiar with the
laws+ and rules—and—regutations governing the same. This
definition may be construed to mean any person who has qualified and
is licensed under £his—aet The Plumbing License Law of 1955 as a
plumbing contractor, who may operate as an individual, a firm,
partnership, limited liability company, or corporation, or other
legal entity to engage in the business of plumbing, or the business
of contracting to do plumbing, or furnish labor or materials or both
for the installation, repair, maintenance, or renovation of plumbing
according to the requirements of £his—aet The Plumbing License Law
of 1955;

+6~ 9. "Plumbing" means, and includes:

a. all piping, fixtures, appurtenances and appliances
for, and in connection with, a supply of water within
or adjacent to any building, structure, or conveyance,
on the premises and to the connection with a water
main or other source of supply,

b. all piping, fixtures, appurtenances and appliances for
sanitary drainage or storm drainage facilities,
including venting systems for such facilities, within
or adjacent to any building, structure, or conveyance,
on the premises and to the connection with a public
disposal system or other acceptable terminal, and

c. the installation, repair, maintenance and renovation
of all piping, fixtures, appurtenances and appliances
for a supply of water, or for the disposal of waste
water, liquid waste, or sewage within or adjacent to
any building, structure, or conveyance, on the
premises and to the source of supply of water or point
of disposal of wastes; and

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 8



34— 10. "Variance and Appeals Board" means the Oklahoma State
Plumbing Installation Code Variance and Appeals Board.

SECTION 10. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1004, as
amended by Section 1, Chapter 63, 0.S.L. 1996 (59 0.S. Supp. 1999,
Section 1004), 1is amended to read as follows:

Section 1004. A. The Oklahoma State Committee of Plumbing
Examiners is hereby re-created to continue until July 1, 2002, in
accordance with the provisions of the Oklahoma Sunset Law, as
provided by Sections 3901 et seq. of Title 74 of the Oklahoma
Statutes, and shall consist of six (6) members, each of whom shall
be a citizen of the United States, a resident of this state, and
reside in a different Congressional District of this state. Members
Beginning January 1, 2001, as the terms of members serving on the
Committee on such date expire, members of the Committee shall be
appointed by the State Beard—ef Health Construction Industries
Commission which may also remove them for cause. They will hold
office for terms of two (2) years, or until their successors are
appointed. Two members of the Committee shall have had at least
five (5) years' practical experience as a licensed master plumber
ardter or plumbing contractor, and two members shall have had at
least five (5) years' practical experience as a licensed journeyman
plumber. One member shall be a plumbing inspector selected from
lists of names submitted from plumbing inspection industries and one
member shall be a lay person. Whenever appointments of initial,
new, or replacement plumbing members of the Committee are to be
made, the State Beard—efHealth Commission shall choose them only
from lists of at least three names to be furnished whenever needed
as follows:

1. Master plumber amdfer or plumbing contractor member - lists
to be furnished by associated plumbing and heating contractors of
this state;

2. Journeyman plumber member - lists to be furnished by state
pipe trades associations;

3. One licensed master plumber amdfexr or plumbing contractor
who is not a member of an association of plumbing, heating, and
cooling contractors of this state; and

4. One licensed journeyman plumber who is not a member of a
state pipe trades association.

B. Duties of the Committee shall be to serve the Commissiener
Commission in an advisory capacity, to formulate rules pursuant to
#he The Plumbing kieensing License Law of 1955, and to assist and
advise the Pepartment Commission on the examination of applicants
for licenses as journeyman plumber amdfer or plumbing contractor, in
accordance with such rules and the terms and conditions hereof. A
majority of the Committee shall constitute a quorum for the
transaction of business.

C. Each examiner shall be reimbursed his—er—her for travel
expenses 1n accordance with the provisions of the State Travel
Reimbursement Act, Section 500.1 et seq. of Title 74 of the Oklahoma
Statutes.

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 9



1991, Section 1006, is

59 0.5S.

AMENDATORY

SECTION 11.
amended to read as follows

The Construction

o—Ihe Commiosstoner M.

Section 1006.
Industries Commission shall issue licenses to suweh persons who have

been certified by the cemmittee Commission as having successfully

passed sai+d the examination for journeyman plumber or plumbing

and who have paid the fees and have

as the case may be,
otherwise complied with the applicable requirements of £his—aet The

Plumbing License Law of 1955.

contractor,

ot 1 s

££
[ S

N,

Aasza Fram e A

(QN)

\

Tnat s
T3t

n

witEh1
Wttt

A\ e v

T/ Uy o L LU allh oL C

=Y

PN NP S

134

W+

n o

o

3

J e

PSR E
55t

ISEEE S

S

+ha o

cO

P4 11 3 iy i ) & N W E W

WL CIrfootT

=}

o

7

CIT

C—1IoT

o

oo CTy

CIT—o

31

T

E ST N EEE RN SNE EESW2r

g -

11N L
OrT

=AY

14

2N

NS
=9

£ +h o
g =

Ao+

Bl N S T

+ 1

il

n o

r o

C7 J A W B W R @

CIT IO

OTT

WITO

RN S AW ¥ yw)

I

~

EVSEE N EEE 0N 2N
PTroiotT

r ot
oo T o

o Stttz ] e s
o OOt PTramiotCT—OT
A s

=

n o

121

t/LL«LJ.lI.LJLll\j
ratrad +

Y T

whiaoh oo

WITLTCTT

S

o

T T

C2aY

T

o

n o

K

o g r

-

J oo

SN

Nt o~ A s

CUoUTTC 1O T TUI

o

COWIT oL

A\

LI UL oULT™T

+ 1
OTTt

T

oS O
Wk

m~ 2
oo T

AEEWS
ISESASASICASASAS aupe yo)

T o

+ha o

nt o

m

TTr

A oz +h P A

o

hosz

A
o
Qo2 A

o o

A\

SASE=ES TICTOo

WL CIT CIT

T W IO =

WITO It v

1

’

CAIC R

CIIT—o
+ha o

P
\.1LA.LO.L\—

+r
T

el En N N 12
| S

A

LN 2

mirat
1313 Y Sa o

n o

o

K

BNy

\—a

oo LT L Lo TTIIo

AT T

CTITLT O

RN B NN

bttt g~
\JJ\JL.,(.A._LJ.J._LJ.J.v (=5

ENEE VNPT I PN
(=1 LI OO T TTITC

o

3

oo o 1 £
T

1

o

-

O

o o T Cy

=3 54 A= =S e 2 3 g e ay ) A

T T CTITTrotT

O CCc T

o, ol P
- [ S

Aasza Fram e A

TAOYARY

\

1Tt
Tt

n

Wi tEh1
W I CIrit

A\ L@ oy

oV

Ay} Uy o L LU gl o C

o £
& g Sy

=Y
+ 4+

ITOoOT

PN VNN

13

BRI 2

n o

o
T T

K

J oo

+r

it =~

BNy

+h o

| a

W T CITOOC CXRXTUlltrIita C TOUTT

=}

o

TIT oot

L Av nw

o Ty

CTITLT O

17 +h oo Al (’7 [ANAVARY

+h o

o Fravn Ao o

n

o

A ANI

cCIIrioT oo

CIITort CWT

OO

L
£

-
IS A

COWIT S OT

T OTIT

EENSAwE ¥ yw)

I

Sz

ot +1
CIITTaCT

+r
T

Coamma oo g A

+ + 1

Yz

PN S R PN

T 1\

o

ERA2N

n

el ot s

TTT

CUTIIIIT D OO L UTT

TTT

\—a

ot Ll oLdadcTtUuUly

WITO  O1I1TOW

pYMPU LT T LUILT

n
OTT

L
T TTOGC—0OT

L

-

ENEAA I SPENE

BNy
acC

ol o [ pag £ orpa o
A\ 4 &y w A -

 —

+h
TIt

R
PR

[© 1 1 A W S >

CTITLT O

oV

OTT

W

RN

falal

hitad

=

n

WL LN S
u\.,\.,ut/u LUy

+ 1

CIT

n

N

neraorad
IZACESACASAT

+ 1

+

o

3z

o

DT oI oo

crrooc O

i

CIT Oy

IS

&

el

ot N~ s
PTronnoTity  CcoUlrcrac coLly

E S N I ET2N SNE

rnaszman ] 1 A e v mactay el e
TToTto oL T T

=

&y

57—

PO

o ©

7

DALLSEES

BT

T o

PICI T S SN L 2
W LT CTT

m~ 2
oo T

o

+ 1
OTTt

o

-
IO

masz AW 2 2Y
Torrr

el

CIT

A=

T W IO

ll.l(_A._Y T 12 AR T Y4
£ o
.

CIT

PN

mant o

PRSI
J_\_,\iu_l_J_\./lll\./J.l )

r

O C T

CIT 1O

It shall

All licenses shall be nontransferable amd—3%.
be unlawful for any holder of a license under £his—aet The Plumbing

+eb- B.

License Law of 1955 to loan or allow the use of such license by any

except as specifically provided

firm or corporation,

in #his—aet The Plumbing License Law of 1955.

other person,

O0.S.L.

Chapter 405,
is amended to read as

Section 2,

Section 1006.1),

AMENDATORY

1999,

SECTION 12.

Supp .

(59 0.s.

1999

follows

year of the date the Governor

(1)

Within one

A.

Section 1006.1
of this state declares a state of emergency in response to a

disaster involving the destruction of dwelling units,

the State

Construction Industries Commission shall

issue a distinctively colored,

T+
O CIT

T

£V £ 17
T —OT

n

Comma o2
oM oo T=0TT

temporary journeyman
year after the date of

nonrenewable,

(1)

the declaration to any person who is currently licensed as a

plumber license which shall expire one
journeyman plumber by another state and who

days of beginning journeyman

Submits, within ten (10)
plumber's work in this state,

1.

an application and fee for a

4

journeyman plumber's examination

Takes and passes the examination at the first opportunity

2.
thereafter offered by the Cemmissiener Commission

and

4

Page 10

H. B. NO. 1319

ENR.



3. Pays a temporary journeyman plumber's license fee of Twenty-
five Dollars ($25.00).

B. Nothing in this section shall be construed as prohibiting
any person from qualifying at any time for any other license by
meeting the requirements for the other license.

SECTION 13. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1007, 1is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1007. Application for examination, license anmdfer or
renewal of license shall be made to the cemmissiener Construction
Industries Commission in writing and, if required, on forms
furnished by the Cemmissiener Commission and shall be accompanied by
the proper fee.

SECTION 14. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1008, as
amended by Section 3, Chapter 405, 0.S.L. 1999 (59 0.S. Supp. 1999,
Section 1008), 1is amended to read as follows:

Section 1008. The following shall be the fees charged under The
Plumbing License Law of 1955 by the State Commissioner—ofHealth
Construction Industries Commission:

Initial fees

Plumbing Contractor's
Examination........oeeeiineennnnnnnnn $50.00

Journeyman Plumber's
Examination.......ii ittt enennnn 25.00

Plumbing Contractor's
I = o ¥ 50.00

Journeyman Plumber's
eI o] =Y o 1= 15.00

Apprentice Registration
Fee . i e e e 15.00

Renewal of Licenses (if made within
thirty (30) days after expiration)

Plumbing Contractor's
I I ] 0 o 50.00

Journeyman Plumber's
I I ] 0 o = 15.00
Y 15.00
Penalty for Delayed Renewal
Plumbing Contractor's

I oY o =T 1 10.00

Journeyman Plumber's
eI ] Y o = 5.00

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 11



SECTION 15. AMENDATORY 59 0.S5. 1991, Section 1010, as
last amended by Section 1, Chapter 353, 0.S.L. 1997 (59 0.S. Supp.
1999, Section 1010), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1010. A. The State Commissieoner—of Health designee of
the Construction Industries Commission, as chair, and the members of
the Oklahoma State Committee of Plumbing Examiners shall constitute
a Plumbing Hearing Board, which may on its own motion make
investigations and conduct hearings anmd. The Board may, on its own
motion or upon complaint in writing duly signed and verified by the
complainant, and upon not less than ten (10) days' notice to the
licensee, suspend any license issued under Seetieon 100+ —et seg—of
this—ti+tte The Plumbing License Law of 1955, and may revoke such
license in the manner hereinafter provided, if by clear and
convincing evidence it finds that the holder of the license has:

1. Made a material misstatement in the application for license
or renewal thereof;

2. Loaned or illegally used his—er—her the license;

3. Demonstrated incompetency to act as a journeyman plumber or
plumbing contractor, as the case may be;

4. Violated any provision of Seetion 1001l —et—seg—ofthis—+title
The Plumbing License Law of 1955, or any rule or order prescribed by
the Beaxrd Construction Industries Commission, or any ordinance or
regulation for the installation of plumbing made or enacted by a
city, town, or sewer commission by authority of Seetien 1001 et seq-
of—this—+titte The Plumbing License Law of 1955; or

5. Willfully and unreasonably failed to perform his or her
normal business obligations without justifiable cause.

B. A copy of the complaint with notice of the suspension of
license, if ordered by the Plumbing Hearing Board, shall be served
on the person complained against, and hkis—er—her the answer thereto
shall be filed in the time allowed for the filing of answers in
legal proceedings by the statutes of this state.

C. No order revoking a license shall be made until after a
public hearing set, held in accordance with the provisions of
Article II of the Administrative Procedures Act, by the Plumbing
Hearing Board which shall not be less than thirty (30) days and not
more than sixty (60) days after the date of notice of suspension.
The hearing shall be held at the place designated by the Plumbing
Hearing Board. The person complained against shall have the right
to be represented by counsel and to introduce any evidence in
defense. The conduct of the hearing shall be in accordance with
recognized rules of legal procedure and any member of the Plumbing
Hearing Board or a representative designated by the Plumbing Hearing
Board shall have authority to administer oaths and take testimony.

D. Any person whose license has been revoked may, after the
expiration of one (1) year from the date of such revocation, but not
before, apply for a new license.

E. ©Notwithstanding any other provision of law, a political

subdivision of this state that has adopted a nationally recognized
plumbing code and appointed an inspector pursuant to Section 1016 e=

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 12



Seetion—+03+—et——segs of this title or pursuant to the Oklahoma
Inspectors Act for such work shall have jurisdiction over the
interpretation of the code and the installation of all plumbing work
done in that political subdivision, subject to the provisions of the
Oklahoma Inspectors Act+—Seetion3631 et seg—of thistitle.
Provided, a state inspector may work directly with a plumbing
contractor or journeyman plumber in such a locality if a violation
of the code creates an immediate threat to life or health.

F. In the case of a complaint about, investigation of, or
inspection of any license, registration, permit or plumbing in any
political subdivision of this state which has not adopted a
nationally recognized plumbing code and appointed an inspector
pursuant to Section 1016 er—Seetion—3+63+—et——segs of this title or
pursuant to the Oklahoma Inspectors Act for such work, the State
Cemmissiener—of Health Construction Industries Commission shall have
jurisdiction over such matters.

G. 1. No individual, business, company, corporation, limited
liability company, association or other entity subject to the
provisions of Section 1001 et seq. of this title shall install,
modify or alter plumbing in any incorporated area of this state
which has not adopted a nationally recognized plumbing code and
appointed an inspector pursuant to Section 1016 er—Seetien—303+——-k
seg- of this title or pursuant to the Oklahoma Inspectors Act for
such work without providing notice of such plumbing to the State
cemmissieoner—ofHealth Construction Industries Commission. A notice
form for reproduction by an individual or entity required to make
such notice shall be provided by the State Commissioner of Health
Commission upon request.

2. Notice to the StateCommissioner—ofHealth Commission
pursuant to this subsection shall not be required for plumbing
maintenance or replacement of an existing plumbing device or
fixture, unless such device is gas fired, or of any petroleum
refinery or its research facilities.

3. Enforcement of this subsection is authorized pursuant to
Seetion—+001l—et—seg—of+this—+title The Plumbing License Law of 1955,
or under authority granted to the State Commissioner—ofHealth
Commission.

SECTION 16. AMENDATORY Section 3, Chapter 236, 0.S.L.
1993 (59 0.S. Supp. 1999, Section 1010.1), is amended to read as
follows:

Section 1010.1 A. 1In addition to other penalties provided by
law, if after a hearing in accordance with the provisions of Section
1010 of this title, the Plumbing Hearing Board shall find any person
to be in violation of any of the provisions of £his—aet The Plumbing
License Law of 1955, such person may be subject to an administrative
fine of not more than Five Hundred Dollars ($500.00) for each
violation. Each day a person is in violation of £his—aet The
Plumbing License Law of 1955 may constitute a separate violation.
The maximum fine will not exceed One Thousand Dollars ($1,000.00).
All administrative fines collected pursuant to the provisions of
this subsection shall be deposited in the fund established in
Section 1018 of this title. Administrative fines imposed pursuant
to this subsection shall be enforceable in the district courts of
this state.

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 13



B. The Plumbing Hearing Board may make application to the
appropriate court for an order enjoining the acts or practices
prohibited by £his—aet The Plumbing License Law of 1955, and upon a
showing by the Plumbing Hearing Board that the person has engaged in
any of the prohibited acts or practices, an injunction, restraining
order, or other order as may be appropriate shall be granted by the
court.

SECTION 17. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1011, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1011. An appeal from the decision of the Plumbing
Hearing Board upon the suspension or revocation of a license, or
upon any decision not specifically provided for in £his—aet The
Plumbing License Law of 1955, may be taken to the district court ef

+ 1 roo1 A~ £ + 1 N o o vtz Wy £ 9oy a1 Plarmihe
CTIT - [ w T L CTIT u\j\jJ__L A\ A8 t./uJ_ l__y AJ_Y _L_L_L_Lll\_j W LT CTIT T J__L\.zllll.U_Lll\_j

Aty DA PP - + 4 el K PR o]

& N S \j =y (=5 o Lo T (=5 T CTIT t—/t—/ = == = =, -y A\ S [=J | N e
area~a £ ~T 57 ot + + 1 PN EE N P BIC S SN P SN I SN N NN 1o + 1 I il’l
k)t/ [ S S (.A._L_L_Y [=J C A\ CTIT 3J_\J\AJ.J.ML_) \At/\JJ.J. Wil T o O T (_A.t/t/ & g =y Ju =y T T
accordance with the provisions of Article II of the Administrative
Procedures Act.

SECTION 18. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1013, as

amended by Section 4, Chapter 405, O0.S.L. 1999 (59 0.S. Supp. 1999,
Section 1013), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1013. The StateCommissiener—eofHealtth Construction
Industries Commission shall, upon proper application and payment of
fee, register as a plumber's apprentice, and shall issue a
certificate of registration to, a—persem—er persons who furnish
proof satisfactory to the Cemmissierner Commission that ke;——she;—o6%
they are sixteen (16) years of age or older and are enrolled in a
recognized school or training course for plumber apprentices, or
have arranged for employment as a plumber's apprentice with a
licensed plumbing contractor. The certificate of an apprentice
shall expire at the end of one (1) year from date of issuance, at
which time the Cemmissiener Commission may issue a renewal
certificate upon payment of the renewal fee.

SECTION 19. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1014, 1is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1014. Every holder of a license as a journeyman plumber
or plumbing contractor, or of a certificate of registration as a
plumber's apprentice, shall promptly notify the Commissiener
Construction Industries Commission of any change in kis business
address.

SECTION 20. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1018, as
amended by Section 2, Chapter 236, 0.S.L. 1993 (59 0.S. Supp. 1999,
Section 1018), 1is amended to read as follows:

Section 1018. All fees, administrative fines or payments of any
type eetteeted received by the Cemmissiener Construction Industries
Commission under £his—aet The Plumbing License Law of 1955 shall be

+ 1 Q+ LY N W-EEE2E X1
CIIC— oCcoctc T CTToouly WIT

a1 ad A4~ Tz 44 +heasxz ok o
POt TcTy TItcO cIICy ottt
"

h o
T
El

-
o -

deposited in a separate revolving fund in—trustandfeor uwse—-onty to

be designated the "Plumbing Licensing Revolving Fund" and are hereby

appropriated and may be expended by the ceommissioner—tomeet—altlt

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 14



Soancoaa A moad oo~ c ooz IR E R S I SNV S T IR 2o PR~ = 2N It At oA

LJ TS =] oL TTT oL IT UU(_A.J__Y e a [ S A A N W e 1T \_/(_A.J_J__Y_I_J.J.\j A\ AW I LT TT T CTTICT It
parpeses—of—Ethis—aet Commission for the purpose of implementing The
Plumbing License Law of 1955. The fHﬁds—afe—%e—be—expeﬁded—eﬁ%y
+h v~ Comma oo o nerVla b ~nd ot o N A A o + 12N ) £
L_,LlJ_\J\A.\le CTT T 10O T OUTT - AU CITO T 1T 2T C 1T UTT Sy Lw L& g = R Ly \Ak.) [ S N
ozl ner NAar ot 4o~ stmeanana anA 9y Ao gt za o 19t Ao S A A arza N
t./(J._YJ.Ll\j Ut./ J.(J.L_J.Ll\j ABCLLQC»_) AT =TT k/(_A.J._L_YJ.J.l\j oaT t/J.\J\jJ.(_ALLl»._) AT ATV I TTO
doaz~rn~a  + £ 4 » 1 £ A~ £ + 1 PN IR ET 2N SNE RN I B ANV EE P SIS N SN B S C ) =N i
A8 U_L\jl.l oL T [ S U R S W i - CTT [ S S (=5 _Y g CTT LJ_L\A.J.I.[J\J_LJ.J.\j _LJ.J.\J.\A.L._)L_,J__Y Sy Lw s LJ\A.J\J_L_L
mrderat an A2 £ 2+ Mh2 o oz 2~ S e th o Sondi i
\C AW J_UL_,(_A.J.J.\J._LJ.J.\j g LT TTT 15 J.I.l(_A._Y J S SR AW § I (_A.J.I.l\JJ.J.\j O CTT - LJ [N AN I S U W e =] o
12N Aot armanmn - v~ Comma oo 2 nerla A1 oyt o n ™A o n  anA
Py A8 C LS ) ) Ay A8 L_LJ.J.ULA\jLJ. CIT A7 5§ ) i S WD R S N i § - [=J |\ S S WD N L_J.ULL, LJJ. LJ(J.J.(J.L_J.ULL AT
Brint i e £ ol St 2 Ao bzl lat o r thor At o S
LJJ__LJ.J.L_,_LJ.J.\j g - \ju_LLA.L_,_I_uJ.J.U, [P\ i S L_,_I_J.J.u, 7 o CTT - \WAWAWRw N1 TTCTO I CTIT
ESE TSN PV 2N I 2= £ oo 1o + th oo naacod 2+ PN IEET2ON SNE IR CNPECRE IR 2o\ EE W e r
J_\A.J_J.l_Lk_)J.l_LJ.J.\j g LJ_L =] < CITT OO J.J.\ju\j oL J S CTT LJ_L\A.J.I.[J\J_LJ.J.\j _LJ.J.\J.\A.L._)L_,J__Y g o
the—pubdtie fund shall be a continuing fund, not subject to fiscal

year limitations. Expenditures from the fund shall be made upon
warrants issued by the State Treasurer against claims filed as
prescribed by law with the Director of State Finance for approval
and payment.

SECTION 21. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1020, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1020. Nothing in #hkis—aet The Plumbing License Law of
1955 shall prohibit cities and towns from having full authority to
provide full supervision and inspection of plumbing by the enactment
of codes, rules and regulations in such form as they may determine
and prescribe; provided, that no such ordinances, bylaw, rule or
regulation shall be inconsistent with £his—aet The Plumbing License
Law of 1955, or any rule er—regutatien adopted or prescribed by the
State—PReard—efHealtth Construction Industries Commission through
authority of £his—aet The Plumbing License Law of 1955 and the
provisions of the Construction Industries Commission Act. Each
state-licensed master plumber, plumbing contractor and journeyman
plumber shall be required to register with the plumbing inspector of
every city and town in whose jurisdiction ke the plumber operates,
and each such city or town is hereby authorized to register such
master plumber, plumbing contractor and journeyman plumber, to
revoke the same, to charge fees for such registration, for permits
and for inspections of plumbing and fixtures. Provided, further,
that no master plumber, plumbing contractor or journeyman plumber
shall be permitted to do business or work in any city or town
wherein his the local registration of the plumber has been revoked.

SECTION 22. AMENDATORY Section 3, Chapter 293, 0.S.L.
1994 (59 0.S. Supp. 1999, Section 1021.1), is amended to read as
follows:

Section 1021.1 A. 1. There is hereby created the Oklahoma
State Plumbing Installation Code Variance and Appeals Board. The
Variance and Appeals Board shall hear testimony and shall review
sufficient technical data submitted by an applicant to substantiate
the proposed installation of any material, assembly or manufacturer-
engineered components, equipment or system that is not specifically
prescribed by an appropriate installation code, an industry
consensus standard or fabricated or installed according to
recognized and generally accepted good engineering practices, where
no ordinance or regulation of a governmental subdivision applies.

If it is determined that the evidence submitted is satisfactory
proof of performance for the proposed installation, the Variance and
Appeals Board shall approve such alternative, subject to the
requirements of the appropriate installation code. Applications for
the use of an alternative material or method of construction shall
be submitted in writing to the State Commissioner—eof Health

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 15



Construction Industries Commission for approval prior to use.
Applications shall be accompanied by a filing fee, not to exceed
Fifty Dollars ($50.00), as set by rule of the State Beoardof Healtth
Commission.

2. The Variance and Appeals Board shall also hear appeals from
contractors, licensed by the Seecupationat icensing Serviceof +the
StatebPepartment—of Health Construction Industries Commission, and
any party who has an ownership interest in or is in responsible
charge of the design of or work on the installation, who contest the
Pepartmentlts Commission's interpretation of the state's model
plumbing installation code as applied to a particular installation.
Such appeals shall be based on a claim that:

a. the true intent of the installation code has been
incorrectly interpreted,

b. the provisions of the code do not fully apply, or

c. an equal or better form of installation is proposed.
Such appeals to the Variance and Appeals Board shall be made in
writing to the State Commissieoner of Heatth Commission within

fourteen (14) days after a code interpretation or receipt of written
notice of the alleged code violation by the licensed contractor.

B. The Variance and Appeals Board shall consist of the State
Commissioner—ofHealth—orhis—or—her designated representative of
the Commission and the following members who, except for the State
Fire Marshal or designee, shall be appointed by the Cemmissioner
Commission from a list of names submitted by the professional
organizations of the professions represented on the Board and who
shall serve at the pleasure of the Cemmissiener Commission:

1. Two members shall be appointed from the State Committee of
Plumbing Examiners; one shall be a contractor with five (5) years of
experience and one shall be a journeyman with five (5) years of
experience;

2. One member shall be a registered design professional who 1is
a registered architect with at least ten (10) years of experience,
five (5) of which shall have been in responsible charge of work;

3. One member shall be a registered design professional with at
least ten (10) years of structural engineering or architectural
experience, five (5) of which shall have been in responsible charge
of work;

4. One member shall be a registered design professional with
mechanical or plumbing engineering experience; provided, such member
shall have at least ten (10) years of experience, five (5) of which
shall have been in responsible charge of work;

5. One member shall be a registered design professional with
electrical engineering experience; provided, such member shall have
at least ten (10) years of experience, five (5) of which shall have
been in responsible charge of work; and

6. One member shall be the State Fire Marshal or a designee of
the State Fire Marshal.

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 16



Any member serving on the Board on January 1, 2001, may continue
to serve on the Board until a replacement is appointed by the
Commission.

C. Members, except the Commissiener—and designated
representatives of the State Fire Marshal and the commissiener's—and
StateFire Marshal'ls designated—representatives Commission, and
employees of the Pepartment Commission, shall be reimbursed for

travel expenses pursuant to the State Travel Reimbursement Act+
QPN S ENN 1 ~+ o~ £ Ma+1~ T4 £ +has Nl ah - amo O from the

o
e CtTroh—Douvo-T—C€t¢ oo O S S S e T O I KT roma o =7
5O £ + 1
4 4 T

-
revolving fund created pursuant to Section 1018 of T4

oklahema—Statwtes this title.

D. The Variance and Appeals Board shall meet after the
Cemmissiener Commission receives proper application for a wvariance,
accompanied by the filing fee, or proper notice of an appeal, as
provided in subsection A of this section.

E The 4+ Comma oo g A~ o £ a1+ r +1h OComma cveng A~ 1o
. upup\., T 10O T UT T T g Ll\.,u_LL.,J.L, A CTT T 10O T UT T T =]

designated representative+ of the Commission shall serve as chair of
the Variance and Appeals Board. A majority of the members of the
Variance and Appeals Board shall constitute a quorum for the
transaction of the business of the Board.

SECTION 23. AMENDATORY 59 0.S5. 1991, Section 1031, 1is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1031. Fhis—aet Sections 1031 through 1044 of this title
shall be known and may be cited as the "Oklahoma Inspectors Act".

SECTION 24. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1032, 1is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1032. The StateBeard—ef—Healtth Construction Industries
Commission shall promulgate rules amd—regutatiens governing the
examination and licensing of building, electrical, mechanical,
plumbing, and other construction inspectors and the establishment of
classifications for such inspectors. The State Beoardeof Health
Commission may adopt as part of such rules amnd—regultatiens any or
all nationally recognized inspector certification programs or codes
for purposes of building and construction inspector licensing. The
rules ard—regutatieons adopted by the State Beard—eofHealth
Commission shall provide requirements for continuing education for
building and construction inspectors.

SECTION 25. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1033, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1033. As used in the Oklahoma Inspectors Act:

1. "Commissitoper™ "Commission" means the State Commissioner—of
Heatth Construction Industries Commission;

2. "Committee" means the Oklahoma Inspector Examiners
Committee;
3. "Building and construction inspection" means the inspection

of plumbing, electrical, mechanical or structural aspects of

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 17



building and construction, for the purpose of enforcing compliance
with the applicable building codes or standards;

4. "Building and construction inspector" means any person
actively engaged in the inspection of any phase of building and
construction for the purpose of enforcing compliance with the
applicable building codes or standards and includes, but is not
limited to, plumbing inspectors, electrical inspectors, mechanical
inspectors and structural inspectors; and

5. "Circuit rider inspector" means a person who acts as a
building and construction inspector for two or more municipalities
or other political subdivisions and is certified and licensed
pursuant to the Oklahoma Inspectors Act.

SECTION 26. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1034, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1034. There is hereby created the Oklahoma Inspector
Examiners Committee which shall consist of seven (7) members. One
member shall be the StateCommissioner—of Health—or designee of the
Construction Industries Commission. S+ Beginning January 1, 2001,
as the terms of the six other members serving on the Committee on
such date expire, these members shall be appointed prier—+teoDBeeember
3++—3989+ by the State Boardef Heatth;—whe Commission which may also
remove any appointed member for cause. Fhr of—+the i

alh o]
[ g e pu
2
=

1 o 1z n
T

B
3
0N

-

T T

h

z
\4

;
- [=J
PRI
CITr

(V)]
o]

EEEN 1+ 13 Sz
1T T T O~ T OoOOL \ T/ DAEAZE =i

[0)]
T

until their successors are appointed.

Four appointed members shall be residents of this state and each
shall have had at least five (5) years of practical experience as a
building and construction inspector in #is the respective field of
the inspector. Of these appointees, one member each shall be
appointed from the plumbing, electrical, mechanical and structural
professions. One appointed member shall be a municipal officer as
defined in Section 1-102 of Title 11 of the Oklahoma Statutes, and
one appointed member shall be a lay person.

Each member shall serve without pay but shall be reimbursed for
his actual expenses in accordance with the State Travel
Reimbursement Act.

SECTION 27. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1035, 1is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1035. The Oklahoma Inspector Examiners Committee shall
have the power and duty:

1. To assist the State Commissiener—eofHealtth Construction
Industries Commission in certifying, licensing and otherwise
regulating persons employed as building and construction inspectors;

2. To assist the Commissiener Commission in establishing and
administering examinations to applicants for an Oklahoma inspector's
license;

3. To assist the Cemmissiener Commission in prescribing and
adopting forms for certification and licensure applications;

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 18



4. To assist the State ReoardefHealth Commission by making
recommendations concerning rules amd—regultatiens which establish
standards of performance for building and construction inspectors;

5. To assist the StateBeard—efHealtth Commission in
determining whether certification by a national certification
program or licensing by another governmental entity should be
approved as a substitute for a successful completion of the Oklahoma
Inspector's Examination;

6. To investigate alleged violations of the provisions of the
Oklahoma Inspectors Act and of any rules and—regutatiens promulgated
pursuant thereto; and

7. To have such other powers and duties as are necessary to
implement the Oklahoma Inspectors Act.

SECTION 28. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1036, as
amended by Section 2, Chapter 9, 0.S.L. 1995 (59 0.S. Supp. 1999,
Section 1036), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1036. A. Execept—asprovidedinsubseetion B of +this
seection;—after February+—31980—appltiecants Applicants for
certification and license shall:

1. Show proof of certification or licensing by a program or
governmental entity approved by the State Beardeof Health
Construction Industries Commission; or

2. Have been certified by the Committee as having passed the
examination.

The Cemmissioner Commission shall issue a license to any person
who has met the requirements of paragraph 1 or 2 of this subsection
and who has paid the fees required by the Oklahoma Inspectors Act
and has otherwise complied with the applicable requirements of the
Oklahoma Inspectors Act. Provided, the Cemmissioener Commission may
issue a provisional license limited to two (2) years to enable an
applicant to meet the certification requirements of this subsection.

€+ Examinations shall be uniform and shall be practical in
nature but shall be sufficiently strict to test the qualifications
and fitness of the applicant as a building and construction
inspector. The examination shall be in whole or in part in writing.
Examination dates shall be set by the Committee. Any applicant
failing to pass the examination shall not be permitted to take
another examination for a period of thirty (30) days, and thereafter
any such applicants subsequently failing to pass the examination
shall not be permitted to take a subsequent examination for a period
of ninety (90) days.

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 19



B+ C. All licenses shall be nontransferable and it shall be
unlawful for any holder of a license issued pursuant to the Oklahoma
Inspectors Act to loan or allow the use of such license by any other
person, firm or corporation.

SECTION 29. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1037, 1is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1037. Application for examination, certification, or
license or renewal of license shall be made to the Ceommissiener
Construction Industries Commission in writing on forms furnished by
the Commissiener Commission and each application shall be
accompanied by a fee of Twenty-five Dollars ($25.00). Applicants
for renewal may also be required to submit proof of compliance with
continuing education requirements established by the Beaxrd
Commission.

SECTION 30. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1039, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1039. A. The Committee may, upon its own motion, and
shall upon written complaint filed by any person, investigate

inspection practices of any building and construction inspector.

B. The Committee may request that an individual proceeding be
conducted to determine whether the licensee has:

1. Made a material misstatement in the application for license
or renewal thereof;

2. Loaned or illegally used his the license of the licensee;

3. Demonstrated incompetency to act as a building and
construction inspector; or

4. Violated any provision of the Oklahoma Inspectors Act, or
any rule;—regutatienr—er—eorder promulgated or order issued pursuant
to the Oklahoma Inspectors Act.

C. After a finding by an impartial hearing examiner that the
licensee is guilty of any violation as provided for in subsection B
of this section, the Cemmissiener Construction Industries Commission
may:

1. Suspend or revoke the license;

2. Defer such suspension or revocation pending mitigating or
remedial action by the licensee; or

3. Assess administrative penalties pursuant to the provisions
of Section 301+ IA of Title 63 of +the Oklaheoma Statutes 1044 of

this title.

D. Any person whose license has been revoked by the
Commissioner Commission may not apply for a new license for at least
one (1) year from the date of such revocation.

SECTION 31. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1041, is
amended to read as follows:

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 20



Section 1041. Any municipality or other governmental entity
which employs any person as a building and construction inspector
for functions normally performed by a building and construction
inspector shall notify the Cemmissiemer Construction Industries
Commission of the employment.

Any municipality or other political subdivision of the state
with a population of ten thousand (10,000) or less according to the
most current census published by the Oklahoma Employment Security
Commission shall be exempt from the provisions of £his—aet the
Oklahoma Inspectors Act, unless such municipality or other political
subdivision of the state employs the services of a circuit rider
inspector.

SECTION 32. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1042, 1is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1042. There is hereby created in the State Treasury a
revolving fund for the State Pepartment—efHealth Construction
Industries Commission, to be designated the "Oklahoma Inspectors
Revolving Fund". The fund shall be a continuing fund, not subject
to fiscal year limitations, and shall consist of all monies received
by the cemmissiener Commission from fees and fines collected
pursuant to the Oklahoma Inspectors Act. All monies accruing to the
credit of said fund are hereby appropriated and may be budgeted and
expended by the State Commissieoner of Health Commission for the
purpose of implementing the provisions of the Oklahoma Inspectors
Act for the continuing education of building and construction
inspectors, and for implementing programs designed to further the
efficiency of the building and construction inspector profession and
public understanding of the profession. Expenditures from said fund
shall be made upon warrants issued by the State Treasurer against
claims filed as prescribed by law with the Director of State Finance
for approval and payment.

SECTION 33. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1044, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1044. Any person convicted of acting or performing as a
building and construction inspector without the proper license shall
be guilty of a misdemeanor and shall be punished by a fine of not
less than Two Hundred Fifty Dollars ($250.00) nor more than Two
Thousand Five Hundred Dollars ($2,500.00), together with the costs
of prosecution. Each day of violation shall constitute a separate
offense.

Any entity who employs an unlicensed person to perform the
duties and responsibilities of a building and construction inspector
or who fails to notify the Cemmissiermer Construction Industries
Commission of the employment of an inspector shall be subject to an

administrative pepatties pursuvant—teo—+the provisions—-of Secetion

~ ~ ™~

1 17017 ENE | 17017 1N £ 2+ 7 /] £ + 1 Nlel Al S~ Q4+ 0 Ao f f
- =7 U T (@B Aw § - 7T U 1T« LTIX A\ T T C 1 A\ A CTIT N T OTTOTIT T C O CTOOCTT O lne O

not more than Two Hundred Dollars ($200.00) for each violation.
Fach day a person is in violation may constitute a separate
violation. The maximum fine shall not exceed One Thousand Dollars
($1,000.00) .

SECTION 34. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1680, is
amended to read as follows:

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 21



Section 1680. Hhis—aet Sections 1680 through 1697 of this title
shall be known and may be cited as the "Electrical License Act".

SECTION 35. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1681, as
last amended by Section 1, Chapter 155, 0.S.L. 1994 (59 0.S. Supp.
1999, Section 1681), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1681. The State Beoard—efHeatth Construction Industries
Commission is hereby authorized to adopt, amend and repeal rules
governing the examination and licensing of electrical contractors
and journeymen electricians, the defining of categories and
limitations for such licenses, the establishment of continuing
education requirements and procedures as determined by the Committee
of Electrical Examiners, the establishment and levying of
administrative fines, the initiation of disciplinary proceedings,
the requesting of prosecution of and initiation of injunctive
proceedings against any person who violates any of the provisions of
£his—aet the Electrical License Act or any rule promulgated pursuant
to £his—aet the Electrical License Act, the establishment of bonding
and insurance requirements precluding municipal requirements, the
requirement of proof of possession of a Federal Tax ID Number and a
State of Oklahoma Employment Security Commission identification
number, the registration of electrical apprentices and the standard
of electrical installations, and to adopt future editions of the
Code. Provided, broiler houses will not be required to meet the
electrical wiring requirements for environmentally controlled
poultry houses as set out in the National Electric Code.

SECTION 36. AMENDATORY Section 4, Chapter 293, 0.S.L.
1994 (59 0.S. Supp. 1999, Section 1681.1), 1is amended to read as
follows:

Section 1681.1 The StateCommissiener—eofHealth Construction
Industries Commission shall establish by rule a process for the
formal review of the plans and specifications for a project prior to
bid dates for the project to ensure that the project plans and
specifications are in conformance with applicable plumbing,
electrical and mechanical installation codes. The rule shall
provide that the review shall be completed in a timely manner, not
to exceed fourteen (14) calendar days from the date of the
submission of a completed application for review which is
accompanied by the review fee not to exceed Two Hundred Dollars
($200.00) to be established by the rule. Upon completion of the
review, the plans and specifications shall be returned to the
applicant with documentation indicating either approval of plans and
specifications which are in compliance with the applicable codes, or
modifications which must be made to bring the plans and
specifications into conformance. Submission of such plans and
specifications for review by the Bepartment Commission shall be
voluntary.

SECTION 37. AMENDATORY 59 0.S5. 1991, Section 1682, as
last amended by Section 5, Chapter 405, 0.S.L. 1999 (59 0.S. Supp.
1999, Section 1682), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1682. As used in the Electrical License Act:

1 L1 WP [ | SN S Q4 Dan—d £ AT+ .

. [ECAW L@ W Epw § TIT ATTO CTIT [ ey & iy w [ECAWL® W Epw § O I L CTLy

2 LTSNSO N SRS | RN S, I 4 4+ Coammaicat onar £ Taol+h
N7 1 B ) ) SN WD N N R R R T TS LS i By S C OO CT AN ) B ) I SN W N N R R R . 1T L,J.L,

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 22



3= "Commission" means the Construction Industries Commission;

2. "Committee" means the Committee of Electrical Examiners
appointed by the State Reard—eof Health Commission;

DS
3]

£ I~ T1 4+ .
[ S o Y & i o o

= o
TITCTII O T A\

e
5+ 3. "Electrical apprentice" means any person sixteen (16)
years of age or older whose principal occupation is the learning of
and assisting in the installation of electrical work under the

direct supervision of a licensed journeyman electrician or
electrical contractor;

6~ 4. "Journeyman electrician" means any person other than an
electrical contractor who engages in the actual installation,
alteration, repair or renovation of electrical facilities or
electrical construction work unless specifically exempted by the
provisions of the Electrical License Act;

+= 5. "Electrical contractor" means any person skilled in the
planning, superintending and practical installation of electrical
facilities who is familiar with the laws, rules and regulations
governing such work. Electrical contractor also means any
individual, firm, partnership, corporation, limited liability
company, or business performing skills of an electrical contractor
or an electrician or the business of contracting, or furnishing
labor or labor and materials for the installation, repair,
maintenance or renovation of electrical facilities or electrical
construction work according to the provisions of the Electrical
License Act;

8+ 6. "Electrical facilities" means all wiring, fixtures,
appurtenances, and appliances for, and in connection with, a supply
of electricity within or adjacent to any building, structure or
conveyance on the premises but not including the connection with a
power supply meter or other power supply source;

9 7. "Category" means the classification by which licenses and
electrical work may be limited. Such categories shall include but
shall not be limited to installation, maintenance, repair,
alteration, residential, oilfield, and commercial;

+6+ 8. I"Temporary journeyman electrician" means any person
other than a person permanently licensed as a journeyman electrician
or electrical contractor in this state who meets the temporary
licensure requirements of Section €& 1685.1 of this =et title;

+-= 9. "Variance and Appeals Board" means the Oklahoma State
Electrical Installation Code Variance and Appeals Board; and

32—+ 10. "Electrical construction work" means installation,
fabrication or assembly of equipment or systems included in
"premises wiring" as defined in the 1996 edition of the National
Electrical Code, which is hereby adopted and incorporated by
reference. Electrical construction work includes, but is not
limited to, installation of raceway systems used for any electrical
purposes, and installation of field-assembled systems such as ice
and snow melting, pipe-tracing, and manufactured wiring systems.
Electrical construction work shall not include in-plant work

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 23



performed by employees of the company owning the plant, work
performed by telecommunications employees for telecommunications
companies, or installation of factory-assembled appliances or
machinery which is not part of the premises wiring unless wiring
interconnections external to the equipment are required in the
field.

SECTION 38. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1683, as
last amended by Section 3, Chapter 318, 0.S.L. 1996 (59 0.S. Supp.
1999, Section 1683), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1683. A. There is hereby established the Committee of
Electrical Examiners which shall consist of seven (7) members. All
members of the Committee shall be residents of this state.

B. 1+—S4x% Beginning January 1, 2001, as the terms of members
serving on the Committee expire, six voting members of the Committee
shall be appointed by the State Beard—efHealth Construction
Industries Commission as follows:

e oRe

1. One member shall be an electrical inspector selected from a
list of names submitted by the Oklahoma Chapter, International
Association of Electrical Inspectorsy;

b+ ene

2. One member shall be selected from a list of names submitted
by the Oklahoma Chapters of the National Electrical Contractors
Associationy;

S  one

3. One member shall be selected from a list of names submitted
by the Associated Builders and Constructorss;

= one
4. One member shall be a journeyman wireman selected from a
list of names submitted by the International Brotherhood of
Electrical Workerss;

e  one

5. One member shall be a journeyman wireman selected from lists
of names submitted from the electrical construction industrys; and

£ one

6. One member shall be selected emn—erbeforeJanvary—++—3+997
from a list of names submitted by the Oklahoma Chapters of
Independent Electrical Contractors, Incorporated. The term of the
initial appointee shall be for two (2) years.

All members shall each have at least ten (10) years of active
experience as licensed electrical contractors, journeyman
electricians or as an electrical inspector. No member shall be
employed by the same person or firm as any other member of the
Committee. The terms of members so appointed shall be staggered and

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 24



shall be for two (2) years, or until their successors are appointed
and qualified.

2+ The nonvoting member shall be designated by the Beard
Commission from #he its staff ef—the-State Department—ofHeatth to
serve as Program Administrator and serve as the Chief Electrical
Inspector for the state.

C. Vacancies which may occur in the membership of the Committee
shall be filled by appointment of the Beaxrd Commission. Each person
who has been appointed to fill a vacancy shall serve for the
remainder of the term for which the member he or she succeeds was
appointed and until his or her successor has been appointed and has
qualified. Members of the Committee may be removed from office by
the Beard Commission for cause in the manner provided by law for the
removal of officers not subject to impeachment.

D. The Committee shall assist and advise the Cemmissioner
Commission on all matters relating to the formulation of rules+
regutatiens and standards in accordance with the Electrical License
Act. The Committee shall administer the examinations of applicants
for licenses as electrical contractors or journeyman electricians
provided that such examinations shall be in accordance with the
provisions of the Electrical License Act. The Committee may
authorize the Bepartment Commission to conduct tests on their behalf
as the Committee deems necessary.

E. All members of the Committee shall be reimbursed for
expenses incurred while in the performance of their duties in
accordance with the State Travel Reimbursement Act.

F. A majority of the total membership of the Committee shall
constitute a quorum for the transaction of business.

G. The Committee shall elect from among its membership a
chairperson, vice-chairperson and secretary to serve terms of not
more than one (1) year ending on June 30 of the year designated as
the end of the officer's term. The chairperson or vice-chairperson
shall preside at all meetings. The chairperson, vice-chairperson
and secretary shall perform such duties as may be directed by the
Committee. The Committee shall meet at such times as the
chairperson or presiding officer deems necessary to implement—this
seetion carry out the responsibilities of the Committee.

SECTION 39. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1685, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1685. A. The Ccemmissiener Construction Industries
Commission shall issue a license as journeyman electrician or
electrical contractor to any person who:

1. Has been certified by the Committee of Electrical Examiners
as either having successfully passed the appropriate examination or
having a valid license issued by another governmental entity with
licensing requirements similar to those provided in the Electrical
License Act; and

2. Has paid the license fee and otherwise complied with the
provisions of the Electrical License Act.

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 25



B. All licenses shall be nontransferable and it shall be a
misdemeanor for any person licensed under the provisions of the
Electrical License Act to loan or allow the use of such license by
any other person, firm or corporation, except as specifically
provided in the Electrical License Act.

lal I+ 1 TAVE —-N 2NN S| 1099 + OAamma oo o n ah~11 1IN N AN A~ s
. A\ N R WP S = OO - J—, - \2 I CIT I oo U1 UJ.J.LA._L_L, ULJVJ.J. LJJ_VLJ -

ENEC AN B NS S| N A Al N gz A £ £ o 1 o 14 ~aAarnana g+ ~qa4 szama 4+ 1 nao
(J.LJLJJ.J.&/(J.L_J.ULL (@ W AWy t./(J._Ylll T L\ 1 n_), LT oo [ S T1ThO =) W LT CTITTIOoOOC 4 L § § R S i i & R WPl B N i Y )
+ Nnoaranrna gk g EVSIE T2 1 sz 1 1099 1 1207 n1ired 131 ~Armo~na o
|y LJ o IO AR T Y4 LJJ__L\JJ_ |y L W i J_, - \J 7 I W T LJ_LJ_ A\ 8 [ E Ei WP W B W ) W ) @ )
eI S NP 2NN 1 Pk SIS RN SNE NP ~ 1 ot ra ~~ 1 PN SIS N S NE AR B T N B SO TN I S
J\J\AJ_J.J. _YJ.I.l(_A.J.J. pu C 11 LT TATO A pu C 11 & g =y OTT T TE C U1 S T oo O A\ 8 T (&N L
EESE BN ENE S CNPANE T S~ B~ SC 22N £ +h a1 a4 A sk h sz +harrgd o onme ] 4 A
L J.LLVUJ.L./UJ.(J.L_ A8 COWIT L\ CTIT 1O o C OO T I AT WI T T1TTOV O CITT VW IO &/Ulllt./J.J. A8
at+th 1 B N LI BV SN P £ + 1 | ot ra ~~1 T 4o DN ~t MThaia T3~~~y
W LT CTT CIT 1 \.1\A._LJ_ TIT TT TS . CIT i S C 11 & g =y J I T1TO Fany T e LT T 1O i E— T1TO
mitat N A RN BN N N N A S T I I = I = + bt aamarmey o o4 o4 14 c0ana 2 £
P38 AW ey w L LJJ.UMLA&/ A8 T (&Y LJJ. - kiuJ.QJ.L_ [y ULIL_(J.J..llJ..ll\j (& o C O T [ S i W W R N ) Y P S
+ 1 PR B BENE 2N EEP RN VNI B N o = £ N ~a g r +rgrn W axza N~ o 14 ~aArnaa e
CTT (J.LJLJJ.J.&/(J.LLL_ ) (&Y - [ w T L\ (&Y | ay wy L COWIT LJ.(J.VJ.LL\j [ S Lln_)J.Ll\j
dar—

SECTION 40. AMENDATORY Section 6, Chapter 405, 0.S.L.

1999 (59 0.S. Supp. 1999, Section 1685.1), is amended to read as
follows:

Section 1685.1 A. Within one (1) year of the date the Governor
of this state declares a state of emergency in response to a
disaster involving the destruction of dwelling units, the State
Commissieoner—of Heatth Construction Industries Commission shall
issue a distinctively colored, nonrenewable, temporary journeyman
electrician license which shall expire one (1) year after the date
of declaration to any person who is currently licensed as a
journeyman electrician by another state and who:

1. Submits, within ten (10) days of beginning journeyman
electrician's work in this state, an application and fee for a
journeyman electrician's examination;

2. Takes and passes the examination at the first opportunity
thereafter offered by the Cemmissiener Commission; and

3. Pays a temporary journeyman electrician's license fee of
Twenty-five Dollars ($25.00).

B. Nothing in this section shall be construed as prohibiting
any person from qualifying at any time for any other license by
meeting the requirements for the other license.

SECTION 41. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1686, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1686. A. The cCemmissiener Construction Industries
Commission shall, upon proper application and payment of fee,
register as an electrical apprentice and issue a certificate of such
registration to any person who furnishes satisfactory proof to the
Commissioner Commission that the applicant is:

1. Sixteen (16) years of age or over;

2. Enrolled in a seheoet—or federal training eewrse program for
electrical apprentices recognized by the Cemmissiener Commission, or

has—arranged—Ffor—empltoyment employed as an electrical apprentice

with & an active licensed electrical contractor.

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 26



B. All applications for examination, license or renewal of
license shall be made in writing to the Cemmissiener Commission on
forms provided, if necessary, by the Cemmissiener Commission. All
applications shall be accompanied by the appropriate fee.

SECTION 42. AMENDATORY 59 0.S5. 1991, Section 1688, as
last amended by Section 8, Chapter 405, 0.S.L. 1999 (59 0.S. Supp.
1999, Section 1688), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1688. A. No license shall be issued for longer than
one (1) year and all licenses shall expire on June 30 of each year.
A license may be renewed upon application and payment of fees thirty
(30) days preceding or following June 30 of each year and not be
subject to a late renewal penalty. No penalty for late renewal
shall be charged to any holder of a license which expires while the
holder is in military service if an application for renewal is made
within one (1) year following his—er—her the service discharge of
the holder.

B. No journeyman or contractor license shall be renewed unless
the licensee has completed the required hours of continuing
education by completing a course on the current national electrical
code revision of not less than six (6) hours of instruction as
determined by the Committee of Electrical Examiners and approved by
the State PReoard—ef Health Construction Industries Commission, within
one (1) year of adoption of the current national electrical code
revision.

C. An apprentice registration certificate shall be issued for
one (1) year, at which time the apprentice may reregister upon

meeting the requirements of the State bPepartmentof Health

Commission and paying the renewal fee.

SECTION 43. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1689, as
last amended by Section 4, Chapter 353, 0.S.L. 1997 (59 0.S. Supp.
1999, Section 1689), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1689. A. The State Commissienereof Health Construction
Industries Commission and the Committee of Electrical Examiners
shall act as the Electrical Hearing Board and shall comply with the
provisions of Article II of the Administrative Procedures Act,
Section 389 308a et seg. of Title 75 of the Oklahoma Statutes.

B. The Electrical Hearing Board may, upon its own motion, and
shall, upon written complaint filed by any person, investigate the
business transactions of any electrical contractor, journeyman
electrician or electrical apprentice. Upon a finding by clear and
convincing evidence, the Board shall suspend or revoke any license
or registration obtained by false or fraudulent representation.
Upon a finding by clear and convincing evidence, the Board shall
also suspend or revoke any license or registration for any of the
following:

1. Making a material misstatement in the application for a
license or registration, or the renewal of a license or

registration;

2. Loaning or illegally using a license;

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 27



3. Demonstrating incompetence to act as a journeyman
electrician or electrical contractor;

4. Violating any provisions of the Electrical License Act, or
any rules—regudtatien or order prescribed by the Commission or any
ordinance or regulation for the installation of electrical
facilities made or enacted by a city or town by authority of the
Electrical License Act; or

5. Willfully failing to perform normal business obligations
without justifiable cause.

C. Any person whose license or registration has been revoked by
the Electrical Hearing Board may apply for a new license one (1)
year from the date of such revocation.

D. Notwithstanding any other provision of law, a political
subdivision of this state that has adopted a nationally recognized
electrical code and appointed an inspector pursuant to the
provisions of Section 1693 er—Seetion—3+63+—et—seg+ of this title or
pursuant to the provisions of the Oklahoma Inspectors Act for such
work shall have jurisdiction over the interpretation of the code and
the installation of all electrical work done in that political
subdivision, subject to the provisions of the Oklahoma Inspectors
Act+—Seetion 103+ et——seg—of this—+titte. Provided, a state
inspector may work directly with an electrical contractor,
journeyman electrician or electrical apprentice in such a locality
if a violation of the code creates an immediate threat to life or
health.

E. In the case of a complaint about, investigation of, or
inspection of any license, registration, permit or electrical work
in any political subdivision of this state which has not adopted a
nationally recognized electrical code and appointed an inspector
pursuant to the provisions of Section 1693 er—Seetion1031l et —see-
of this title or pursuant to the provisions of the Oklahoma
Inspectors Act for such work, the State Commissionerof Health
Commission shall have jurisdiction over such matters.

F. 1. No individual, business, company, corporation,
association or other entity subject to the provisions of Seetion
1680—~et——seg—of this—+titte the Electrical License Act shall install,
modify or alter electrical facilities in any incorporated area of
this state which has not adopted a nationally recognized electrical
code and appointed an inspector pursuant to the provisions of
Section 1693 er—Seetieon3+03+—et—seg+ of this title or pursuant to
the provisions of the Oklahoma Inspectors Act for such work without
providing notice of such electrical work to the State Commissioner
efHealth Commission. A notice form for reproduction by an
individual or entity required to make such notice shall be provided
by the cemmissiener Commission upon request.

2. Notice to the Cemmissiener Commission pursuant to this
subsection shall not be required for electrical maintenance or
replacement of existing electrical appliances or fixtures or of any
petroleum refinery or its research facilities.

3. Enforcement of this subsection is authorized pursuant to
Seetion—1680—~ect—seg—of+this—+title the Electrical License Act, or
under authority granted to the cemmissioner—eof Health Commission.

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 28



SECTION 44. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1691, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1691. Any holder of a license or registration issued in
accordance with the provisions of the Electrical License Act shall
promptly notify the Cemmissiermer Construction Industries Commission
of any change in hkis address.

SECTION 45. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1694, as
last amended by Section 7, Chapter 155, 0.S.L. 1994 (59 0.S. Supp.
1999, Section 1694), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1694. All monies received by the Commissioner
Construction Industries Commission under the Electrical License Act,
including the administrative fines authorized by Section 1695 of
this title, shall be deposited with the State Treasurer and credited
to the "Electrical Revolving Fund". The revolving fund shall be a
continuing fund not subject to fiscal year limitations and shall be
under the control and management of the Cemmissiener Commission.

All monies accruing to the credit of the fund are hereby
appropriated and may be budgeted and expended by the Commission.
Expenditures from this fund shall be made pursuant to the purposes
of the Electrical License Act and shall include, but not be limited
to, payment of operating costs and the costs of programs designed to
promote public awareness of the electrical industry, and
expenditures for the preparation and printing of regulations,
bulletins or other documents and the furnishing of copies of such
documents to those persons engaged in the electrical industry or the

bl IWarrant o £~ NeanAda e ah o]
pu lc- WO LTTATT OO [ S CAtJCll\.LLl,LA.LCLJ [ Y = ==
7\ 1 A N N

& o

N + ot
VW IT LJ_Y T [ L@ W )
S,

i Expenditures
from the fund shall be made upon warrants issued by the State
Treasurer against claims filed as prescribed by law with the
Director of State Finance for approval and payment. The revolving
fund shall be audited at least once each year by the State Auditor
and Inspector.

SECTION 46. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1696, as
amended by Section 9, Chapter 155, 0.S.L. 1994 (59 0.S. Supp. 1999,
Section 1696), 1is amended to read as follows:

Section 1696. Nothing in the Electrical License Act shall
prohibit cities and towns from having full authority to provide
supervision and inspection of electrical facilities by the enactment
of codes, ordinances, bylaws, and rules ard—regotatiens in such form
as they may determine and prescribe for their jurisdiction;
provided, that no such codes, ordinances, bylaws, and rules e¥
regutations shall be inconsistent with the Electrical License Act,
or any rule er—regutatien adopted or prescribed by the State Beard
efHealth Construction Industries Commission as authorized by the
Electrical License Act. FEach state licensed electrical contractor
and journeyman electrician shall be required to register with any
city or town in whose jurisdiction ke the licensee operates. Each
such city or town is authorized to register such electrical
contractor or journeyman electrician, to revoke the registration, to
charge fees for the registration and for permits and inspections of
electrical work. No electrical contractor or journeyman electrician
shall be permitted to do business or work in any city or town where

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 29



kis the local registration of the electrical contractor or

journeyman electrician has been revoked.

SECTION 47. AMENDATORY Section 7, Chapter 293, 0.S.L.
1994 (59 0.S. Supp. 1999, Section 1697), is amended to read as
follows:

Section 1697. A. 1. There is hereby created the Oklahoma
State Electrical Installation Code Variance and Appeals Board. The
Variance and Appeals Board shall hear testimony and shall review
sufficient technical data submitted by an applicant to substantiate
the proposed installation of any material, assembly or manufacturer-
engineered components, equipment or system that is not specifically
prescribed by an appropriate installation code, an industry
consensus standard or fabricated or installed according to
recognized and generally accepted good engineering practices, where
no ordinance or regulation of a governmental subdivision applies.

If it is determined that the evidence submitted is satisfactory
proof of performance for the proposed installation, the Variance and
Appeals Board shall approve such alternative, subject to the
requirements of the appropriate installation code. Applications for
the use of an alternative material or method of construction shall
be submitted in writing to the State Commissioner of Health
Construction Industries Commission for approval prior to use.
Applications shall be accompanied by a filing fee, not to exceed
Fifty Dollars ($50.00), as set by rule of the State Reardef Heatth
Commission.

2. The Variance and Appeals Board shall also hear appeals from
contractors+ licensed by the Oeecupational Licensing Serviece—of the
State bPepartment—eof Heatth Commission, and any party who has an
ownership interest in or is in responsible charge of the design of
or work on the installation, who contest the bepartment's
Commission's interpretation of the state's model electrical
installation code as applied to a particular installation. Such
appeals shall be based on a claim that:

a. the true intent of the installation code has been
incorrectly interpreted,

b. the provisions of the code do not fully apply, or

C. an equal or better form of installation i1s proposed.
Such appeals to the Variance and Appeals Board shall be made in
writing to the State Commissioner—eofHeatth Commission within

fourteen (14) days after a code interpretation or receipt of written
notice of the alleged code violation by the licensed contractor.

B. The Variance and Appeals Board shall consist of the State
Commissroner—of Health—orhis—or—her designated representative of
the Construction Industries Commission and the following members
who, except for the State Fire Marshal or designee, shall be
appointed by the cemmissiener Commission from a list of names
submitted by the professional organizations of the professions
represented on the Board and who shall serve at the pleasure of the
Commissioner Commission:

1. Two members shall be appointed from the Committee of
Electrical Examiners; one shall be a contractor with five (5) years

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 30



of experience and one shall be a journeyman with five (5) years of
experience;

2. One member shall be a registered design professional who is
a registered architect with at least ten (10) years of experience,
five (5) of which shall have been in responsible charge of work;

3. One member shall be a registered design professional with at
least ten (10) years of structural engineering or architectural
experience, five (5) of which shall have been in responsible charge
of work;

4. One member shall be a registered design professional with
mechanical or plumbing engineering experience; provided, such member
shall have at least ten (10) years of experience, five (5) of which
shall have been in responsible charge of work;

5. One member shall be a registered design professional with
electrical engineering experience; provided, such member shall have
at least ten (10) years of experience, five (5) of which shall have
been in responsible charge of work; and

6. One member shall be the State Fire Marshal or a designee of
the State Fire Marshal.

Any member serving on the Board on January 1, 2001, may continue
to serve on the Board until a replacement is appointed by the
Commission.

C. Members, except the Commissieoner designee of the Commission
and the State Fire Marshal and—the Commissioner's and State Fire
Marshal's or the designated represerntatives representative of the
State Fire Marshal, and employees of the Bepartment Commission,
shall be reimbursed for travel expenses pursuant to the State Travel
Reimbursement Act+—=Seetion——500-t—~et—seg—of FitleF4—of the Oklahoma
S%a%ﬁ%es— from the revolv1ng fund created pursuant to Section 1694

D. The Variance and Appeals Board shall meet after the
Cemmissieoner Commission receives proper application for a variance,
accompanied by the filing fee, or proper notice of an appeal, as
provided in subsection A of this section.

E The Q+ Camma oo £ Il +1h r +1h Camma oo o 1 o
. ot te— oMM SSToRcer oot O —thac—CcOoOmmMIErSSTFoner—=S

designated representativey of the Commission shall serve as chair of
the Variance and Appeals Board. A majority of the members of the
Variance and Appeals Board shall constitute a quorum for the
transaction of the business of the Board.

SECTION 48. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1850.1, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1850.1 Sections 2 1850.1 through 4 1860 of this =aet
title shall be known and may be cited as the "Mechanical Licensing
Act".

SECTION 49. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1850.2, as
last amended by Section 10, Chapter 405, 0.S.L. 1999 (59 0.S. Supp.
1999, Section 1850.2), is amended to read as follows:

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 31



Section 1850.2 As used in the Mechanical Licensing Act:
1. "Air conditioning system" means the process of treating air
by controlling its temperature, humidity, and cleanliness, to meet

the requirements of a designated area;

2 WD Ao, AW oo+ o+ ot Danrd £ oo l+l.
. DO T 10 TIT LTS CIT [P Wy & By wy DAY 4 @ N R W § . gy @ g L_,J.J.,

3= "Committee" means the Committee of Mechanical Examiners;

5+ 3. "Commission” means the Construction Industries
Commission;
4. "Gas piping" means and includes all natural gas piping

within or adjacent to any building, structure, or conveyance, on the
premises and to the connection with a natural gas meter, regulator,
or other source of supply:;

6~ 5. "Heating systems" means and includes systems consisting
of air heating appliances from which the heated air is distributed
and shall include any accessory apparatus and equipment installed in
connection therewith;

#+= 6. "Mechanical contractor" or "contractor" means any person
engaged in the business of planning, contracting, supervising or
furnishing labor or labor and materials for mechanical work;

8= 7. "Mechanical journeyman" or "Jjourneyman" means any person
other than a contractor or apprentice who engages in mechanical
work;

9~ 8. "Mechanical apprentice" or "apprentice" means any person
sixteen (16) years of age or older whose principal occupation is
learning mechanical work on the job under the direct supervision of
a journeyman or contractor;

+6+ 9. "Mechanical firm" means any corporation, partnership,
association, proprietorship, limited liability company, or other
business entity which plans or engages, or offers to engage, in
mechanical work for another within this state;

++~= 10. "Mechanical work"™ means the installation, maintenance,
repair, or renovation, in whole or in part, of any heating system,
cooling system, mechanical refrigeration system or ventilation
system or any equipment or piping carrying chilled water, air for
ventilation purposes, or natural gas, or the installation,
maintenance, repair, or renovation of process piping used to carry
any liquid, substance, or material, including steam and hot water
used for space heating purposes not under the jurisdiction of the
Department of Labor other than minor repairs to such systems;

+2- 11. "Refrigeration system" means the erection, installation,
repairing and servicing of a system employing a fluid which normally
is vaporized and liquefied in an air conditioning system, food
preservation measure or manufacturing process;

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 32



33+ 12. "Sheet metal" means the erection, installation and
repairing of all ferrous or nonferrous duct work and all other
materials used in all air conditioning;

+4~ 13. "Temporary mechanical journeyman" means any person
other than a person permanently licensed as a mechanical journeyman
or contractor in this state who meets the temporary licensure
requirements of Section +2 1850.8A of this @et title; and

35+ 14. "Variance and Appeals Board" means the Oklahoma State
Mechanical Installation Code Variance and Appeals Board.

SECTION 50. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1850.3, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1850.3 The Beard Construction Industries Commission
shall have the power and duty to:

1. Promulgate, prescribe, amend, and repeal rules and
regutatieons necessary to implement the provisions of the Mechanical
Licensing Act including, but not limited to, defining categories and
limitations for such licenses+ and for registration of apprentices,
and establishing bonding and insurance requirements precluding
municipal requirements;

2. Adopt standards for mechanical work, by reference, published
by a recognized code body; and

3. Establish minimum standards of mechanical installations in
this state.
SECTION 51. AMENDATORY Section 9, Chapter 293, 0.S.L.

1994 (59 0.S. Supp. 1999, Section 1850.3a), is amended to read as
follows:

Section 1850.3a The State—tCemmissiener—ofHealth Construction
Industries Commission shall establish by rule a process for the
formal review of the plans and specifications for a project prior to
bid dates for the project to ensure that the project plans and
specifications are in conformance with applicable plumbing,
electrical and mechanical installation codes. The rule shall
provide that the review shall be completed in a timely manner, not
to exceed fourteen (14) calendar days from the date of the
submission of a completed application for review which is
accompanied by the review fee not to exceed Two Hundred Dollars
($200.00) to be established by the rule. Upon completion of the
review, the plans and specifications shall be returned to the
applicant with documentation indicating either approval of plans and
specifications which are in compliance with the applicable codes, or
modifications which must be made to bring the plans and
specifications into conformance. Submission of such plans and
specifications for review by the Bepartment Commission shall be
voluntary.

SECTION 52. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 1991, Section 1850.4, as
last amended by Section 10, Chapter 293, 0.S.L. 1994 (59 0.S. Supp.
1999, Section 1850.4), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1850.4 A. There is hereby established the Committee of
Mechanical Examiners, which shall consist of five (5) members. All

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 33



members shall be citizens of the United States and shall be

Members shall hold office for terms of two

years or until their successors have been appointed and

residents of this state.

(2)

qualified.

+ 1
TIT

VAN 2 N N S TS
LA.LJLJV_LJ.J. Ly

12N
o

alh 11

Coamma + +

+ 1
TIT

maoamiha r o
Tt T

(A

~

13

NI

[ Y & npu mpn

OTIir T T T

O L

T

PN RN ERNE

o COoOIrcrraoa T coOTy

o

-

12N
o

Comma + + alh~11

+ 1
CTIT

[ Y & gm mpm m

OTIir T T T

A

T

ITr

n o

3

+r

Sz
Eay =

vzeaaral St a.-1

(5

St £

TCo T

a1 7 Wy

o
T

[QEEWN SR ZCPEE N 2N
[CACASS B

T

SRR ULy & pun

s e

[ I & iy Bys B i N & BV Tr

[}

o

TTT

warle
WO T

alharm g ~ o

m

TTT

n

3

A\ i 5 @ i 5 i i Py @ i

LTIt

mamih e o

7

—~
Ly

ra alh17

mamlin

Mg

T T T O

olra L L OT

TN T 1O

T WO

nt o + RPoarA okl o1 1

A~
ut/t/u_l_ll CITCTIT OOy

Y

ER

maled ey 1

T

CIIC— DO LT oo T

oS iry CIIC— TTIrrcror

Tt

mamih s v o
o

TTT

10QQ ~nrn A 4o
T [eszaws

n

K

NG g o
KPS

N
[ AVAS I S S 5 4 & e e

rm o
T IO

mamiha v o
aas

+ 17

P AP
S o ToTaT

g

T [ e

W

OO

LTIt

T o LT OT
1090

T

AR Ay

Gt d

alh 11 o

>

Th

n

RN i N B 2 W . |

Py

rm o
TIthO

TIrrcrtoLr

CIT

1097

T

e

O

i

Comma + +

1t

TP O T ITCIIT

Thewan £4 A

1

onmiha
DT TioT—T

IS T
Oy

+ 1

nt o

N

rIrcrcaorcoTy I

7

O

’

T

|y CTIT N7 N B ) ) A ey S
1d £ -
TTOI1TTCOK |\ S S )

oo
ah 1]

EE
=

EVSENE T ECNE I B = 2N

r o

v aJ_O A=

(D <7
=77

£ + 7
A

rm o
TItho O L

£

2N

mambara

ITr

TTT

OIrc T LT

W

[ S

T o olrar T

T

ERAE |

TP TITC

PN IR B I =
o ey aw s \1\A(_A._L_LJ__L

n N

12N

o sz

faWal

13N
(RS

\w ary

T

T v

[N AW )

r o

mamis

1002 o +h Forma £ +hoaa
ES cCTrifto— O

1

7

Taa1]

P I IR
F=AAC == F = AT

i»)

IITCTINT T 1O

cIrcotT
ENEAWS I 2Y
T

(SR i

7 Cto

p)

+7

oLy

oo+ o
t/\JL)_L CIUTToS

=

mamh

1 5xz
Tty
"t s
Ty

moamihe o~

TTr

Nt o~
orrcr o

+ 1 =

n o

R
PEE

I CTno T T

o T

cOoOT

£ 117

CIT

A\

CIT

+h
TIt

1Tt

Ny
Oy (S S A= sy e 133

a sz

SN

roao okl 11
=]

K

L
NPT

o 2 ot
e s ey

TILT

o

wh

S S e e

olra L L

3

WITO O

(QEN

£ o+

n o

PR
t—/\JO.Ll—.L\JLlO A\ -

anAa +h EN
[Srsavs

o
=}
Wk

P N S I

o
=}

o £ Daoarne
O

ITIOTNS

17

+h
TIt

+r
T

-

TIT
akh 11

TTT

ITCaoacCcI Vv

T

A -

i T

+

N

rm

o
It

+
T

A 4+ 1 a5x7z meams
T Tty ftt

"t s

oy

1Atz A A A e
Tt T

=

C T

WITO O

o2 A

T

CIT

T

JoT Tyt
£24 117

b

n

+h

MmN

nt Do

Dy
T

ER WAL RN R 2o +h
OO0y oM pPOTITCIn TITL

a sz

I [SASR R Ie R wy

[ E 2 111 S R - o

o TOUTTT T

T

S S e e

ot 2

n
cCTOTTr~

N

n

a1l o
[eaCEwye]

BrrclrantE  +

T OT CIT IO

CTOTT

cO

PO SOTITCO

z

ma
IO T Oy CTT

Y

SN

alh 11

Camma + +

£V £ +1h
OT

£2 £+ o

Th

olra L T OoCT oll

CITC CUILI T C CTT

TITCTINo &

T C— T T CIt
akh 11

nao e

Dernagrtrmant ok =N AW R N “E T N 2 Camma oo g

+ 1

A\

T oappoTIrcTo Oy I Ot oo T OTIT T

[ i Y & gm mpm my

WITO

CIIC— Do POl CIicITC

A\

o~ o P

o
=}

o 2 n

ISR TN W
cTO—o TS

IS U R -C L2 T I-NE N~ —)

Rt
apppULITC

maoamiha
aas T

1 o5z

LAy

o CITUTT .

T O~ CTITLT O

AP UL oUdTITC oI OUTT

T

Members of the Committee

shall be appointed as follows

Two members shall be appointed by the President Pro Tempore

1.
of the Senate and shall be mechanical journeymen with five

(3)

.
14

actual experience in mechanical work as journeymen

years'

Two members shall be appointed by the Speaker of the House

2.
of Representatives and shall be mechanical contractors with five

(3)

and

.
4

actual experience in mechanical work as contractors

years'

One member shall be a lay member appointed by the

3.

Commissioner—of Health Construction Industries Commission.

the person serving in this position on January 1, 2001,

Provided,
may elect to continue to serve until the end of the term of office

and until a successor has been appointed and qualified.

+heas
{5 e o s s

pamt 5 1
_Yc()-J_O [Eeyaw s | A A A W e

S A

o o

(D)

\

£ + .

rm o
C T TIMNoS O

14 £
TTOTCTE |\ N S E W) wy

2N

alh 11

7

W

[ S

[ Y & pu mpn

Page 34

H. B. NO. 1319

ENR.



C. Any vacancy on the Committee shall be filled for the
unexpired term within thirty (30) days in the manner in which that
position was originally filled. Members may be removed for

misconduct, 4rmeempeterey incompetence, or neglect of duty.

&~ D. A majority of the Committee shall constitute a quorum for
the transaction of business, and the Committee shall elect a
chatrman chalir from its number. Each member shall receive travel
expenses in accordance with the provisions of the State Travel
Reimbursement Act. The Committee shall meet at least quarterly to
conduct examinations, and special meetings may be called by the
ehairman chair or the Ceommissionerof Health Commission.

H+- E. The Committee shall:

1. Assist and advise the Beard Commission on all matters
pertaining to the formation of rules amd—regutatiens pursuant to the
provisions of the Mechanical Licensing Act;

2. Assist and advise the Bepartment Commission on the
examinations for applicants for licenses as a mechanical contractor
or journeyman and on all matters relating to the licensing of
mechanical contractors and mechanical journeymen and the registering
of mechanical apprentices; and

3. Assist and advise the Beard—er Pepartment Commission in such

other matters as 4s requested thereby.

SECTION 53. AMENDATORY 59 0.S5. 1991, Section 1850.5, as
last amended by Section 11, Chapter 293, 0.S.L. 1994 (59 0.S. Supp.
1999, Section 1850.5), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1850.5 The Bepartment Construction Industries
Commission shall have the power and duty to:

1. Issue, renew, suspend, revoke, modify or deny licenses to
engage 1in mechanical work pursuant to the Mechanical Licensing Act;

2. Register apprentices;

3. Enter upon public and private property for the purpose of
inspecting workers' licenses and mechanical work for compliance with
the provisions of the Mechanical Licensing Act and of the rules arnd
regutations of the Beard Commission promulgated pursuant thereto;

4. Employ personnel to conduct investigations and inspections;

5. Enforce the standards and rules and—regultatiens promulgated
pursuant to the Mechanical Licensing Act;

6. Reprimand or place on probation, or both, any holder of a
license or registration pursuant to the Mechanical Licensing Act;

7. Investigate complaints and hold hearings;

8. Initiate disciplinary proceedings, request prosecution of
and initiate injunctive proceedings against any person who violates
any of the provisions of £his—aet the Mechanical Licensing Act or
any rule promulgated pursuant fe—this—aet thereto;

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 35



9. Establish and levy administrative fines against any person
who violates any of the provisions of £his—aet the Mechanical
Licensing Act or any rule promulgated pursuant te—this—aet thereto;

10. Conduct investigations into the qualifications of
applicants for licensure and registration on the request of the

Bepartment Commission;

11. Develop and administer the examinations approved by the
Committee of Mechanical Examiners for applicants for licenses as a
mechanical contractor or journeyman; and

12. Exercise all incidental powers as necessary and proper to
implement and enforce the provisions of the Mechanical Licensing Act
and the rules and—regutatiens—oefthe Boeard promulgated pursuant
thereto.

SECTION 54. AMENDATORY 59 0.S5. 1991, Section 1850.7, 1is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1850.7 After—Janvary—++—3+988+—ne No person,—en—behats
of—himself or of o meechanieal—Ffirm shall engage or offer to engage
in, by advertisement or otherwise, any mechanical work as a
journeyman or contractor who does not possess a valid and
appropriate license from the Bepartment Construction Industries
Commission. No business entity shall act as a mechanical firm
unless a contractor is associated with and responsible for all
mechanical work of such entity.

SECTION 55. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1850.8, as
last amended by Section 11, Chapter 405, 0.S.L. 1999 (59 0.S. Supp.
1999, Section 1850.8), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1850.8 A. Execept—as—autherizedby—thePprovisions—of

a1l ot n D £ +1h2a o ot n + 1 Q4 o+ D riEman £ I~ T1+1 The
ool ot T TTIToOT o O Ccirt o oot TtITOTty crric—ocaoctc J_/\_,t/uJ_ (553111 oy 5 51 R i S i A Y & i Sy 8

Construction Industries Commission shall issue a license as a
mechanical journeyman or mechanical contractor to any person who:

1. Has been certified by the Committee of Mechanical Examiners
as having successfully passed the appropriate examination; and

2. Has paid the license fee and has otherwise complied with the
provisions of the Mechanical Licensing Act. The license fees shall
be annually as follows:

a. mechanical contractor Fifty Dollars ($50.00),

b. mechanical journeyman Twenty-five Dollars ($25.00),

c. apprentice registration Fifteen Dollars ($15.00), and

d. apprentice registration renewal Fifteen Dollars
($15.00) .

B. All licenses shall be nontransferable. ©No license shall be
issued for longer than one (1) year and all licenses shall expire on
June 30 of each year. Licenses may be renewed upon application and
payment of the required fees and payment of any penalty for late
renewal, as shall be established by the Beard Commission. Licenses,
issued without state examination, that have not been renewed by June

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 36



30 of the year following expiration, shall not be renewed until the
applicant passes the appropriate examination. Persons who are
licensed under #£his—aet the Mechanical Licensing Act may have their
license placed on inactive status by paying the annual renewal fee
and eliminating the bonding and insurance requirements. No late fee
shall be charged to renew a license which expired while the
applicant was in military service if application is made within one
(1) year of discharge from the military service.

C. The Bepartmernt Commission is authorized to establish—upen
approvat—by—the—State Board—eof Healths and issue, subject to the
provisions of the Mechanical Licensing Act, limited licenses in each
area of mechanical work based on the experience, ability,
examination scores and the education of the applicant. The limited
licenses shall authorize the licensee to engage in only those
activities and within the limits specified in the license.

SECTION 56. AMENDATORY 59 0.S5. 1991, Section 1850.9, as
amended by Section 13, Chapter 405, 0.S.L. 1999 (59 0.S. Supp. 1999,
Section 1850.9), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1850.9 A. The Statebepartment—oefHealth Construction

Industries Commission, upon proper application and payment of an
apprentice registration fee, shall register as a mechanical
apprentice and issue a certificate of such registration to any
person who furnishes satisfactory proof to the Bepartment Commission
that the applicant is:

1. Sixteen (16) years of age or older; and

2. Enrolled in a school or training course for mechanical
apprentices recognized by the Bepartmernt Commission, or has arranged
for employment as a mechanical apprentice with a licensed mechanical
contractor.

B. Apprentice registration certificates shall expire one (1)
year after date of registration, at which time the apprentice may
reregister and receive, upon payment of the apprentice registration
renewal fee, a renewal certificate.

SECTION 57. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1850.13, as
amended by Section 9, Chapter 236, 0.S.L. 1993 (59 0.S. Supp. 1999,
Section 1850.13), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1850.13 There is hereby created in the State Treasury a
revolving fund for the Sklchema—State DPepartmentof Health
Construction Industries Commission, to be designated the "Oklahoma
Mechanical Licensing Revolving Fund". The fund shall be a
continuing fund, not subject to fiscal year limitations, and shall
consist of all monies received by the Bepartment Commission pursuant
to the Mechanical Licensing Act, including administrative fines
authorized by Section & 1850.11 of this aet title. All monies
accruing to the credit of said fund are hereby appropriated and may
be budgeted and expended by the bPepartment Commission for the
purpose of implementing the Mechanical Licensing Act. Expenditures
from said fund shall be made upon warrants issued by the State
Treasurer against claims filed as prescribed by law with the
Director of State Finance for approval and payment.

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 37



SECTION 58. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 1850.14, as
amended by Section 3, Chapter 251, 0.S.L. 1993 (59 0.S. Supp. 1999,
Section 1850.14), is amended to read as follows:

Section 1850.14 A. The Bepartment Construction Industries
Commission and the Committee of Mechanical Examiners shall act as
the Mechanical Hearing Board and shall comply with the provisions of
Article II of the Administrative Procedures Act+—Seetion3069—et——seq-

£ Fo—ef—the—oid

M-+ 17 S e o
g [ N Sy G g L TATITCOUITTTE

[ E TN S S
e T T T (2K}

B. The Mechanical Hearing Board may, upon its own motion, and
shall, upon written complaint filed by any person, investigate the
business transactions of any mechanical contractor, mechanical
journeyman, mechanical apprentice or mechanical firm. The
Bepartment Commission shall suspend or revoke or may refuse to issue
or renew any license or registration under the Mechanical Licensing
Act for any of the following:

1. Making a material misstatement in the application for a
license or registration, or the renewal of a license or
registration;

2. ©btain Obtaining any license or registration by false or
fraudulent representation;

3. Loaning or allowing the use of such license by any other
person or illegally using a license;

4. Demonstrating incompetence to act as a mechanical journeyman
or mechanical contractor;

5. Violating any provisions of the Mechanical Licensing Act, or
any rules—regutatiern or order prescribed by the Beard Commission
pursuant to the provisions of the Mechanical Licensing Act; or

6. Willfully failing to perform normal business obligations
without justifiable cause.

C. Any person whose license or registration has been revoked by
the Mechanical Hearing Board may apply for a new license one (1)
year from the date of such revocation.

D. Notwithstanding any other provision of law, a political
subdivision of this state that has adopted a nationally recognized
mechanical code and appointed an inspector pursuant to Section
1850.12 er——Seetion—303+—et—seg+ of this title or pursuant to the
Oklahoma Inspectors Act for such work shall have jurisdiction over
the interpretation of said code and the installation of all
mechanical work done in that political subdivision, subject to the
provisions of the Oklahoma Inspectors Act+—Seetion 103+ etseg—of
Title—50—-eof +the Oklahoma—Statutes. Provided, a state inspector may
work directly with a mechanical contractor, mechanical journeyman,
mechanical apprentice or mechanical firm in such a locality if a
violation of the code creates an immediate threat to life or health.

E. 1In the case of a complaint about, investigation of, or
inspection of any license, registration, permit or mechanical work
in any political subdivision of this state which has not adopted a
nationally recognized mechanical code and appointed an inspector
pursuant to Section 1850.12 er——Seetieon303+—et—-seg+ of this title or

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 38



pursuant to the Oklahoma Inspectors Act for such work, the
Commissioner—of Health Commission shall have Jjurisdiction over such
matters.

F. 1. No individual, business, company, corporation,
association, limited liability company, or other entity subject to
the provisions of Seetion1850-1t—et—seg—of—+this—titte the
Mechanical Licensing Act shall install, modify or alter mechanical
systems in any incorporated area of this state which has not adopted
a nationally recognized mechanical code and appointed an inspector
pursuant to Section 1850.12 er——Seetien303+—et—-seg+ of this title or
pursuant to the Oklahoma Inspectors Act for such work without
providing notice of such mechanical work to the Commissioner—of
Heatth Commission. A notice form for reproduction by an individual
or entity required to make such notice shall be provided by the
Cemmissieoner—of Health Commission upon request.

2. Notice to the coemmissiener—eofHealth Commission pursuant to
this subsection shall not be required for minor repair or
maintenance performed according to the mechanical equipment
manufacturer's instructions or of any petroleum refinery or its
research facilities.

3. Enforcement of this subsection is authorized pursuant to
Seetion—1+850-1t—et—seg—of—+this—+titte the Mechanical Licensing Act,
or under authority granted to the Cemmissieonerof Heatth Commission.

SECTION 59. AMENDATORY Section 13, Chapter 293, 0.S.L.
1994 (59 0.S. Supp. 1999, Section 1850.16), is amended to read as
follows:

Section 1850.16 A. 1. There is hereby created the Oklahoma
State Mechanical Installation Code Variance and Appeals Board. The
Variance and Appeals Board shall hear testimony and shall review
sufficient technical data submitted by an applicant to substantiate
the proposed installation of any material, assembly or manufacturer-
engineered components, equipment or system that is not specifically
prescribed by an appropriate installation code, an industry
consensus standard or fabricated or installed according to
recognized and generally accepted good engineering practices, where
no ordinance or regulation of a governmental subdivision applies.

If it is determined that the evidence submitted is satisfactory
proof of performance for the proposed installation, the Variance and
Appeals Board shall approve such alternative, subject to the
requirements of the appropriate installation code. Applications for
the use of an alternative material or method of construction shall
be submitted in writing to the State Commissionerof Health
Construction Industries Commission for approval prior to use.
Applications shall be accompanied by a filing fee, not to exceed
Fifty Dollars ($50.00), as set by rule of the State Beardeof Heatth
Commission.

2. The Variance and Appeals Board shall also hear appeals from

contractors, licensed by the Seeuvpational Ticensing Serviece—of+the
StateDepartment—oefHeatth Commission, and any person who has

ownership interest in or is in responsible charge of the design of
or work on the installation, who contest the bPepartment's
Commission's interpretation of the state's model mechanical
installation code as applied to a particular installation. Such
appeals shall be based on a claim that:

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 39



a. the true intent of the installation code has been
incorrectly interpreted,

b. the provisions of the code do not fully apply, or

c. an equal or better form of installation is proposed.
Such appeals to the Variance and Appeals Board shall be made in
writing to the State Commissieoner—eofHealtth Commission within

fourteen (14) days after a code interpretation or receipt of written
notice of the alleged code violation by the licensed contractor.

B. The Variance and Appeals Board shall consist of the State
Commissironer—ofHeatth—orhis—or—her designated representative of
the Commission and the following members who, except for the State
Fire Marshal or designee, shall be appointed by the Cemmissioner
Commission from a list of names submitted by the professional
organizations of the professions represented on the Board and who
shall serve at the pleasure of the Cemmissiener Commission:

1. Two members shall be appointed from the Committee of
Mechanical Examiners; one shall be a contractor with five (5) years
of experience and one shall be a journeyman with five (5) years of
experience;

2. One member shall be a registered design professional who is
a registered architect with at least ten (10) years of experience,
five (5) of which shall have been in responsible charge of work;

3. One member shall be a registered design professional with at
least ten (10) years of structural engineering or architectural
experience, five (5) of which shall have been in responsible charge
of work;

4. One member shall be a registered design professional with
mechanical or plumbing engineering experience; provided, such member
shall have at least ten (10) years of experience, five (5) of which
shall have been in responsible charge of work;

5. One member shall be a registered design professional with
electrical engineering experience; provided, such member shall have
at least ten (10) years of experience, five (5) of which shall have
been in responsible charge of work; and

6. One member shall be the State Fire Marshal or a designee of
the State Fire Marshal.

Any member serving on the Board on January 1, 2001, may continue
to serve on the Board until a replacement is appointed by the
Commission.

C. Members, except the ECommissieoner designee of the Commission
and the State Fire Marshal, +the Commissieoner's and State Fire
Marshal's or the designated representatives representative of the
State Fire Marshal, and employees of the Bepartment Commission,
shall be reimbursed for travel expenses pursuant to the State Travel
Reimbursement Act+—Seetion 5001 et seg—eof Fitle 74 of the Oklahoma
Statuytes+ from the revolving fund created pursuant to Section
1850.13 of Title 59 of the Oklahoma Statutes.

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 40



D. The Variance and Appeals Board shall meet after the
Commissioner Commission receives proper application for a variance,
accompanied by the filing fee, or proper notice of an appeal, as
provided in subsection A of this section.

E. The State Commissioner—of Health,—or the Commissioner's
designated representative of the Commission, shall serve as chair of
the Variance and Appeals Board. A majority of the members of the
Variance and Appeals Board shall constitute a quorum for the
transaction of the business of the Board.

SECTION 60. AMENDATORY Section 14, Chapter 405, 0.S.L.
1999 (59 0.S. Supp. 1999, Section 1860), is amended to read as
follows:

Section 1860. A. The State Pepartment—efHealth Construction

Industries Commission shall offer examinations for temporary
journeyman plumber, temporary journeyman electrician, and temporary
mechanical journeyman at least once every thirty (30) days following
a declaration by the Governor of this state of a state of emergency
in response to a disaster involving the destruction of dwelling
units and shall continue do so for at least six (6) months following
the declaration.

B. The temporary journeyman examinations shall be neither less
stringent nor more stringent than examinations for regular
journeyman licenses in this state.

C. No applicant for any temporary journeyman license shall be
allowed more than one opportunity to take the temporary journeyman
examination.

D. No temporary journeyman license shall be extended or
renewed. Upon expiration of the temporary journeyman license, the
license holder shall be ineligible to work as a journeyman in this
state unless qualified under other provisions of law.

SECTION o61. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 1991, Section 858-703, as
last amended by Section 1, Chapter 144, 0.S.L. 1994 (59 0.S. Supp.
1999, Section 858-703), is amended to read as follows:

Section 858-703. As used in the Oklahoma Certified Real Estate
Appraisers Act:

1. "Appraisal" or "real estate appraisal" means an analysis,
opinion or conclusion relating to the nature, quality, value or
utility of specified interests in, or aspects of, identified real
estate other than oil, gas, coal, water, and all other energy and
nonfuel mineral and elements or the value of underground space to be
used for storage of commodities or for the disposal of waste unless
they are appraised as part of a federally related transaction
covered by the Financial Institutions Reform, Recovery, and
Enforcement Act of 1989. An appraisal may be classified by subject
matter into either a valuation or an analysis. A "valuation" is an
estimate of the value of real estate or real property. An
"analysis" 1is a study of real estate or real property other than
estimating value.

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 41



2. "Appraisal report" means any written communication of an
appraisal.

3. "Appraisal Subcommittee" means the subcommittee created by
Title XI of the Financial Institutions Reform, Recovery, and
Enforcement Act of 1989.

4. "Appraiser Qualifications Board" (AQB) means the independent
board appointed by the Board of Trustees of the Appraisal
Foundation. The AQB establishes educational, experience, and
examination criteria for appraisers. Title XI of the Financial
Institutions Reform, Recovery, and Enforcement Act (FIRREA) of 1989
requires that state certified appraisers must meet the minimum
qualifications set by the AQB.

5. "Board" means the Real Estate Appraisal Board established
pursuant to the provisions of the Oklahoma Certified Real Estate
Appraisers Act.

6. "Certification" shall refer to either a state licensed
appraiser trainee, a state certified residential appraiser or a
state certified general appraiser.

7. "Certified appraisal or certified appraisal report" means an
appraisal or appraisal report given or signed and certified as such
by a state licensed trainee, state certified residential or state
certified general real estate appraiser. When identifying an
appraisal or appraisal report as "certified", the state licensed
trainee, state certified residential or state certified general real
estate appraiser must indicate which type of certification is held.
A certified appraisal or appraisal report represents to the public
that it meets the appraisal standards defined in the Oklahoma
Certified Real Estate Appraisers Act.

8. "Chairperson" means the chairperson of the Real Estate
Appraisal Board.

9. "Department" means the Oklahoma Insurance Department.

10. "Real estate" means an identified parcel or tract of land,
including improvements, if any.

11. "Real property" means one or more defined interests,
benefits, and rights inherent in the ownership of real estate.

12. "State licensed trainee, state certified residential or
state certified general real estate appraiser" means a person who
develops and communicates real estate appraisals and who holds a
current, valid certificate issued to such person for either general
or residential real estate pursuant to provisions of the Oklahoma
Certified Real Estate Appraisers Act.

13. "Appraisal assignment" means an engagement for which an
appraiser is employed or retained to act, or would be perceived by
third parties or the public as acting, as a disinterested third
party in rendering an unbiased analysis, opinion, or conclusion
relating to the nature, quality, value, or utility of specified
interests in, or aspects of, identified real estate.

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 42



14. "Specialized services" means those appraisal services which
do not fall within the definition of appraisal assignment. The term
"specialized services" may include valuation work and analysis work.
Regardless of the intention of the client or employer, if the
appraiser would be perceived by third parties or the public as
acting as a disinterested third party in rendering an unbiased
analysis, opinion or conclusion, the work is classified as an
appraisal assignment and not "specialized services".

15. “State licensed appraiser” means a “state licensed trainee”
or a "state licensed appraiser trainee". Where in the statutes the
term “state licensed appraiser” is used, it shall mean a state
licensed trainee or state licensed appraiser trainee.

SECTION 62. AMENDATORY 74 O0.S. 1991, Section 324.11la, as
last amended by Section 1, Chapter 42, O0.S.L. 1997 (74 0.S. Supp.
1999, Section 324.11la), is amended to read as follows:

Section 324.11la A. Any person, partnership, corporation,
organization, the state, or city, town, county, or other subdivision
of this state, owning a building or structure used as a hospital,
church, theater, hotel, motel, apartment house or other multifamily
or single-family residential rental property, rooming house,
dormitory, rest home, nursing home, day nursery, convalescent home,
auditorium, or child care institution, existing or constructed in
the State of Oklahoma, shall install in such building or structure a
smoke detector or detectors in accordance with the nationally
recognized codes, standards, or practices adopted by the State Fire
Marshal Commission to safeguard life and property from the hazards
of smoke and fire.

B. Fer—thepurpose—of As used in this section, +the—term “smoke
detector” means a device which is:

1. Designed to detect visible or invisible products of
combustion;

2. Designed with an alarm audible to the rooms it serves;

3. Powered by either battery, alternating current, or other

power source; and

4. Tested and listed for use as a smoke detector by a
recognized testing laboratory.

C. Any person, partnership, corporation, state, municipality,
county, or other subdivision of this state who is a lessor of a
residential rental property shall explain to the lessee or tenant
the method of testing the smoke detector to ensure that it is in
working order. The responsibility for checking a smoke detector to
find out whether such detector is in working order is with the
tenant or lessee leasing or renting a one- or two-family dwelling,
including an apartment in each apartment house, and not with the
person, partnership, corporation, state, municipality, county, or
other subdivision of this state who is a lessor of the residential
rental property to the lessee or tenant.

D. BeginningNeovember—15—31997——=ad++ All new construction or
remodeling of residential dwelllngs which require a building permit

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 43



shall include the installment of smoke detectors or the electrical
wiring necessary for the installment of electrical smoke detectors.

E. Any person who violates any provision ef—subseetien—2A of
this section or any person who tampers with, removes, destroys,
disconnects or removes power from any installed smoke detector,
except in the course of inspection, maintenance or replacement of
the detector, upon conviction, is guilty of a misdemeanor and may be
fined not less than Fifty Dollars ($50.00) nor more than One Hundred
Dollars ($100.00).

F. ©Nothing in this section shall be construed to allow any
political subdivision in this state to enact laws imposing upon
owners of any dwelling described in subsection A of this section a
greater duty with regard to the installation, testing, repair and
replacement of smoke detectors than is required by this section.

G. The State Fire Marshal Commission shall prescribe, adopt,
and promulgate the rules necessary to effectuate the provisions of
this section which shall include a practical time table for
compliance with the provisions of this act.

H. Municipalities may enact ordinances in order to enforce the
rules of the State Fire Marshal Commission as provided by this
section.

SECTION 63. Sections 1 through 5 of this act shall become
effective July 1, 2000.

SECTION 64. Sections 6 through 60 of this act shall become
effective January 1, 2001.

SECTION 65. Sections 61 and 62 of this act shall become
effective November 1, 2000.

SECTION 66. It being immediately necessary for the preservation
of the public peace, health and safety, an emergency is hereby
declared to exist, by reason whereof this act shall take effect and
be in full force from and after its passage and approval.

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 44



Passed the House of Representatives the 26th day of May, 2000.

Speaker of the House of
Representatives

Passed the Senate the 26th day of May, 2000.

President of the Senate

ENR. H. B. NO. 1319 Page 45



	Apprentice Registration
	Fee 15.00

